CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-372107

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS PASSENGER VEHICLES
BID OPENING: MARCH 17, 2011

Bid Item

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl

City

Cutter Ford, Inc.

Honolulu Ford, Inc.

Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

Servco Pacific Inc.
dba Servco Auto Leeward

ITEM 1: Two (2)
Compact Sedans

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price Total

Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In
Hybrid Electric Vehicle

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell
Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 3
Other Alternative Fuel
Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




2011 Ford Fiesta

$ 18,554.69 | $ 37,109.38
Alternate 5 City MPG: 29
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,000.00
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 49,109.380
2011 Dodge Caliber 2012 Ford Focus "S" P3E 2011 Toyota Corolla
$ 20,669.10 | $ 41,338.20 $ 15,937.51 | $ 31,875.02 $ 18,638.74 | $ 37,277.48
Alternate 6 City MPG: 23 City MPG: N/A City MPG: 26
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: 15130.43478 Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: | $ 13,384.62
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 56,468.635 Bid : N/A Bid : $ 50,662.095
Bid Item SRRl .]_eep BEER FE Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. ST FEEILB e,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 2: Three (3)
Mid-Size Sedans L L L L o
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Avenger 2011 Ford Fusion
$ 24,699.46 | $ 74,098.38 | $ 22,108.48 | $ 66,325.44
City MPG: 14|City MPG: 14
Alternate 3 . .
Other Alternative Fuel |C°StOf Fuel: 13 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 241 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles Total Fuel Cost: | $  30,985.71 |Total Fuel Cost: |$  30,985.71
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 105,084.094 |Bid : $ 97,311.154




2011 Ford Fusion Hybrid 2011 Ford Fusion Hybrid - POL 2011 Toyota Prius |
$ 28,899.06 | $ 86,697.18 | $ 29,234.83 | $ 87,704.49 $ 26,783.88 (% 80,351.64
City MPG: 41|City MPG: 41 City MPG: 51
. Alterngte 4 . NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Hybrid Electric Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,731.71 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 12,731.71 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 10,235.29
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 99,428.887 |Bid : $100,436.197 Bid : $ 90,586.934
Bid Item Gy Ehms ey J_eep DR (PEET Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SSED PSS I
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 3: Three (3)
Compact SUVs Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Ford Escape
$ 23,729.43 | $ 71,188.29
Alternate 3 City MPG: 19
Other Alternative Fuel NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles Total Fuel Cost: | $ 22,831.58
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 94,019.869
2011 Ford Escape Hybrid 2011 Ford Escape Hybrid - U4k
FWD
$ 32,240.42 | $ 96,721.26 | $ 32,259.96 | $ 96,779.88
Alternate 4 City MPG: 34|City MPG: 34
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 15,352.94 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 15,352.94
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 112,074.201 [Bid: $112,132.821




2011 Ford Escape

$ 22,584.92 | $ 67,754.76
Alternate 5 City MPG: 21
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 24,857.14
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 92,611.903
2011 Jeep Patriot 2011 Ford Escape 2011 Ford Escape XLS FWD - UOC 2011 Toyota RAV4 FWD
Alternate 6 $ 19,10365( $ 57,31095 | $ 22,900.00 | $ 68,700.00 | $ 20,820.17 | $ 62,460.51 $ 2655392 (% 79,661.76
] City MPG: 23|City MPG: 21|City MPG: 21 City MPG: 22
EPA Non-Top
Performers for Euel |COst of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Economy
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 22,695.65 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 24,857.14 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 24,857.14 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 23,727.27
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 80,006.602 |Bid : $ 93,557.143 [Bid : $ 87,317.653 Bid : $ 103,389.033
Bid Item Gl e J_eep Diile [Peel Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SERVED [PECITE M,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 4: Three (3)
SUVs Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Durango 2011 Ford Expedition
$ 31,65653 (% 94,969.59 | $ 33,805.31 | $ 101,415.93
City MPG: 12|City MPG: 13
Alternate 3 .
Other Alternative Fuel |COStofFuel | 3 2.41 |Cost of Fuel. $ 241 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles Total Fuel Cost: | $  36,150.00 |Total Fuel Cost: |$  33,369.23
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 131,119.590 |Bid: $ 134,785.161




2011 Toyota Highlander Hybrid

Vehicles

$ 41,133.03|$% 123,399.09
City MPG: 28
Alternate 4 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NG BID NO BID NG BID NO BID
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 18,642.86
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 142,041.947
2011 Ford Expedition
$ 33,913.22 | $ 101,739.66
Alternate 5 City MPG: 13
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 40,153.85
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 141,893.506
2011 Ford Expedition 2011 Ford Explorer FWD - K7B
$ 33,950.00 | $ 101,850.00 | $ 26,556.30 | $ 79,668.90
Eﬁie&”oaﬁf}i City MPG: 13{city MPG: 17
Performers for IEueI NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID
Econom Total Fuel Cost: | $ 40,153.85 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 30,705.88
y Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 142,003.846 |Bid: $110,374.782
Bid Item G e E; J'eep Beeushe Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SEUED [FEEI I
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 5: Seven (7)
Compact Pick-up
Trucks Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




2011 Dodge Ram 1500
$ 21,776.95|$% 152,438.65
City MPG: 9
Alternate 3
Other Altenative Fuel |COStOf Fuel: |3 241 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Venicles Total Fuel Cost: | $  112,466.67
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 264,905.317
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2011 Ford Ranger R/C 2011 Toyota Te;%\o/r[r;a Regular Cab
$ 15,539.90 | $ 108,779.30 $ 20,951.82|$% 146,662.74
Alternate 5 City MPG: 19 City MPG: 19
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
for Fuel Economy
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 64,105.26 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 64,105.26
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 172,884.563 Bid : $ 210,768.003
2011 Dodge Dakaota Ext. Cab 2011 Ford Ranger R/C 2011 Ford Ranger 4X2 SWB - RIA Chevrolet CS15403 Colorado
$ 21,425.12|$ 149,97584 | $ 15,644.61 | $ 109,512.27 | $ 15,816.50 | $ 110,71550 ($ 19,613.00 | $ 137,291.00
Alternate 6 City MPG: 15|City MPG: 19|City MPG: 19|City MPG: 18
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: 81200| Total Fuel Cost: 64105.26316(Total Fuel Cost: $ 64,105.26 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 67,666.67
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 231,175.840 |Bid: $ 173,617.533 |Bid: $ 174,820.763 |Bid : $ 204,957.667
Bid Item D C e .]_eep DialE PEar Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SR PR LR (I
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 6: Two (2)
Compact Pick-up
Trucks with Ext. Cab o o o o o
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total




Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Dakota
$ 23161.24($ 46,322.48
Alternate 3 g'tthfS: I $ 2 419
Other Alternative Fuel | -9 0" "Ue: : NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles Total Fuel Cost: | $  32,133.33
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 78,455.813
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2011 Ford Ranger S/C
$ 17,179.69 | $ 34,359.38
Alternate 5 City MPG: 19
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 18,315.79
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 52,675.169
2011 Ford Ranger Super Cab 4X2 - Chevrolet Colorado 2WD
2011 Dodge Dakota 2011 Ford Ranger S/C RIE Extended Cab CS15653
Alternate 6 $ 22,197.89 (% 44,395.78 | $ 17,284.40 | $ 34,568.80 | $ 18,079.81 [ $ 36,159.62 $ 22,133.06 (% 44,266.12
i City MPG: 15|City MPG: 19|City MPG: 19 City MPG: 18
EPA Non-Top _ _ _ NO BID .
Performers for Fuel |COst of Fuel: $ 2.90 [Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Econom
y Total Fuel Cost: | $ 23,200.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 18,315.79 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 18,315.79 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 19,333.33
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 67,595.780 |Bid : $ 52,884.589 [Bid: $ 54,475.409 Bid : $ 63,599.453




Bid Item

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl

Cutter Ford, Inc.

Honolulu Ford, Inc.

Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

Servco Pacific Inc.

City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 7: Compact
Pick-up Truck with
4WD and Crew Cab
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad Cab| 2011 Ford F150 4X4 Crew Cab | 2011 Ford F150 4X4 Super Crew - |  Chevrolet Silverado 1500 4X4
WIE Crew Cab
$ 27,807.31 $ 30,198.26 $ 31,301.02 $ 32,285.00
Alternate 3 City MPG: 9|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10|city MPG: N/A
Other Alternative Fuel |cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 NO BID
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 16,066.67 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 14,460.00 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 14,460.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | N/A
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 43,873.977 |Bid: $ 44,658.260 |Bid : $ 45,761.020 |Bid : N/A
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alternate 5
EPA Top Performers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

for Fuel Economy




Chevrolet CS15653 Ext Cab

2011 Chevrolet Colorado Crew

AL Do (R Qs Celb 1500 Colorado Cab 4WD CT15643
Alternate 6 . $ 28,924.59 . $ 20,450.00 . $ 33,089.65
EPA Non-Top City MPG: 14 City MPG: 17|City MPG: 14
Performers for Euel |COSt of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Economy
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,428.57 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 10,235.29 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,428.57
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 41,353.161 Bid : $ 30,685.294 |Bid : $ 45,518.221
Bid Item Gy Ehms ey J_eep DR (PEET Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SSED PRSI
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 8: Six (6) Full-
Size Pickup Trucks
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 2011 Ford F150 4X2 RC 2011 Ford F150 4X2 SWB - FIC | Chevrolet Silverado 1500 4x2  |2°1% Chevrogéfg‘;g;ado Reg Cab
$ 23,850.25|$% 143,101.50 | $ 20,500.88 | $ 123,005.28 | $ 21,00456 | $ 126,027.36 | $ 25,476.00 | $ 152,856.00 | $ 25,847.50|$ 155,085.00
Alternate 3 City MPG: 9|City MPG: 11|City MPG: 11{City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10
Other Alternative Fuel |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 96,400.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 78,872.73 [Total Fuel Cost: $ 78,872.73 |Total Fuel Cost: [ $ 86,760.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 86,760.00
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 239,501.500 |Bid : $ 201,878.007 |Bid: $ 204,900.087 |Bid : $ 239,616.000 |Bid : $ 241,845.000




Alternate 4

Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alternate 5
EPA Top Performers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy
2011 Dodge Ram 1500
$ 2496752 |$% 149,805.12
Alternate 6 City MPG: 14
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: 74571.42857
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 224,376.549
Bid Item SRRl .]_eep BEER FE Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. ST FEEILB e,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 9: Full-Size
Pickup Truck with
Ext. Cab Lo I Lo Lo L
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Vehicles




2011 Dodge Ram 1500 Quad

2011 Ford F150

2011 Ford F150 4X2 Super Cab -

Chevrolet Silverado CC10753 Ext.

2011 Chevrolet Silverado

XIC Cab Extended Cab CC10753
$ 26,358.10 $ 23,765.43 $ 24471.18 $ 26,860.00 $ 29,013.30
Alternate 3 City MPG: 9|City MPG: 11|City MPG: 11|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10
Other Alternative Fuel [Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 (Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 16,066.67 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 13,145.45 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 13,145.45 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 14,460.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 14,460.00
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 42,424.767 |Bid: $ 36,910.885 [Bid: $ 37,616.635 |Bid: $ 41,320.000 |Bid : $ 43,473.300
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2011 Ford F150
$ 23,765.43
Alternate 5 City MPG: 15
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 11,600.00
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 35,365.430
2011 Dodge Ram Quad Cab 1500 2011 Ford F150
$ 27,475.38 $ 23,765.43
Alternate 6 City MPG: 14|City MPG: 15
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 [Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: 12428.57143|Total Fuel Cost: 11600
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 39,903.951 |Bid: $ 35,365.430
Bid Item Gl e J_eep Diile [Peel Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SERVED [FECITE M,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 10: Full-Size
Pickup Truck with
Tool Box o o o o o
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Hybrid Electric Vehicle




Alternate 2

Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
. 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 2011 Ford F150 R/C 2011 Ford F150 4X2 SWB - FIC Chevrolet Silverado 1500 $X2 Extended Cab CC10753
$ 23,921.45 $ 21,016.99 $ 21,945.93 $ 21,267.00 $ 29,733.33
Alternate 3 City MPG: 9|City MPG: 11|City MPG: 11|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10
Other Altehrn?tlve Fuel |cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 16,066.67 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 13,145.45 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 13,145.45 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 14,460.00 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 14,460.00
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 39,988.120 |Bid: $ 34,162.445 [Bid: $ 35,091.385 |Bid : $ 35,727.000 |Bid : $ 44,193.330
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2011 Ford F150 R/C
$ 21,121.70
Alternate 5 City MPG: 15
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 11,600.00
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 32,721.700
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 2011 Ford F150 R/C
$ 25,229.30 $ 21,226.41
Alternate 6 City MPG: 14(City MPG: 15
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,428.57 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 11,600.00
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 37,657.871 |Bid: $ 32,826.410
Bid Item G SMyEEr JEED DenlE (FEar Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SIERED PRI (6.

City

dba Servco Auto Leeward




ITEM 11: Three (3)
Full-Size Pickup

Trucks with Lift Gates o o o o o
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD
2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A Reg. Cab CC20903
$ 27,140.30 | $ 81,420.90 | $ 26,956.91 |$ 80,870.73 $ 3543347 |$% 106,300.41
Alternate 3 City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A
Other Alternative Fuel NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : N/A Bid : N/A Bid : N/A
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Item Gl e J_eep Diile [Peer Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. SERVED [FECITE M,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 12: Two (2)
4AWD Full-Size
Pickup Trucks L L . L o
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total




Alternate 1

Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 2011 Ford F150 2011 Ford F150 4X4 SWB - FIE | Chevrolet Silverado Ck10753 |2011 Chevrolet Silverado Reg Cab
4WD Ck10703
$ 2539161 |% 50,783.22 | $ 29,325.64 | $ 58,651.28 | $ 2469948 [$ 49,398.96 | $ 31,612.00 | $ 63,224.00 [ $ 29,474.03 | $ 58,948.06
Alternate 3 City MPG: 9|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10|City MPG: 10
Other Altehrn?tlve Fuel |cost of Fuel: | $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 |Cost of Fuel: | $ 2.41 |Costof Fuel: | $ 2.41
Vehicles
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 32,133.33 |Total Fuel Cost: | $ 28,920.00 [Total Fuel Cost: $ 28,920.00 [Total Fuel Cost: | $ 28,920.00 |Total Fuel Cost: 28920
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 82,916.553 |Bid: $ 87,571.280 |Bid : $ 78,318.960 [Bid : $ 92,144.000 |Bid : $ 87,868.060
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2011 Ford F150
$ 29,325.64 | $ 58,651.28
Alternate 5 City MPG: 15
EPA Top Performers NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
for Fuel Economy Total Fuel Cost: 23200
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 81,851.280
2011 Dodge Ram 1500 2011 Ford F150
$ 2650784 (% 53,015.68 | $ 29,325.64 | $ 58,651.28
Alternate 6 City MPG: 13|City MPG: 15
EPA Non-Top Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 26,769.23 |Total Fuel Cost: 23200
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 79,784.911 |Bid: $ 81,851.280




Bid Item

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl

Cutter Ford, Inc.

Honolulu Ford, Inc.

Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc.

Servco Pacific Inc.

City dba Servco Auto Leeward
ITEM 13: Passenger
Van
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
Alternate 1
Electric or Plug-In NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hybrid Electric Vehicle
Alternate 2
Hydrogen or Fuel Cell NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles
2011 Dodge Gr. Caravan
$ 27,290.04
Alternate 3 g'tthfE : I $ 5 4112
Other Alternative Fuel |5t 9" FUet : NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Vehicles Total Fuel Cost: | $ 12,050.00
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 39,340.040
Alternate 4
Hybrid Electric Vehicles NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Alternate 5
EPA Top Performers NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

for Fuel Economy




2011 Toyota Sienna FWD

$ 29,062.82
Alternate 6 City MPG: 18
EPA Non-Top NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
Performers for Fuel
Economy Total Fuel Cost: | $ 9,666.67
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 38,729.487
Bid Item Cutter Chrysler .].eep Dodge Pearl Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. Servco Pacific Inc.
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
2011 Ford Econoline Cargo Crew Chevrolet CG33405 Express 2011 Chevrolet Express Cargo
20N, e I Seal) CEnge VT Van E350 E3E Cargo Van CG33405
$ 26,427.72 $ 26,941.02 $ 31,988.00 $ 31,049.67
) City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A City MPG: N/A
ITEM 14: Cargo Van NO BID Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A Cost of Fuel: N/A
Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A Total Fuel Cost: N/A
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : N/A Bid : N/A Bid : N/A Bid : N/A
Bid Item SRRl .]_eep BEER FE Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. ST FEEILB e,
City dba Servco Auto Leeward
Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
2011 Ford Transit Connect 2011 Ford Transit Connect
. $ 23,166.21 $ 22,883.84
ITEM 15: High- City MPG: 21|City MPG: 21
Ceiling Cargo Van NO BID Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 NO BID NO BID
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 8,285.71 |Total Fuel Cost: $ 8,285.71
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 31,451,924 |Bid : $ 31,169.554




