
CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-370803
DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS WORK VEHICLES 
BID OPENING: April 13, 2011

Bid Item

Item No. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

 $   31,412.55  $             62,825.10  $   27,416.17  $          54,832.34  $         27,158.89  $            54,317.78  $            28,044.88  $            56,089.76  $     34,189.00  $         68,378.00  $         33,637.23  $    67,274.46 

 $   28,364.38  $             28,364.38  $   25,366.63  $          25,366.63  $         25,584.03  $            25,584.03  $            25,483.41  $            25,483.41  $     30,023.00  $         30,023.00  $         30,379.12  $    30,379.12 

 $   30,908.88  $             30,908.88  $   28,180.83  $          28,180.83  $         27,845.03  $            27,845.03  $            27,973.01  $            27,973.01  $     33,048.00  $         33,048.00  $         33,224.59  $    33,224.59 

 $   31,609.41  $             31,609.41  $   28,160.93  $          28,160.93  $         27,981.93  $            27,981.93  $            28,839.68  $            28,839.68  $     32,992.00  $         32,992.00  $         34,063.74  $    34,063.74 

 $   31,593.70  $             31,593.70  $   32,740.05  $          32,740.05  $         30,581.93  $            30,581.93  $            31,145.93  $            31,145.93  $     36,766.00  $         36,766.00  $         37,941.39  $    37,941.39 

 $   37,896.31  $             37,896.31  $   34,360.60  $          34,360.60  $         33,187.16  $            33,187.16  $            35,148.03  $            35,148.03  $     37,480.00  $         37,480.00  $         38,094.12  $    38,094.12 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

2011 Ford F250 (F2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC 20903 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20903ITEM 6: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 
MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 

TRUCK WITH SERVICE BODY, 
LIFT GATE AND FUEL 

TRANSFER TANK.

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A

2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20903

ITEM 5: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 

MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 
TRUCK WITH CREW CAB AND 

LIFT GATE.

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 Crew Cab 4X2 - W2A 2011 Ford F250 (W2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC 20943 
C/Cab

2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20943

2011 Ford F250 (F2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC20903 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20903

ITEM 4: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 

MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 
TRUCK WITH LIFT GATE AND 

TOOL BOX.

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A 2011 Ford F250 (F2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC20903

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A

ITEM 2: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 

MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 
TRUCK WITH TOOL BOX.

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A 2011 Ford F250 (F2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC20903 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20903

ITEM 3: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 

MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 
TRUCK WITH TOOL BOX AND 

LIGHT BAR.

ITEM 1: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF TWO (2) 

MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 
TRUCK WITH LIFT GATE.

HT&T Hawaii LLC
dba HT&T Truck Center

2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC209032011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC209032011 Ford F250 (F2A)

Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. Servco Pacific Inc. 
dba Servco Auto Leeward

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl 
City Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Interpacific Motors Inc.

dba Orchid isle Auto Center



CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-370803
DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS WORK VEHICLES 
BID OPENING: April 13, 2011

Bid Item

Item No. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

HT&T Hawaii LLC
dba HT&T Truck Center Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. Servco Pacific Inc. 

dba Servco Auto Leeward
Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl 

City Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Interpacific Motors Inc.
dba Orchid isle Auto Center

 $   36,172.76  $             72,345.52  $   36,192.28  $          72,384.56  $         30,950.52  $            61,901.04  $            32,059.48  $            64,118.96  $     36,238.00  $         72,476.00  $         38,181.80  $    76,363.60 

 $   44,638.72  $             44,638.72  $   42,689.96  $          42,689.96  $         42,023.08  $            42,023.08  $            42,280.34  $            42,280.34  $     46,940.00  $         46,940.00  $         48,992.39  $    48,992.39 

 $   55,663.85  $           111,327.70  $   57,591.89  $        115,183.78  $         57,132.29  $          114,264.58  $            61,600.20  $          123,200.40  $     70,650.00  $       141,300.00  $         66,698.64  $  133,397.28 

 $   44,659.79  $          44,659.79  $            56,057.28  $      56,057.28  $            47,970.99  $            47,970.99  $         44,770.41  $    44,770.41 

 No Bid 

 No Bid  No Bid  No Bid 

 No Bid 

 No Bid 

CANCELED
ITEM 11: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF THREE (3) 
15,000 GVWR CAB AND 

CHASSIS WITH CREW CAB, 
SERVICE BODY AND CANOPY. 

2012 Isuzu NPRHD GAS 2011 Ford 350 Cutaway (E4F) 2011 Chevrolet Express Cutaway 
CG23503ITEM 10: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 14,500 
GVWR CAB AND CHASSIS 

WITH ALUMINUM VAN BODY

2011 Ford E450 Cutaway Van

2011 Ford F350 CC (F3H) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CK31003 
4X4

2011 Chevrolet Silverado 3500HD 
CK30903

ITEM 9: FURNISHING AND 
DELIVERY OF TWO (2) 11,500 

GVWR CAB AND CHASSIS 
WITH 4WD, DRW, MATERIAL 
RACK AND SERVICE BODY

2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 4X4 Chassis - F3H 
DRW

2011 Ford F350 CC (F3G) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC31003 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 3500HD 
CC30903ITEM 8: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF ONE (1) 
MINIMUM 12,400 LB. GVWR 

CAB AND CHASSIS WITH FLAT 
BED WITH STAKE SIDES AND 

LIFTGATE.

2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 4X2 Chassis  - F3G 
DRW

2011 Ford F250 (F2A) 2011 or 2012 Chevrolet CC20903 2011 Chevrolet Silverado 2500HD 
CC20903ITEM 7: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF TWO (2) 
MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR 

TRUCK WITH FLAT BED WITH 
STAKE SIDES AND LIFTGATE.

2011 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 4X2 - F2A



CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-370803
DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS WORK VEHICLES 
BID OPENING: April 13, 2011

Bid Item

Item No. Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total

HT&T Hawaii LLC
dba HT&T Truck Center Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc. Servco Pacific Inc. 

dba Servco Auto Leeward
Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl 

City Cutter Ford, Inc. Honolulu Ford, Inc. Interpacific Motors Inc.
dba Orchid isle Auto Center

CANCELED
ITEM 12: FURNISHING AND 

DELIVERY OF FOUR (4) 15,000 
GVWR CAB AND CHASSIS 

WITH 4WD, DRW, MATERIAL 
RACK AND SERVICE BODY


