
Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-HFD-364312
Project: Various Emergency Response Ready Vehicles to the Honolulu Fire Department
Contact: Glen Teramoto
Bid Opening: 4/18/2011

Honlulu

Ford

Rainbow

Chevrolet Inc.

Cutter Ford,

Inc

Orchid Isle

Auto Center

Company

Cutter Chrysler

Jeep Dodge

Pearl City

Servco Pacific

Inc. dba Servco

Auto Leeward

Item no. 1 $138,589.28 NO BID $133,943.20 $134,479.72 NO BID NO BID

Item no. 2 $52,034.53 $55,431.00 $51,254.43 $51,793.26 $50,243.95 $60,049.00

Item no. 3 $59,225.40 $64,044.00 $63,367.52 $63,908.41 NO BID $69,201.70
Item no. 3

Total

Evaluated

Bid Price $97,407.22 N/A N/A N/A NO BID $107,383.52

Item no. 4 NO BID $58,568.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $43,973.80
Item no. 4

Total

Evaluated

Bid Price N/A $69,068.00 N/A N/A N/A $51,473.80


