Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-DTS-268404A
Project: Furnishing and Delivery of Parts and Equipment to Refurbish and Re-power Buses
to the Department of Transportation Services

City

and County of Honolulu

Bid Opening: 10/5/10

* NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.

All bids are subject to evaluation.
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ENGINEERED MACHINED MATT'S TRANSMISSION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
PRODUCTS INC. GRUGLLE HONOLUEUFORD, NG REPAIR INC. CANADA
Item
No. Description Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
GROUPI
EMP Mini-Hybrid Electric Fan
System
1 [|Part No.: 2020022333AA02 30 $15,480.00 $464,400.00 $16,875.00 $506,250.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $15,894.08 $479,822 40
2 |Part No.: 2020022333AA03 15 $15,480.00 $232,200.00 $16,875.00 $253,125.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $15,994.08 $239,911.20
3 |Part No.: 2020022333AA04 16 $15,480.00 $247,680.00 $16,875.00 $270,000.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $15,994.08 $255,905.28
4 |Part No.: 2020022333AA05 10 $20,480.00 $204,800.00 $22,375.00 $223,750.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $15,994.08 $159,940.80
5 |Part No.: 2020032085AA03 9 $15,655.00 $140,895.00 $17,050.00 $153,450.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $16,466.95 $148,202.55
6 |Part No.: 2020033297AA07 9 $15,655.00 $140,895.00 $17,050.00 $153,450.00 $0.00 $0.00]| $16,188.79 $145,698.11
Total LumB Sum Groug | iltems 1-6 $1,430i870.00 $1i550i025.00 NO ﬂj NO ﬂ) $1’429i481'34
GROUPII
Allison Electric Drive EP50 ESS 10 $0.00|| $48,751.58 $487,515.80 $0.00
8 Allison Electric Drive EP40 ESS 3 $0.00|| $48,751.58 $146,254.74 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group Il (item 7 & NO BID NO BID NO BID $633,770.54 NO BID
GROUP I
9 Ford 6.0 Long Block $12,034.99 $8,962.23
Less Core Charge $3,000.00 $0.00
Net Bid Price 8 $9,034.99 $72,279.92 $8,962.23 $71,697.84 $0.00 $0.00
10 Ford 7.3 Long Block $9,560.25 $6,510.52
Less Core Charge $3,000.00 $0.00
Net Bid Price 3 $6,560.25 $19,680.75 $6,510.52 $19,531.56 $0.00 $0.00
Total LumB Sum Groug 111 iltem 9 & 10} NO ﬂ) $91IQED.ET $912h29'40 NO ﬂ) NO E
GROUP IV
11 | Ford HD 4R100 Transmission $3,850.15 $2,853.33 $3,500.00
Less Core Charge $1,000.00 $0.00 $1,050.00
Net Bid Price 5 $2,850.15 $14,250.75 $2,853.33 $14,266.65 $2,450.00 $12,250.00 $0.00
12 Ford 5R110W Torqueshift
Transmission $3,561.77 $2,567.61 $3,300.00
Less Core Charge $1,000.00 $0.00 $1,050.00
Net Bid Price 5 $2,561.77 $12,808.85 $2,567.61 $12,838.05 $2,250.00 $11,250.00 $0.00
Total LumB Sum Groug " illems 11-12| NO ﬂ) SZTIDSQ.ED $27i104.70 §23i500.00 NO E




