PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DFM-351611

OPENED: NOVEMBER 8, 2010 (RQM-DFM-1100023)

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of PNEUMATIC

TIRES, for the twelve-month beginning EAST BAY TIRE CO. HAWAIIAN ISLAND NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL PACIFIC TIRE
January 1, 2011 and ending TIRE CO., INC. TIRE OF HAWAII, INC. GROUP
December 31, 2011, to the City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO. UNMOUNTED TIRES
. PASSENGER CARTIRES
1. P225/70R15
Bid Price Unit 140 $76.00 $65.23 NO BID $89.00
Total $10,640.00 $9,132.20 (For ltem Nos. 1 - 8) $12,460.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT Maxtour GOODYEAR INTEGRITY Nexen Roadian HT
GT2257015-1 402392436 Premier 100S
Stock or Import: Stock S Stk
2. P225/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 60 $80.00 $80.00 $99.00
Total $4,800.00 $4,800.00 $5,940.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT Champiro HANKOOK H724 Kumho Solas KR21
GT22575R15HY2 1011009
Stock or Import: Stock S Stk
3. P235/75R15
Bid Price Unit 20 $92.00 $82.17 $89.00
Total $1,840.00 $1,643.40 $1,780.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT Champiro HANKOOK H724 Nexen Roadian HT 105S
GT23575R15HY2 1010988
Stock S Stk

Stock or Import:
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4, P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price Unit 15 N/B $117.16 No Bid
Total $1,757.40
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR WRL SRA
183783418
Stock or Import: S
5. P225/60R17, for 2009 Chevrolet Uplander,
for Paratransit Department, Oahu Transit
Services, Inc. (OTS) _
Bid Price Unit 80 N/B $84.63 $125.00
Total $6,770.40 $10,000.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR INTEGRITY Kumho KH16
402480477
Stock or Import: S Stk
. TRUCKTIRES
A. TRUCK TIRES, TUBE TYPE ONLY
6. 11.00 X 20, 14 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 30 N/B $392.44 $238.00
Total , $11,773.20 $7,140.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: NANCO MILESTAR HWY Pacifica 16 ply
N21301
Stk

Stock or Import:

S
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B. TRUCK TIRES, TUBELESS
7. 8X14.5,12PR
Bid Price Unit 30 $76.00 $69.07 $88.00
Total $2,280.00 $2,072.10 $2,640.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carlisle Sport Trail NANCO MILESTAR Deestone 12 ply
: 5195061 N225151
Stock or Import: Stock S Stk
8. 7.50X 16,10 PR
Bid Price Unit 50 $99.00 $106.39 $98.00
Total $4,950.00 $5,319.50 $4,900.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Carlisle Sport Trail NANCO MILESTAR Pacstar PS128S
5193021 N22421
Stock or Import: Stock S Stk
9. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 330 $130.00 $103.65 $121.15 $125.00
Total $42,900.00 $34,204.50 $39,979.50 $41,250.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT Savero HT+ GOODYEAR WRL HT Kumho, KL51,] Nexen Roadian HT 119Q
GT24575R16 EHY5 744395900 #2103083
Stock or Imb’ort: Stock S Stock Stk
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10. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G949 RSA, Product code 139082303 or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for OTS emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract regardless
of whether bidding "Stock" or "Import". _
Bid Price Unit 80 $213.50 $263.69 No Bid No Bid
Total $17,080.00 $21,095.20
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G949 RSA GOODYEAR G949
139082303 1390821900
Stock or Import: . Stock S
11. LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, black wall on
both sides of tire.
Bid Price Unit 45 $119.00 $120.69 $108.90 No Bid
Total $5,355.00 $5,431.05 $4,900.50
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO DL6000 GOODYEAR WRL HT Kumho, KL51,
8660001621SE| 744821900 #2103043
Stock S Stock

Stock or Import:
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12. LT215/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on both
sides of tire), all-position, highway, commercial
light truck, all steel casing, designed for
multiple retreading. Goodyear G947 RSS,
Product code 139081305, Armor Max or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
60 tires for OTS emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 720 $207.00 $256.66 No Bid No Bid
Total $149,040.00 $184,795.20
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G947 RSS GOODYEAR G947
' : 139081305 139081305
Stock or import: Stock S
13. LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, :
Bid Price Unit 145 $131.00 $93.18 $112.05 $126.00
Total $18,995.00 _ $13,511.10 $16,247.25 $18,270.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT Savero HT+ GOODYEAR WRL HT Kumho, KL51,| Nexen Roadian HT 10 ply
GT 23585R16EAS2 744725502 #2103063
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
14. 12 X 16.5LT, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 15 $300.00 $250.34 No Bid $215.00
Total $4,500.00 $3,755.10 $3,225.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: STA HWY TL LA4EL AKURET CARGO HWY Deestone 12 ply DS8900
18062
Stock S Stk

Stock or Import:
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15. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114
or comparable, SBR, Trailer service.
Bid Price Unit 30 $175.00 $189.53 $193.72 - $175.00
Total $5,250.00 $5,685.90 $5,811.60 $5,250.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT GT979 GT HANKOOK AH11 Kumho, KL51,{ Double Coin RT500 16 ply
GT21575R175 3000771 #2103043
Stock or Import: Stock | Stock Stk
16. 225/70R19.5, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 130 $175.00 $240.09 $168.59 $189.00
Total $22,750.00 $31,211.70 $21,916.70 $24,570.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT GT279 E6506 HANKOOK AH11 Kumho, RS03,| Double Coin RT500 12 ply
3000868 #2129753
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
17. 255/70R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159
or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Bid Price Unit 50 $228.00 $292.63 $245.08 $239.00
Total $11,400.00 $14,631.50 $12,254.00 $11,950.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Leao F820 HANKOOK AH12 Kumho, RS02,| Double Coin RT500 16 ply
LE2557022.5-1 3001014 #1832413
Stock | Stock Stk

Stock or Import:
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18. 315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile.
Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service (AES) for emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import". _
Bid Price Unit 1,100 Addn. #1 $339.95 $449.06 $386.24 $376.00
Total _ $373,945.00 $493,966.00 $424,864.00 $413,600.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: LEAO A08 GOODYEAR G291L Kumho, MAO1, Double Coin RR200L
LE3158022.5-20 756256420 #1804813 20ply
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
19. 425/65R22.5, 20 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286 or comparable, on/off highway,
SBR, all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 10 $449.00 $564.18 $528.80 $570.00
Total $4,490.00 $5,641.80 $5,288.00 $5,700.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Goodyear G296 GOODYEAR G286A Kumho, MAO2, Double Coin RLB900
756160365 759313200 #2109393 +20ply
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
20. 10R22.5, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 15 $282.00 $279.08 $272.25 $275.00
Total $4,230.00 $4,186.20 $4,083.75 $4,125.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT GT279 DUNLOP SP160 Kumho, RS02, Hercules S205 12 ply
CGTTBR2416 271122072 #1649613
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
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21. 11R22.5-H, 16 PR, Goodyear G395 LHS or
comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Contractor must stock at least 40 tires for
the Division of AES for emergency purchases
during the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 400 Addn. #1 $279.50 $281.68 $301.13 $279.00
Total $111,800.00 $112,672.00 $120,452.00 $111,600.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: LEAO FO1 DUNLOP SP160 Kumho, RS02, Double Coin RT606
LE1122.5-7 271108673 #1634713 + 16ply
Stock or Import: Stock S Stock Stk
lll. LOADER - DOZER, LOADER, PAVER,
TUBELESS, NYLON CORD
22. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 5 $2,800.00 No Bid No Bid $3,580.00
Total $14,000.00 $17,900.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: Firestone -4 Yokohana L4 54503
416193BS
Stock or Import: Stock Stk or Import
23. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price Unit 5 $400.00 No Bid NoBid] = -
Total $2,00000} 1 1 e
TOTAL BID PRICE (ITEM NOS. 22 + 23): $16,000.00




