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For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

GROUP I - LOW FLOOR PARATRANSIT VEHICLES

1 Paratransit Vehicles; low floor type; current model
2010 or latest production; cost to include
installation of communication equipment.
Unit Price: 10 each NO BID $233,769.00 $197,789.00
Total: $2,337,690.00 $1,977,890.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: (wrong pages submitted) Arboc Spirit of Mobility
Year of Production Model: IC LC 2010/2011
Transmission Type and No. of Speeds: 2011 Chevy 6L90, 6 speed
Engine Size and No. of Cylinders: Allison 2200, 5 speeds Chevy Duramax 6.6L,

6.4L, 8 cylinders V-8, diesel (23')

2 Shipping and Delivery of all equipment, based on NO BID $45,000.00
f.o.b. place of destination to C&C of Honolulu, DTS -
OTS, 811 Middle Street, Honolulu, HI  96819, as
per delivery requirements of the Special Provisions.
Cost includes all arrangements to deliver, unload and
place the items in the designated area(s) as
required.  NOTE:  Cost must be an exact amount,
not an estimate.

3 Tax, if applicable. NO BID $95,318.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I, ITEMS 1 - 3: NO BID NOTE:  Submitted on $2,118,208.00
wrong pages - See below *



ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

                                                   DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO.  RFB-DTS-316204
(RQS-DTS-1001376)
OPENED:  JUNE 25, 2010
Page 2

For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

GROUP I  (continued)

Bid Evaluation:  Information availability Not Applicable (No Bid) Applicable Information Available

Delivery in Calendar Days:  120 Days

If unable to meet the above delivery schedule,
submit Proposal Delivery Schedule time frame: NO BID 365 days 220 days 

(based on pilot and 5 buses
every 2 weeks as boat only

GROUP II - FULL BODY (HIGH FLOOR) comes every 2 weeks)
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES

4 Paratransit Vehicles; full body type; current model
2010 or latest production; cost to include
installation of communication equipment.
Unit Price: 38 each $96,896.00 $221,438.00 $108,743.00
Total: $3,682,048.00 $8,414,644.00 $4,132,234.00

(wrong pages submitted)
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: Elkhart Coach ECII IC HC El Dorado National Co. (Enc)
Year of Production Model: 2011 2011 Aerotech 240 - 2011 model
Transmission Type and No. of Speeds: TorqShift Automatic 5-speed Allison 2200, 5 speeds Ford Torqshift, 5 speed
Engine Size and No. of Cylinders: 6.8L, V10 6.4 Liter, 8 cylinders Ford 6.8L, V10
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For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

GROUP II  (continued)

5 Shipping and Delivery of all equipment, based on $225,948.00 Shipping for Groups I $193,800.00
f.o.b. place of destination to C&C of Honolulu, DTS - and II -
OTS, 811 Middle Street, Honolulu, HI  96819, as $456,000.00 *
per delivery requirements of the Special Provisions.
Cost includes all arrangements to deliver, unload and Tax - $528,136.70 *
place the items in the designated area(s) as
required.  NOTE:  Cost must be an exact amount, Total for Groups I and II -
not an estimate. $11,736,470.69 *

6 Tax, if applicable. $162,807.11 $203,842.00
NOTE:  Submitted on

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II, ITEMS 4 - 6: $4,070,803.11 wrong pages * $4,529,876.00

Bid Evaluation - Information Availability: Applicable Information Available Applicable Information Available

Delivery in Calendar Days:  120 days

If unable to meet the above delivery schedule, 120 days after 365 days 320 days
submit Proposal Delivery Schedule time frame: approval of pilot model (based on pilot and 5 buses

every 2 weeks as boat only
comes every 2 weeks)
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For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

PURCHASE OPTIONS FOR PARATRANSIT
VEHICLES

GROUP III - LOW FLOOR PARATRANSIT VEHICLES

7 Paratransit Vehicles; low floor type; current model
2010 or latest production; cost to include
installation of communication equipment.
Unit Price: 10 each NO BID $233,769.00 $197,789.00
Total: $2,337,690.00 $1,977,890.00

(wrong pages submitted)
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: IC LC Arboc Spirit of Mobility
Year of Production Model: 2011 2010/2011
Transmission Type and No. of Speeds: Allison 2200, 5 speeds Chevy 6L90, 6 speed
Engine Size and No. of Cylinders: 6.4L, 8 cylinders Chevy Duramax 6.6L,

V-8, diesel (23')

8 Shipping and Delivery of all equipment, based on NO BID $45,000.00
f.o.b. place of destination to C&C of Honolulu, DTS -
OTS, 811 Middle Street, Honolulu, HI  96819, as
per delivery requirements of the Special Provisions.
Cost includes all arrangements to deliver, unload and
place the items in the designated area(s) as
required.  NOTE:  Cost must be an exact amount,
not an estimate.
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For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

GROUP III  (continued)

9 Tax, if applicable. NO BID $95,318.00
NOTE:  Submitted on

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III, ITEMS 7 - 9: NO BID wrong pages * $2,118,208.00

Bid Evaluation:  Information availability Not Applicable (No Bid) Applicable Information Available

Delivery in Calendar Days:  120 days

If unable to meet the above delivery schedule, NO BID 220 days 
submit Proposal Delivery Schedule time frame: (based on pilot and 5 buses

every 2 weeks as boat only
comes every 2 weeks)

GROUP IV - FULL BODY (HIGH FLOOR)
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES

10 Paratransit Vehicles; full body type; current model
2010 or latest production; cost to include
installation of communication equipment.
Unit Price: 38 each $96,896.00 $221,438.00 $108,743.00
Total: $3,682,048.00 $8,414,644.00 $4,132,234.00
Manufacturer's Make and Model No.: Elkhart Coach ECII (wrong pages submitted) El Dorado National Co. (Enc)
Year of Production Model: 2011 Aerotech 240 - 2011 model
Transmission Type and No. of Speeds: TorqShift Automatic 5-speed Ford Torqshift, 5 speed
Engine Size and No. of Cylinders: 6.8L, V10 Ford 6.8L, V10
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For the furnishing and delivery of 
PARATRANSIT VEHICLES to the Public Transit LOS ANGELES TRUCK CUMMINS WEST, INC. SODERHOLM
Division, Department of Transportation Services, CENTERS, LLC DBA INTERNATIONAL SALES & LEASING,
City and County of Honolulu. DBA BUSWEST TRUCKS OF HAWAII INC.

GROUP IV  (continued) IC HC
2011

11 Shipping and Delivery of all equipment, based on $225,948.00 Allison 2200, 5 speeds $193,800.00
f.o.b. place of destination to C&C of Honolulu, DTS - 6.4 Liter, 8 cylinders
OTS, 811 Middle Street, Honolulu, HI  96819, as
f.o.b. place of destination to C&C of Honolulu, DTS - Shipping for Groups III
OTS, 811 Middle Street, Honolulu, HI  96819, as and IV -
per delivery requirements of the Special Provisions. $456,000.00 *
Cost includes all arrangements to deliver, unload and
place the items in the designated area(s) as Tax - $528,136.70 *
required.  NOTE:  Cost must be an exact amount,
not an estimate. Total for Groups III and IV -

$11,736,470.69 *
12 Tax, if applicable. $162,807.11 $203,842.00

NOTE:  Submitted on
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV, ITEMS 10 - 12: $4,070,803.11 wrong pages * $4,529,876.00

Bid Evaluation - Information Availability: Applicable Information Available Applicable Information Available

Delivery in Calendar Days:  120 days

If unable to meet the above delivery schedule, 120 days after 365 days 320 days
submit Proposal Delivery Schedule time frame: approval of pilot model (based on pilot and 5 buses

every 2 weeks as boat only
comes every 2 weeks)


