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Bound Tree Medical

Henry Schein Inc. Henry|
Schein Matrx Medical

Pharmanutra Inc.

R. Weinstein, Inc.

Rescue Safety Pacific
Inc.

lizs awv || BT ToTAL|| ST TOTAL|| pmce  TOTAL|L NLT ToTalll ST ToTAL
24 |Midazolam {Versed) 250 1.50 375.00 0.95 237.50[] Nobid No bid 1.06 265.00/| Nao bid No bid
25 |Amiodarone 500 2.14 1,070.00 1.82 910.00 1.59 795.00 1.66 830.00 3.00 1.500.00
26 |Afropine 50 1.60 80.00 1.11 55.50 1.38 689.00 1.49 74.50 1.75 87.50
27 |Epinephrine 400 35.75 14,300.00 27.55 11,020.00 1.22 488.00 2.584 1,136.00 1.45 580.00
28 |Glucagon Kit {Combination Package) 200 113.57 22,714.00 74.92 14,984.00 89.12 17,824,001 100.22 20,044.00( 138.68  27,738.00
29 |Levophed 100 7.00 700.00 5.81 581.00 5.89 589.00 5.80 580.00|| No bid No bid
30 |Magnesium Sulfate 400 0.66 264.00 0.51 204.00 0.56 224.00! 0.55 220.00 0.68 272.00
31 {Pitocin {Oxytocin) 500 343 1,715.00 1.33 665.00 1.12 560.00 1.36 680.00{| Nohid No bid
32 |Promethazine HC! Injection 300 1.57 471.00 1.08 318.00 0.89 267.00 1.12 336.00 2.580 750.00
33 |Sodium Chleride 400 0.60 240.00 0.44 176.00 0.68 272.00 1.02 408.00, 0.61 244,00
34 | Sadium Chloride Updraft Solufion 400 0.15 80.00 ¢.11 44.00 0.16 64.00 0.128 51.60 0.14 56.00
35 Succinylcholine Chloride 1,250 2.53 3,162.50 2.05 2,662.50 2,20 2,750.00 2.09 2,612.50 2.04 2,550.00
38 |Terbutaling Sulfate 200 4.43 886.00 2.83 566.00 4.20 840.00 4.68 936.00|| Mo bid No bid
37 |Ondansetron Injection 200 0.84 168.00 0.61 122.00 0.70 140.00 0.89 178.00 0.79 158.00
38 |lpratropium Bromide Inhalation Solution 1,500 || 0.184333 276.50 0.17 255.00 0.21 315.00 0.18 286.00 0.20 300.00
39 |Lidocaine HCI 360 374 1,346.40 5.80 2,088.00 4.71 1,695.60 5.43 1,954.80[; Mo bhid No bid
40 |Dopamine 468 12.87 6,023.16 10.56 4,942.08 10.81 5,059.08 12.77 5,976.36/| No bid No hid
41 |Lidocaing HCI Jelly 500 6.07 3,035.00 5.52 2,760.00 5.14 2,570.00 7.54 3,770.00 No bid No hid
42 |Nitrolingual Spray 500 230.00 115,000.00 214.38 107,190.00 128.61 64,305.00 227.75 113,875.00 160.00 80,000.00
43 |Methyl Predniscne Sadium Succinate 50 6.94 347.00 68.37 318.50 8.93 448.50 32.32 1,616.00 7.00 350.00
44 |Aqueous Epinephrine - 252 3.57 899.64 2.89 75348 3.00 756.00 5.28 1,330.56 No bid No bid
45 |Activated Charcoal Aqueous Suspension 60 6.23 373.80 14.34 860.40 17.62 1,057.20 4.70 282.00 16.00 8960.00
46 |Ammonia Inhalants 1,500 0.1514 227.10 0.18 270.00 0.36 540.00 0.28 420,00 2.06 3,080.00
47 |Adencsine 750 85.70 64,275.00 6.62 4,965.00 24.54 18,405.00 7.78 5,835.00 No bid No bid
48 |Albutercl Sulfate Inhalation Solution 1,800 0.1704 308.72|| 0.17 306.00 0.19 342.00 0.20 360.00 0.20 360.00
e 7,000 || 08714  s009.80|| 067 460000/ 075 525000 o089 6,230.00|[ No bid No bid
50 |Interlink System Cannula Needie 200 0.3034 60.68 0.22 44.00 0.296 59.20 0.24 48.00 No bid No bid
51 |Interlink System Vial Access Cannula Need] 100 0.38 38.00 0.26 26.00 0.369 36.90 No bid No bid 0.2¢9 29.00
52 |Lever Lock Cannula 1,000 0.58 - 580.00 0.38 380.00 0.538 538.00 0.43 430.00 No bid No bid
53 |Intermittent Interlink Injection Cap 6,000 3.28 19,680.00 2.65 15,900.00 3.64 21,840.00 3.08 18,480.00 No bid No bid

These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening. All bids are subject to evaluation.




