ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

Proposal Number: RFB-HPD-286306
RQM-HPD-1000055
Opened: May 4, 2010

For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.
and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.
Honolulu Police Department
ITEM
NO.

Group A - Holsters

1. Holsters; for the right hand
Bid Price Unit 200 each $103.65
Total Bid Price: ‘ $20,730.00
Brand Name and Number: Safariland 070-18-161

2. Holsters; for the left hand
Bid Price Unit 100 each $103.65
Total Bid Price: $10,365.00
Brand Name and Number: Safariland 070-18-162

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP A: NO BID $31,095.00 NO BID

Group B - Waist Belts

3.  Sam Browne Waist Belts;
with nickel chrome buckle
Bid Price Unit 300 each $31.00
Total Bid Price: $9,300.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker B03-HPD-BP-Chrome

4.  Sam Browne Waist Belts;
with polished brass buckle
Bid Price Unit 50 each $31.00
Total Bid Price: $1,550.00

Brand Name and Number:
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Aker B03-HPD-BP-Brass




For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.

Honolulu Police Department

Sally Brown Waist Belts;

with nickel chrome buckle

Bid Price Unit 100 each $33.00

Total Bid Price: $3,300.00

Brand Name and Number: Aker B03-W-HPD-BP
Chrome Buckle

Sally Brown Waist Belts;

with polished brass buckle

Bid Price Unit 50 each $33.00

Total Bid Price: $1,650.00

Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP B:

Group C - Batons and Accessories
Baton; expandable type

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total Bid Price: '
Brand Name and Number:

Case holder for expandable baton

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Retaining Cap

Bid Price Unit 20 each

Total Bid Price:
Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP C:
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NO BID

NO BID

Aker BO3-W-HPD-BP
Brass Buckle

$15,800.00

$76.00

$7,600.00
Armament Systems/
Procedures 52613

$29.00

$2,900.00
Armament Systems/
Procedures 52632

$2.07

$41.40

Armament Systems/
Procedures 9006E

$10,541.40

NO BID

NO BID




For the furishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.
and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.
Honolulu Police Department
Group D - Flashlight Kits and Accessories
10.  Flashlight Kit
Bid Price Unit 120 each $82.50
Total Bid Price: $9,900.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight 76475
11.  Flashlight Battery
Bid Price Unit 350 each $12.00
Total Bid Price: $4,200.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight 75175
12.  Flashlight Bulb
Bid Price Unit 100 each $5.24
Total Bid Price: $524.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight 75914
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP D: NO BID $14,624.00 NO BID
Group E - Handcuff Pouches
13.  Regular size handcuff pouches; nickel type
Bid Price Unit 200 each $20.30
Total Bid Price: $4,060.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker 500-BP Nickel
14. Regular size handcuff pouches; brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $20.30
Total Bid Price: $2,030.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker 500-BP-Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP E: NO BID $6,090.00 NO BID
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For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.
and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.
Honolulu Police Department
Group F - Magazine Pouches
15.  Nickel/chrome type snap
Bid Price Unit 200 each $21.50
Total Bid Price: $4,300.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A510-BP-2-Nickel
16. Brass type snap
Bid Price Unit 100 each $21.50
Total Bid Price: $2,150.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A510-BP-2-Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP F: NO BID $6,450.00 NO BID
Group G - Flashlight Pouches
17.  Nickel type snap
Bid Price Unit 200 each $19.10
Totai Bid Price $3,820.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A556XT-BP Nickel
18. Brass type snap
Bid Price Unit 100 each $17.55
Total Bid Price: $1,755.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker A556XT-BP Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP G: NO BID $5,575.00 NO BID
Group H - Police Caps, Braids, Band and
Covers
19.  Police Caps for Male Officers
Standard type, All sizes
Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID
Total Bid Price
Brand Name and Number:
20. Police Caps for Male Officers with one (1)
Row of Gold Braid; All sizes for Lieutenants
Bid Price Unit 20 each NO BID

Total Bid Price:
Brand Name and Number:
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For the furnishing and delivery of
Various Police Equipment, Accessories
and Finger Print Suppilies to the
Honolulu Police Department

Law Enforcement
Associates, Inc.

Security Equpment Corp.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

21.

22.

23.

24,

25.

26.

Police Caps for Male Officers with two (2)
Rows of Gold Braid; All sizes for

Captains and above

Bid Price Unit 20 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Police Caps Bands, Chrome Band,

"snake" chrome cap strap for band

Bid Price Unit 300 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Police Caps Bands, Gold band,

gold cap strap for band

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Police Cap Covers

Bid Price Unit 500 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Police Caps for Female Officers

Standard Type, All sizes

Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

Police Caps for Female Officers with one (1)
Row of Gold Braid; All sizes for Lieutenants

Bid Price Unit 10 each
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:
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NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID




For the furnishing and delivery of
Various Police Equipment, Accessories
and Finger Print Supplies to the
Honolulu Police Department

Law Enforcement
Associates, Inc.

Security Equpment Corp.

Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

27.

28.

20.

30.

31.

32.

Police Caps for Female Officers with two (2)
Rows of Gold Braid; All sizes for
Captains and above

Bid Price Unit

Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

10 each

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP H:

Group | - Pocket Masks
Pocket mask with one-way valve

Bid Price Unit
Total Bid Price:
Brand Name and Number:

100 each

One-Way Valve, must fit and be
compatible with item 28.

Bid Price Unit

Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

100 each

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I;

Group J - Finger Print Supplies
Magnetic Finger Print Powder

minimum 16 oz
Bid Price Unit
Total Bid Price:
Brand Name and Number:

50 each

Magnetic Wand Applicator
Red; pencil style

Bid Price Unit
Total Bid Price:

Brand Name and Number:

50 each

Fingerprint Powder
Minimum 8 oz; black color

Bid Price Unit 100 each

NO BID

NO BID

$42.39
$2,119.50
Sirchie Item No. BPMSBM9

$14.08
$704.00
Sirchie ltem No. 125L.M

$15.45
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NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

$29.32
$1,466.00
Sirchie BPMSBM9

$10.57
$528.50
Forensics Source 1-0150

$16.37

NO BID

NO BID

$36.80
$1,840.00
TTF LPM-SB-16

$14.36
$718.00
TTF APP-MAG-2

$14.36




For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.

and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.

Honolulu Police Department

Total Bid Price: $1,545.00 $1,637.00 $1,436.00

Brand Name and Number: Sirchie Item No. BPP098 Sirchie BPP098 TTF LP-VB-8
33.  Finger Print Brush

Fiberglass bristies

Bid Price Unit 300 each $6.82 $6.36 $6.80

Total Bid Price: $2,046.00 $1,908.00 $2,040.00

Brand Name and Number: Sirchie Item No. 122L Sirchie 1221 TTF BR-FG6W
34.  Finger Print Lifting Tape

Approximately 1-1/2 in. wide

X minimum 360 in. long roll

Bid Price Unit 500 each $4.30 $4.40 $3.00

Total Bid Price: $2,150.00 $2,200.00 $1,500.00

Brand Name and Number: Sirchie ltem No. 144L Lightening Power 1-1401 TTF Tape-FT-1.5
35.  Finger Print Ink

Minimum 2 oz.

Bid Price Unit 20 each $3.87 $5.24 $3.60

Total Bid Price: $77.40 $104.80 $72.00

Brand Name and Number: Sirchie Item No. 230T Sirchie 230T TTF INK-2
36.  Finger Print Ink Roller

4 in. roller

Bid Price Unit 10 each $9.99 $12.37 $10.40

Total Bid Price: $99.90 $123.70 $104.00

Brand Name and Number: Sirchie ltem No. FPT262B Sirchie FPT262B Roll-Ease RLR-PL-4
37.  Finger Print Ink Reprint Labels

1-1/2in. x 1-1/2 in.

Minimum 500 tabs/roll

Bid Price Unit 10 boxes $18.26 $18.70 $12.00

Total Bid Price: $182.60 $187.00 $120.00

Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII:

Sirchie ltem No. FPT108R

$8,924.40
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Sirchie FPT108R

$8,155.00

TTF FINTAB500

$7,830.00




For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.
and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, Inc.
Honolulu Police Department
Group K - MISCELLANEOUS, award by item
38. Gloves; dress type
Bid Price Unit 500 pairs $2.39
Total Bid Price: NO BID $1,195.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: Hatch WG1000S
39. Measuring Wheels
Bid Price Unit 144 each $48.87 $30.80 $59.98
Total Bid Price $7,037.28 $4,435.20 $8,637.12
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie Item No. RMTO01 Rolape 32-12 Rolatape MW-2F
40. Handcuffs
Bid Price Unit 100 each $26.58 $24.00
Total Bid Price: $2,658.00 $2,400.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: Peerless Standard Model 700 Peerless 700
Nickel Finish
41.  Magazines, Capacity of 15 rounds
Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total Bid Price: NO BID $30.67
Brand Name and Number: $3,067.00 NO BID
Smith & Wesson 190590000
42.  Pepper Spray Pouch
for Guardian 1 oz. Fog SCT00C
Bid Price Unit 300 each $20.60
Total Bid Price: NO BID $6,180.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: Aker A575-BP-V
43.  Fingerprint Kit Box with Custom Decal
Bid Price Unit 300 each $22.75 $21.95
Total Bid Price: NO BID $6,825.00 $6,585.00
Brand Name and Number: Pelican Model 1060 Pelican CS-1060
with custom Decal
44.  Whistle, Chrome
Bid Price Unit 144 each $7.35
Total Bid Price: NO BID $1,058.40 NO BID

Brand Name and Number:
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Acme 60 1/2 Chrome




For the furnishing and delivery of

Various Police Equipment, Accessories Law Enforcement Security Equpment Corp. Tri-Tech Forensics, Inc.
and Finger Print Supplies to the Associates, inc.
Honolulu Police Department
45.  Whistle, Brass
Bid Price Unit 144 each $7.75
Total Bid Price: NO BID $1,116.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: Acme-2 brass
46. Pepper Spray, Service-Fog
Bid Price Unit 500 each
Total Bid Price: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand Name and Number:
47  Pepper Spray, Training-Inert
Bid Price Unit 500 each
Total Bid Price: NO BID NO BID NO BID
Brand Name and Number:
48. CPR Microshield Mask
Bid Price Unit 200 each $17.80
Total Bid Price: NO BID $3,560.00 NO BID
Brand Name and Number: MDI 72-58
49  Brass Buckle for Sam Browne Belt
Bid Price Unit 200 each $6.28
Total Bid Price: NO BID $1,256.00 NO BID

Brand Name and Number:
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Aker Sam Browne Brass Buckle




