CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-269704
DESCRIPTION: COMPACT SPORT UTILITY VEHICLES
BID OPENING: Decemeber 20, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M.

BIDDERS

CUTTER CJD, INC.
CUTTER CHRYSLER
JEEP DODGE OF PEARL

CUTTER FORD, INC.

Servco Pacific Inc.
Servco Auto Leeward

CITY
ALTERNATE 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price| $ - | $ - | $ -
Total Sum Bid | $ - $ - $ -
City EPA MPG
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ - $ - $ -
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ - $ - $ -
ALTERNATE 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price| $ - | $ - | $ -
Total Sum Bid | $ - $ - $ -
City EPA MPG
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ - $ - $ -
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ - $ - $ -
ALTERNATE 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Unit Price| $ - | $ - |3 -
Total Sum Bid | $ - $ - $ -
City EPA MPG
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ - $ - $ -
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ - $ - $ -
ALTERNATE 4 NO BID 2011 Ford Escape Hybrid 2011 Toyota Highlander
Hybrid
Unit Price| $ - | $ 32,727.14 | $ 41,202.08
Total Sum Bid | $ - $ 130,908.56 | $ 164,808.32
City EPA MPG 34 28
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ - $ 20,470.59 | $ 24,857.14
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ - $ 151,379.15 | $ 189,665.46
ALTERNATE 5 NO BID 2011 Ford Escape Hybrid 2011 Toyota RAV-4
Unit Price| $ - | $ 32,727.14 | $ 26,018.84
Total Sum Bid | $ - $ 130,908.56 | $ 104,075.36
City EPA MPG 34 22
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ - $ 20,470.59 | $ 31,636.36
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ - $ 151,379.15 | $ 135,711.72
ALTERNATE 6 2011 Jeep Patriot 2011 Ford Escape XLS NO BID
Unit Price| $ 19,985.33 | $ 21,574.26 | $ -
Total Sum Bid | $ 79,941.32 | $ 86,297.04 | $ -
City EPA MPG 21 21
Total Fuel Mileage Cost | $ 33,142.86 | $ 33,142.86 | $ -
Total Evaluated Bid Price | $ 113,084.18 | $ 119,439.90 | $ -




