Bid Abstract

Solicitation No. RFB-DTS-268404
Project: Furnishing and Delivery of Parts and Equipment to Refurbish and Re-power Buses
to the Department of Transportation Services
City and County of Honolulu

Bid Opening: 7/1/10
ENGINEERED MACHINED
COMPLETE COACH WORKS PRODUCTS INC. GILLIG LLC
Item
No. Description Quantity Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
GROUPI
EMP Mini-Hybrid Electric Fan
System
1 [|Part No.: 2020022333AA02 30 $0.00 $15,480.00 $464,400.00 $14,798.14 $443,944.20
2 |Part No.: 2020022333AA03 16 $0.00 $15,480.00 $247,680.00 $14,798.14 $236,770.24
3 |Part No.: 2020022333AA04 16 $0.00 $15,480.00 $247,680.00 $14,798.14 $236,770.24
4 |Part No.: 2020022333AA05 10 $0.00 $20,480.00 $204,800.00 $14,798.14 $147,981.40
5 |Part No.: 2020032085AA03 9 $0.00 $15,655.00 $140,895.00 $14,875.21 $134,776.89
6 |Part No.: 2020033297AA01 9 $0.00 $0.00 $14,798.14 $133,183.26
Total Lumg Sum Groug | iltems 1-6 NO ﬂJ - $1i305i455'00 $1i333i425'23
GROUPII
7 | Cummins Recon - ISL 330 HP 10 $0.00 $0.00 $23,252.46 $232,524.60
Total Lump Sum Group Il (item 7) NO BID NO BID $232,524.60
GROUP I
8 Q-Straint Belt Retractor System 30 $238.92 $7,167.60 $0.00 $232.00 $6,960.00
Total Lumg Sum Groug 111 iltem 8| $7,167£D NO ﬂJ SEIQED.DD
GROUP IV
9 Ford 6.0 Long Block 8 $0.00 $0.00 $9,470.08 §75,760.64
10 Ford 7.3 Long Block 3 $0.00 $0.00 $6,911.25 $20,733.75
Total Lump Sum Group IV (items 9 - 10) NO BID NO BID $96,494.39
GROUP V
11 Ford 5R110W Torqueshift
Transmission 5 $0.00 $0.00 $3,025.34 $15,126.70
12 | Ford HD 4R100 Transmission 5 $0.00 $0.00 $3,207.32 $16,036.60
Total Lump Sum Group V (items 11-12) NO BID NO BID $31,163.30
GROUP VI
13 Passenger Seat Insert 6283 $48.156 $302,564.15 $0.00 $43.88 $276,326.34
Total Lumg Sum Groug Vi illem13] $30&554.15 NO ﬂJ $275i325.34
GROUP VII
14 | Ricon FoldOver ER-6 Series Ramp 55 $0.00 $0.00 $7,884.86 $433,667.30
Total Lump Sum Group VI (item 14 NO BID NO BID $433i667.30
GROUP VIl
15 Allison Electric Drive EP50 ESS 10 $0.00 $0.00 $48,421.49 $484,214.90
16 Allison Electric Drive EP40 ESS 11 $0.00 $0.00 $48,421.49 $532,636.38
Total Lump Sum Group Vil {Items 15-16) NO BID NO BID $1,016,851.29

* NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.
All bids are subject to evaluation.

** Subject to rejection
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Bid Abstract
Solicitation No. RFB-DTS-268404
Project: Furnishing and Delivery of Parts and Equipment to Refurbish and Re-power Buses
to the Department of Transportation Services

City

and County of Honolulu

Bid Opening: 7/1/10

INTERNATIONAL TRUCKS OF

MATT'S TRANSMISSION NEW FLYER INDUSTRIES
HONOLULU FORD, INC. HAWAII DBA fNUcMI"'INS WEST, REPAIR INC. CANADA
Item
No. Description Quantity] | Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
GROUPI
EMP Mini-Hybrid Electric Fan
System
1 [|Part No.: 2020022333AA02 30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|| $16,784.12 $503,523.60
2 |Part No.: 2020022333AA03 16 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|| $16,784.12 $268,545.92
3 |Part No.: 2020022333AA04 16 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|| 816,784.12 $268,545.92
4 |Part No.: 2020022333AA05 10 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 |Part No.: 2020032085AA03 9 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|| $16,984.95 $152,864.55
6 |Part No.: 2020033297AA01 9 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00|| 816,784.12 $151,057.08
JTotal Lump Sum Group | (items 1- NO BID NO BID NO BID = $1i344i537'°7
GROUPII
7 | Cummins Recon - ISL 330 HP 10 $20,261.77 $202,617.70 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group Il (item 7) NO BID $202,617.70 NO BID NO BID
GROUP Il
8 Q-Straint Belt Retractor System 30 $311.00 $8,330.00 $0.00 $215.66 $6,469.80
Total Lumg Sum Groug 111 iltem 8| NO ﬂj SQISSD.DD NO ﬂJ SEI459.80
GROUP IV
9 Ford 6.0 Long Block 8 $8,045.99 $72,367.92 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
10 Ford 7.3 Long Block 3 $6,571.25 $19,713.75 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group IV (items 9 - 10) $92,081.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID
GROUP V
11 Ford 5R110W Torqueshift
Transmission 5 $2,572.77 $12,863.85 $0.00 $3,350.00 $16,750.00 $0.00
12 | Ford HD 4R100 Transmission 5 $2,861.15 $14,305.75 $0.00 $3,550.00 $17,750.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group V (items 11-12) $27,169.60 NO BID $34,500.00 NO BID
GROUP VI
13 Passenger Seat Insert 6283 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group VI (item13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
P E— I I E—
GROUP VIl
14 | Ricon F“”%‘:ﬂf‘ase”es 55 $0.00 $0.00 s0.00|| $9.62271  $529,249.05
Total Lump Sum Group VI (item 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID $529i249'°5
GROUP Vil
15 | Allison Electric Drive EP50 ESS 10 $0.00|] $48,167.52 $481,675.20]| $49,484.55 $494 84550 $0.00
16 | Allison Electric Drive EP40 ESS 11 $0.00|] $48,167.52 $520,842.72]| $49.484.55 $544,330.05 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group Vil {Items 15-16) NO BID $1,011,517.92 $1,039,175.55 NO BID

* NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.

All bids are subject to evaluation.

** Subject to rejection
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Bid Abstract

Solicitation No. RFB-DTS-268404

Project: Furnishing and Delivery of Parts and Equipment to Refurbish and Re-power Buses
to the Department of Transportation Services
City and County of Honolulu
Bid Opening: 7/1/10

PACIFIC POWER PRODUCTSI

NORTH AMERICAN BUS SODERHOLM SALES &
INDUSTRIES CO, LLC. RICON CORP LEASING, INC.
Item
No. Description Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
GROUP |
EMP Mini-Hybrid Electric Fan
System
1 |Part No.: 2020022333AA02 $17,875.00 $536,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2 |Part No.: 2020022333AA03 $17,875.00 $286,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
3 |Part No.: 2020022333AA04 $17,875.00 $286,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
4 |Part No.: 2020022333AA05 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
5 |Part No.: 2020032085AA03 $17,895.00 $161,955.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
6 |Part No.: 2020033297AA01 $17,875.00 $160,875.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lumg Sum Groug | iltems 1-6) **  $1.431,080.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
_ e e "
GROUP Il
T Cummins Recon - ISL 330 HP $0.00]| $22,400.00 $224,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group Il (item 7) NO BID $224,000.00 NO BID NO BID
GROUP 1t
8 Q-Straint Belt Retractor System $206.22 $6,186.60 $0.00 $0.00 $241.00 §7,230.00
Total Lumg Sum Groug 111 iltem 8| SEI1SE.ED NO ﬂJ NO ﬂJ STIZSD.DD
GROUP IV
9 Ford 6.0 Long Block $0.00]| $15,086.24 $120,689.92 $0.00 $0.00
10 Ford 7.3 Long Block $0.00]| $12,318.15 $36,954.45 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group IV (items 9 - 10) NO BID $157,644.37 NO BID NO BID
GROUP V
11 Ford 5R110W Torqueshift
Transmission $0.00 $4,677.50 $23,387.50 $0.00 $0.00
12 | Ford HD 4R100 Transmission $0.00 $4,665.50 $23,327.50 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group V (items 11-12) $46,715.00 NO BID NO BID
GROUP VI
13 Passenger Seat Insert $0.00 $84.44 §530,536.52 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lumg Sum Groug \i iltem13] NO ﬂJ $530i535.52l NO ﬂJ NO @
GROUP VI
14 | Ricon FoldOver ER-6 Series Ramp| $8,875.00 $488,125.00 $0.00 $8,384.86 $461,167.30]| $11,710.27 $644,064.85
Total Lumg Sum Groug Vil illem 14) $488i125.DD NO ﬂJ $4E1,1E?£D $E44IDE4.85
GROUP VIl
15 Allison Electric Drive EP50 ESS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
16 Allison Electric Drive EP40 ESS $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Total Lump Sum Group Vill {items 15-16) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

* NOTE: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.
All bids are subject to evaluation.

** Subject to rejection
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