
Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO.  RFB-DPR-267008-A
Reqn No.:  RQS-DPR-1000674
OPENED:  February 3, 2010
By:  RM & 

Item No. estimated

& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus  Total Bus  Total Bus  Total Bus  Total

1-12. ITEMS DELETED

13. AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM
Aiea Complex Office:  99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7860)
Aiea District Park:  99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7859)
Salt Lake District Park:  1159 Ala Lilikoi Place (831-7101)
(Teens)

7/26/2010 to Hawaii Okinawa Cntr 1 $325.00 $325.00 $490.00 $490.00 $280.00 $280.00 $635.59 $635.59
  a.  Salt Lake /  Aiea
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 13 $325.00 $490.00 $280.00 $635.59

14. BOOTH COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM
Booth Complex Office:  2331 Kaneali'i Ave. (595-2203)
Booth District Park:  2331 Kaneali'I Ave. (522-7040)
Lanakila District Park:  1701 Lanakila Ave. (832-7820)
(Teens)

7/26/2010 to Hawaii Okinawa Cntr 1 $345.00 $345.00 $360.00 $360.00 $635.59 $635.59
  a.  Booth / Lanakila
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 14 $345.00 $360.00 NO BID $635.59

15-18. ITEMS DELETED

19. AIEA DISTRICT PARK
99-350 Aiea Heights Drive (483-7859)
(Children)

6/22/2010 to Haleiwa Surf Center 4 $337.50 $1,350.00 $380.00 $1,520.00 $280.00 $1,120.00 $635.59 $2,542.36
7/8/2010 to Pearl Harbor Battle Ship Missouri 2 $287.00 $574.00 $350.00 $700.00 $210.00 $420.00 $440.02 $880.04
7/9/2010 to Pearl Harbor Battle Ship Missouri 2 $287.00 $574.00 $350.00 $700.00 $210.00 $420.00 $440.02 $880.04
7/21/2010 to Ice Palace 4 $307.00 $1,228.00 $350.00 $1,400.00 $190.00 $760.00 $586.90 $2,347.60 *

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 19 $3,726.00 $4,320.00 $2,720.00 $6,650.04 *

TOMASA'S BUS CO. INC.

BID PRICES

GOMES SCHOOL
BUS SERVICE, LTD.

VIP TRANS, INC.

BID PRICESBID PRICESBID PRICES
SCHOOL BUS, INC.
ROBERT'S HAWAII



Summer Fun Bus Services Bid Abstract
PROPOSAL NO.  RFB-DPR-267008-A
Reqn No.:  RQS-DPR-1000674
OPENED:  February 3, 2010
By:  RM & 

Item No. estimated

& Date Program Area, Destination no. of Per Per Per Per
Of Trip Buses Bus  Total Bus  Total Bus  Total Bus  Total

TOMASA'S BUS CO. INC.

BID PRICES

GOMES SCHOOL
BUS SERVICE, LTD.

VIP TRANS, INC.

BID PRICESBID PRICESBID PRICES
SCHOOL BUS, INC.
ROBERT'S HAWAII

20-32. ITEMS DELETED

33. PU'UNUI COMMUNITY PARK
2555 Pu'unui Avenue (595-2460)
(Children)

6/30/2010 to K-bay Lanes Kaneohe MCBH 2 $307.50 $615.00 $490.00 $980.00 $250.00 $500.00 $635.59 $1,271.18
7/7/2010 to Wet N Wild Adv. Park 2 $342.50 $685.00 $490.00 $980.00 $220.00 $440.00 $684.48 $1,368.96 *
7/23/2010 to Ice Palace 2 $298.00 $596.00 $490.00 $980.00 $200.00 $400.00 $635.59 $1,271.18

  a.  Puunui / Lanakila Dist. Park 1 $298.00 $298.00 $490.00 $490.00 $200.00 $200.00 $586.69 $586.69

(Children) Shuttle
6/22/2010 to Regal Theatres Dole Cannery 1 $378.00 $378.00 $450.00 $450.00 $210.00 $210.00 $488.91 $488.91

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 33 $2,572.00 $3,880.00 $1,750.00 $4,986.92 *

34-36. ITEMS DELETED

37. ASING COMMUNITY PARK
91-1450 Renton Road (681-6435)
(Children)

06/18/10 to Kailua Beach Park 4 $450.00 $1,800.00 $260.00 $1,040.00 * $684.48 $2,737.92
07/08/10 to Ice Palace 4 $450.00 $1,800.00 $210.00 $840.00 $325.94 $1,303.76
07/23/10 to Kualoa Regional Park 4 $450.00 $1,800.00 $270.00 $1,080.00 $760.53 $3,042.12

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings to Makakilo Pool
06/22/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $325.94 $325.94
06/29/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $325.94 $325.94
07/13/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $325.94 $325.94

(Teens)
06/26/10 Ewa Beach Community Park 1 $490.00 $490.00 $240.00 $240.00 $585.79 $585.79
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to Asing Community Park

to Hawaiian Brians

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 37 NO BID $7,015.00 $3,800.00 * $8,647.41

38. ITEM DELETED

39. EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK
91-955 North Road (689-0370)
(Children)

6/16/10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 4 $490.00 $1,960.00 $280.00 $1,120.00 $635.58 $2,542.32
6/23/10 to Kualoa Regional Park 4 $490.00 $1,960.00 $280.00 $1,120.00 $760.53 $3,042.12
7/7/10 to Polynesian Cultural Center 4 $490.00 $1,960.00 $360.00 $1,440.00 $760.53 $3,042.12

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings to Makakilo Pool
6/28/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $597.56 $597.56
7/12/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $597.56 $597.56
7/19/10 to Makakilo Pool 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $597.56 $597.56

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 39 NO BID $7,005.00 $4,280.00 $10,419.24

40. EWA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
91-1280 Renton Road
(Children)

6/17/10 to Waimea Bay Beach Park 3 $490.00 $1,470.00 $280.00 $840.00 $760.53 $2,281.59
7/1/10 to Ice Palace 3 $450.00 $1,350.00 $210.00 $630.00 $305.00 $915.00
7/13/10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $490.00 $1,470.00 $280.00 $840.00 $760.53 $2,281.59

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings to Makakilo Pool
6/25/10 to Makakilo Neighborhood Park 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $597.56 $597.56
7/9/10 to Makakilo Neighborhood Park 1 $375.00 $375.00 $200.00 $200.00 $597.56 $597.56
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TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 40 NO BID $5,040.00 $2,710.00 $6,673.30

41. EWA TEEN COMPLEX
91-1450 Renton Road (681-6435)
(Teen)

7/9/10 Makakilo Community Park 1 $450.00 $450.00 $260.00 $260.00
to McCoy Pavilion

Ewa Beach Community Park 1 $450.00 $450.00 $260.00 $260.00
to Asing Community Park

to McCoy Pavilion

7/17/10 Makakilo Community Park 1 $550.00 $550.00 $260.00 $260.00
to Wet & Wild

Ewa Beach Community Park 1 $550.00 $550.00 $260.00 $260.00
to Asing Community Park

to Wet & Wild

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 41 NO BID $2,000.00 $1,040.00 NO BID

42-49. ITEMS DELETED

50. PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK
785 Hoomaemae Street (45307550)
(Children)

6/25/10 to Waimea Bay Beach Park 5 $317.50 $1,587.50 $425.00 $2,125.00 $280.00 $1,400.00
7/6/10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 5 $317.50 $1,587.50 $400.00 $2,000.00 $280.00 $1,400.00
7/16/10 to Kokololio Beach Park 5 $352.50 $1,762.50 $450.00 $2,250.00 $360.00 $1,800.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 50 $4,937.50 $6,375.00 $4,600.00 NO BID

51. PEARL CITY COMPLEX TEENS
785 Hoomaemae Street (453-7551)
(Teens)
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7/9/10 to McCoy Pavilion 1 $298.00 $298.00 $425.00 $425.00
7/31/10 to Sea Life Park 1 $310.00 $310.00 $490.00 $490.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 51 $608.00 $915.00 NO BID NO BID

52-54. ITEMS DELETED

55. WAIAU DISTRICT PARK
98-1650 Kaahumanu Street (453-7555)
(Children)

6/27/10 to Kailua Beach Park 3 $287.50 $862.50 $450.00 $1,350.00 $280.00 $840.00 $635.58 $1,906.74
7/6/10 to Ice Palace 3 $278.00 $834.00 $450.00 $1,350.00 $200.00 $600.00 $305.00 $915.00
7/20/10 to Kokololio Beach Park 3 $312.50 $937.50 $450.00 $1,350.00 $360.00 $1,080.00 $760.53 $2,281.59

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 55 $2,634.00 $4,050.00 $2,520.00 $5,103.33

56-57. ITEMS DELETED

58. WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK
94-870 Lumiaina Street (678-0871)
(Children)

6/25/10 to Kualoa Beach Park 2 $330.00 $660.00 $450.00 $900.00 $260.00 $520.00 $760.53 $1,521.06
7/9/10 to Queen's Surf Beach Park 2 $305.00 $610.00 $450.00 $900.00 $220.00 $440.00 $488.91 $977.82
7/21/10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 2 $335.00 $670.00 $450.00 $900.00 $280.00 $560.00 $635.58 $1,271.16

(Children) Shuttle to activity
6/18/2010 to Chuck E. Cheese 1 $305.00 $305.00 $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00 $305.00 $305.00
7/16/2010 to Chuck E. Cheese 1 $305.00 $305.00 $400.00 $400.00 $200.00 $200.00 $305.00 $305.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 58 $2,550.00 $3,500.00 $1,920.00 $4,380.04

59-61. ITEMS DELETED
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62. AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK
47-450 Hui Aeko Place (239-6594)
(Children)

7-15-10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 3 $312.50 $937.50
7-20-10 to Kualoa Regional Park 3 $280.00 $840.00

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings to Kaneohe Pool
6-18-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00
7-02-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00
7-23-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $360.00 $360.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 62 $2,857.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

63. AIKAHI COMMUNITY PARK
93 Kaneohe Bay Drive (254-4678)
(Children)

6-16-10 to Camp Kualoa 3 $285.00 $855.00
7-20-10 to Ice Palace 2 $294.00 $588.00
7-20-10 to Bishop Museum 2 $294.00 $588.00

(Children) Shuttle for bowling to Kaneohe Marine Base
7-21-10 to Kaneohe Marine Base 1 $360.00 $360.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 63 $2,391.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

64-65. ITEMS DELETED

66. HEEIA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL
46-202 Haiku Road (233-7330)
(Children)

6/25/2010 to Haleiwa Surf Center 5 $317.50 $1,587.50
6/30/2010 to Dole Plantation 5 $315.00 $1,575.00
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7/14/2010 to Bishop Museum 5 $274.00 $1,370.00

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outings to Kaneohe Pool 
7/1/2010 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00
7/15/2010 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00
7/22/2010 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 66 $5,882.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

67. KAHALUU COMPLEX TEENS
45-660 Keaahala Road
Kaneohe, HI. 96744 (233-7314)

07/17/2010to Wet n Wild (Mahalo Affair)
Pick-up Hauula Community Park - 54-050 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5564)

and Kahuku High School Gym - 56-490 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5116)
1 $415.00 $415.00 $923.50 $923.50

Pick-up Laie Elementary School Cafeteria - 55-109 Kulanui (233-7314)

and Kahuku High School Gym - 56-490 Kamehameha Hwy. (293-5116)
1 $415.00 $415.00 $923.50 $923.50

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 67 $830.00 NO BID NO BID $1,847.00

68. ITEM DELETED

69. KAILUA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM
21 South Kainalu Drive (266-7652)
(Teens)

6-23-10 to Haleiwa Surf Center 1 $292.50 $292.50 $651.88 $651.88
7-02-10 to Ice Palace 1 $324.00 $324.00 $586.69 $586.69
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7-09-10 to Hawaiian Brian's Billiards 1 $324.00 $324.00 $586.69 $586.69
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 69 $940.50 NO BID NO BID $1,825.26

70. KAILUA SUMMER FUN PROGRAM
315 Kuulei Road (266-7652)
(Children)

6-29-10 to Kaneohe Marine Base 5 $280.00 $1,400.00
7-06-10 to Kualoa Regional Park 5 $285.00 $1,425.00
7-20-10 to Ice Palace 3 $294.00 $882.00
7-20-10 to Bishop Museum 3 $294.00 $882.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 70 $4,589.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

71. KANEOHE COMPLEX
45-660 Keaahala Road (233-7309)
(Teens)

07-26-10 To Wet N' Wild Hawaii
Pick up at Ahuimanu Community Park, 47-450 Hui Aeko Place (239-6594)

1 $350.00 $350.00 $760.53 $760.53
and Kaneohe District Park, 45-660 Keaahala Road (233-7309)

1 $350.00 $350.00 $760.53 $760.53
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 71 $700.00 NO BID NO BID $1,521.06

72. KAPUNAHALA NEIGHBORHOOD PARK
45-800 Anoi Rd.  Kaneohe, HI 96744  (233-7316)
(Children)

6-23-10 to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $294.00 $882.00
  (Pearl City)

to Chuck E. Cheese 3 $294.00 $882.00
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  (Dillingham)
6-30-10 to Ice Palace 5 $294.00 $1,470.00
7-13-10 to Kualoa Regional Park 5 $285.00 $1,425.00

(Children) Shuttle for Swimming Outing to Kaneohe District Park Pool
6-11-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00
6-29-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00
7-6-10 to Kaneohe District Park 1 $450.00 $450.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 72 $6,009.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

73-77. ITEMS DELETED

78. VEHICLE FOR THE HANDICAPPED/DISABLED
VARIOUS PARKS AND RECREATION SITES

various various sites 8
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

* Corrected amount, arithmetical error

Note: These figures are preliminary or apparent bid results of the date of bid opening.
All bids are subject to evaluation.


