PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DFM-225110
OPENED: AUGUST 7, 2009

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of PNEUMATIC

TIRES, for the twelve-month beginning EAST BAY TIRE THE GOODYEAR TIRE HAWAIIAN ISLAND NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL PACIFIC TIRE
September 1, 2009 and ending COMPANY & RUBBER COMPANY TIRE CO., INC. TIRE OF HAWAII, INC. GROUP L.L.C.
August 31, 2010, to the City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO. UNMOUNTED TIRES
. PASSENGER CAR TIRES
1. P225/70R15
Bid Price Unit 143 $90.00 $62.72 $62.72 NO BID $73.00
Total $12,870.00 $8,968.96 $8,968.96 | = - $10,439.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT MAXTOUR GOODYEAR INTEGRITY GDY INTEGRITY 14851 NEXEN RO-HT
GT2257015-1 - 402-392-436 402392436 100S
Stock or Import: S S S STOCK
2. P225/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 60 $83.00 NO BID $81.97 NO BID NO BID
Total $4,98000| = e $4,91820 | e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHAMPIRO GDY WRL SRA
GT22575R15HY2 183064418
Stock or Import: S S
3. P235/75R15
Bid Price Unit 18 $85.00 $71.70 $71.70 NO BID $71.00
Total $1,530.00 $1,290.60 $1,29060 | = —emeeee- $1,278.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHAMPIRO GOODYEAR WR1 SRA GDY WRL SRA 14747 NEXEN RO-HT
GT23575R15HY2 183-406-418 183406418 1058
S S S STOCK

Stock or Import:
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4. P235/75R15, white wall
Bid Price Unit 62 $85.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $5,27000f = —e— e | e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHAMPIRO
GT23575R15HY2
Stock or Import: S
5. P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price Unit 16 $197.12 $112.67 $112.67 NO BID $111.00
Total $3,153.92 $1,802.72 $1,802.72| - $1,776.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GEN GRABBER HTS GOODYEAR WR1 SRA GDY WRL SRA HANKOOK RH03
15485460000 183-783-418 183783418
Stock or Import: S S S STOCK
6. P224/60R17, for 2009 Chevrolet Uplander
for Paratransit Department, Oahu Transit
Services, Inc.
Bid Price Unit 80 $117.00 $112.80 $96.04 NO BID NO BID
Total $9,360.00 $9,024.00 $768320| = ——— e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GEN ALTIMAX RT| GOODYEAR FORTERA HL GDY ASSURANCE
1548437 151-275-152 738168571
S S S

Stock or Import:
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. TRUCKTIRES
A. TRUCKTIRES, TUBE TYPE ONLY
7. 11.00 X 20, 14 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 28 $330.51 $331.17 $360.16 NO BID NO BID
Total $9,254.28 $9,272.76 $10,084.48 | = e | e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SAMSON HIWAY GOODYEAR G149 H NANCO HWY 16PR
EXPRESS 33018-2 138-382-187 N21301
Stock or Import: S S S
B. TRUCK TIRES, TUBELESS
8. 8X145,12PR
Bid Price Unit 32 $103.00 $171.93 $69.07 $94.24 NO BID
Total $3,296.00 $5,501.76 $2,210.24 $3,01568 | e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CARL SPORT TRAIL] GOODYEAR TRACHMF NANCO HWY 12PR EAST-UP
5193341 141-678-320 N225151
Stock or Import: S I S IMP
9. 7.50X16,10PR
Bid Price Unit 46 $98.00 $117.51 $96.45 $94.24 NO BID
Total $4,508.00 $5,405.46 $4,436.70 $4,335.04 | = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MEWAT HWY GOODYEAR WH E NANCO HWY 10PR EAST-UP
KO75016-1 312-100-090 N22421
S S S IMP

Stock or Import:




PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DFM-225110

PAGE 4 EAST BAY TIRE THE GOODYEAR TIRE HAWAIIAN ISLAND NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL PACIFIC TIRE
COMPANY & RUBBER COMPANY TIRE CO., INC. TIRE OF HAWAII, INC. GROUP L.L.C.
10. LT225/75R16, 8 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 138 $99.00 $100.11 $118.55 $85.79 $73.00
Total $13,662.00 $13,815.18 $16,359.90 $11,839.02 $10,074.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT SAVERO HT+ REPUBLIC TRLMK GDY WRL SILENT CONCOURS L682 13653 NEXEN RO-HT
GT225/75R16 EAS6 RD AP D ARM 748513188 115/112Q 10PLY
357-943-033
Stock or Import: S S S STK STOCK
11. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 331 $111.00 $110.99 $126.90 $98.55 $100.00
Total $36,741.00 $36,737.69 $42,003.90 $32,620.05 $33,100.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT SAVERO HT+ REPUBLIC TRLMK GDY WRL HT CONCOURS L682 13443 NEXEN RO-HT
GT245/75R16 EHY5 RD AP E 744395900 120/116Q 10PLY
357-046-071
Stock or Import: S S S STK STOCK
12. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G949 RSA, Product code 139082303 or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for Oahu Transit Services, Inc.
emergency purchases during the first
11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 80 $217.14 $211.46 $211.46 NO BID NO BID
Total $17,371.20 $16,916.80 $16,916.80 | = ————— e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: L T245/75R16 GDYR GOODYEAR G949 GDY G949 RSA
G949 RSA ARMORMAX E 139082303
139-082-303
S S S

Stock or Import:
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13. LT265/75R16, 6 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 60 $130.00 $108.40 $128.50 $106.02 NO BID
Total $7,800.00 $6,504.00 $7,710.00 $6,361.20 | = -mememeeee-
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT SAVERO HT+ REPUBLIC TRLMK GDY WRL SILENT CONCOURS 1682
GT265/75R16 DAS5 RD AP C ARM 748515189
357-846-072
Stock or Import: S S S IMP
14. LT215/85R16, 8 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 144 $97.00 $99.98 NO BID $88.23 $95.00
Total $13,968.00 $14,397.12( e $12,705.12 $13,680.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT ADVENTURE A/T REPUBLIC TRLMK CONCOURS L1682 13506 NEXEN RO-HT
GT215/85R16 DAS5 RD AP E 115/112Q 10PLY
357-268-033
Stock or Import: S S STK STOCK
15. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, black wall on
both sides of tire.
Bid Price Unit 45 $101.00 $105.22 $123.11 $88.23 NO BID
Total $4,545.00 $4,734.90 $5,539.95 $3,970.35] = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO DL6000 REPUBLIC TRLMK GDY WRL HT CONCOURS L682
86600016215E RD AP E 744821900
357-458-071
S S S STK

Stock or Import:
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16. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on
both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading. Goodyear
G949 RSA, Product code 139081303 or
equivalent. Contractor must stock at least
60 tires for Oahu Transit Services, Inc.
emergency purchases during the first
11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 720 $211.94 $206.38 $206.39 NO BID NO BID
Total $152,596.80 $148,593.60 $148,600.80 | = e e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: 215/85R16 10PR GOODYEAR G949 GDY G949 RSA
GDYR G949 RSA RSA ARMORMAX 139081303
139-081-303
Stock or import: S S S
17. LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR,
Bid Price Unit 145 $112.00 $111.12 $116.20 $99.48 $105.00
Total $16,240.00 $16,112.40 $16,849.00 $14,424.60 $15,225.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT SAVERO HT+ REPUBLIC TRLMK GDY WRL HT CONCOURS L682 13415 NEXEN RO-HT
GT235/85R16 EAS2 RD AP E 744725502 120/116Q 10PLY
357-045-071
Stock or Import: S S S STK STOCK
18. 12X 16.5LT, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 13 $265.37 NO BID $193.87 $229.49 NO BID
Total $3,44981| = - $2,520.31 $2,98337 | = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: STA HWY DELNAT AKURET EASTUP HWY
STA HWY 12PR 18062
S S IMP

Stock or Import:
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19. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114
or comparable, SBR, Trailer service.
Bid Price Unit 27 $188.00 $192.66 $192.66 $174.08 NO BID
Total $5,076.00 $5,201.82 $5,201.82 $4,700.16 | = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R216 GOODYEAR UNISTEEL GDY G114 H CONCOURS
RL215/75R17.5-1 G114 16 PLY 756246567
756-246-567
Stock or Import: S S S IMP
20. 225/70R19.5, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 127 $179.00 $229.48 $229.48 $180.63 $161.00
Total $22,733.00 $29,143.96 $29,143.96 $22,940.01 . $20,447.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R216 GOODYEAR G670RV F GDY G670 RV F SENTRIDA SR69 DOUBLE COIN RT500
RL225/7019.5-1 139-418-050 139418050
Stock or Import: S S S IMP STOCK
21. 255/70R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159
or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire
Bid Price Unit 52 $269.00 $282.44 $282.44 $199.91 $220.00
Total $13,988.00 $14,686.88 $14,686.88 $10,395.32 $11,440.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R120 GOODYEAR G169 RSA GDY G169 RSA H SENTRIDA SR79 DOUBLE COIN RT500
RL255/70R22.5 HHY?2 16PLY 756-780-519 756 780519
S S S IMP STOCK

Stock or Import:
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22. 315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile.
Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock™" or
"Import™.
Bid Price Unit 631 $320.00 $423.64 $423.64 $302.50 $304.00
Total $201,920.00 $267,316.84 $267,316.84 $190,877.50 $191,824.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R216 GOODYEAR G291 LP GDY G291 L SENTRIDA SR87{ DOUBLE COIN RR200L
RL3158022.5-1 20 PR 756-256-420 756 256 420
Stock or Import: S S S STK IMPORT
23. 425/65R22.5, 20 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
(286 or comparable, on/off highway,
SBR, all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib rear.
Bid Price Unit 9 $559.00 $532.24 $532.24 $494.90 $505.00
Total $5,031.00 $4,790.16 $4,790.16 $4,454 .10 $4,545.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R218] GOODYEAR G286 ASS L GDY G286 L DBL.STAR| DOUBLE COIN RLB900+
RL425/65R22.5-1 759-313-200 759 313 200
Stock or Import: S S S IMP STOCK
24. 10R225,12PR
Bid Price Unit 14 $325.00 $263.28 $316.82 $249.35 NO BID
Total $4,550.00 $3,685.92 $4,435.48 $3,49090 [ = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R118 RL10R22.5-1 DUNLOP SP160 "G" GDY G149 F TRIANGLE TR665
271-122-072 138947125
S S S IMP

Stock or Import:
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25. 11R22.5-H, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G395
LHS or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Contractor must stock at least 40 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import”.
Bid Price Unit 866 $239.00 $391.16 $391.16 $239.99 $257.00
Total $206,974.00 $338,744.56 $338,744.56 $207,831.34 $222,562.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R216f GOODYEAR G395 LHS H GDY G395 H TRIANGLE TR 686] DOUBLE COIN RT606+
RL11R225GRB2 138-954-155 138954155 18/32
Stock or Import: S S S IMP STOCK & IMPORT
26. 12R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286
or comparable. SBR, all position, severe
service application, on/off highway, resistant
to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 26 $382.00 $486.14 $427.80 NO BID NO BID
Total $9,932.00 $12,639.64 $11,12280 W ee— | e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R216 RL12R22.5-1] GOODYEAR G288 MSA H GDY G287 H
138-864-665 138864662
Stock or Import: S S S
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[ll. LOADER - DOZER, LOADER, PAVER,
TUBELESS, NYLON CORD
27. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 4 $2,614.52 NO BID $3,528.79 $2,474.00 NO BID
Total $10,458.08} = —emmeeee- $14,115.16 $9.896.00 | = e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S L-4 416193B5 GDY SHRL XTDL| YOKOHAMA 24PLY L-4
133909347 '
Stock or Import: S | IMP
28. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price Unit 4 $100.00 NO BID $366.49 $104.71 NO BID
Total $400.00 [ = ceeeeeeen $1,465.96 $41884 | = et
TOTAL BID PRICE (ITEM NOS. 27 + 28): $10,858.08 - $15,581.12 $10,314.84
IV. LAWN AND GARDEN TIRES
29. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac,
Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread, designed
to Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 78 $32.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $2,558.40 { = e e e s
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO DR 18858CST2
Stock or Import: S
30. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac,
Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread, designed-
to Minimize Turf Damage, 6 PR
Bid Price Unit 31 $32.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $1,016.80 | = ee— e e
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO TURF
DR18858CST2
Stock or Import: S




