
CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU DIVISION OF PURCHASING
Solicitation No: RFB-BFS-197807
Description: Furnishing and Delivery of Various SUVs and Trucks
Bid Opening: 2:00 p.m. 6/10/2010

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Pearl 
City Cutter Ford, Inc Honolulu Ford Inc. 

Interpacific Motors Inc.
DBA Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet, Inc Valley Isle Motors, Ltd

Item 1: THREE (3) FULL-SIZE 
SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLES – 
SPECIAL SERVICE MODEL.
Model: 2010 Ford Expedition Ford Expedition UIF 2010 Ford Expedition SSV (UF1) 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe CC10706 2011 Ford Expedition 4X2 SSV-UIF
Unit Price: 60,038.97$                             61,273.10$                            59,861.65$                                         67,064.00$                                         64,867.85$                                          
Total: 180,116.91$                           183,819.30$                          179,584.95$                                       201,192.00$                                       194,603.55$                                        

Item 2: THREE (3) MID-SIZE 
SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLES – 
SPECIAL SERVICE MODEL.
Model: 2010 Ford Expedition 2010 Ford Explorer U7D 2010 Ford Expedition SSV (UF1) 2011 Chevrolet Tahoe CC10706 2010 Ford Explorer 4X4 XLT - U7D
Unit Price: 60,278.92$                             61,529.13$                            59,861.65$                                         67,561.00$                                         62,212.13$                                          
Total: 180,836.76$                           184,587.39$                          179,584.95$                                       202,683.00$                                       186,636.39$                                        

Item 3: 12,400 LBS. GVWR TRUCK, 
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS 
WITH 8’ PICKUP BODY W/ DUMP 
BED, 2WD, DRW.
Model: 2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350 Pickup 2011 Ford F350 F3C 2011 Ford F350 (F3C) 2011 Chevrolet CC30953 EXT CAB
Unit Price: 39,380.08$                                          40,637.68$                             38,073.22$                            36,681.37$                                         47,005.00$                                         
Total: 39,380.08$                                          40,637.68$                             38,073.22$                            36,681.37$                                         47,005.00$                                         

Item 4: PICKUP TRUCK, 
APPROXIMATELY 12,000 GVWR, 
DRW WITH UTILITY BODY.
Model: 2011 Dodge Ram 3500 Ford F350 Chassis 2011 Ford F350 F3G 2011 Ford F350 (F3C) 2011 Chevrolet CC31003/ZW9
Unit Price: 43,984.27$                                          45,599.46$                             44,061.07$                            40,597.00$                                         46,161.00$                                         
Total: 43,984.27$                                          45,599.46$                             44,061.07$                            40,597.00$                                         46,161.00$                                         

Item 5: THREE (3) 15,000 LB. GVWR 
4-DOOR CREW CAB AND CHASSIS 
WITH SERVICE BODY & CANOPY
Model: 2011 F450 Chassis 2011 Ford F450 W4G 2011 Ford F450 (W4G)
Unit Price: 71,195.65$                             75,077.80$                            71,874.19$                                         
Total: 213,586.95$                           225,233.40$                          215,622.57$                                       

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 



Item 6: TWO (2) ONLY, 15,000 LBS. 
GVWR TRUCK CAB & CHASSIS 
WITH FIBERGLASS SERVICE BODY 
AND 35 FT. TELESCOPIC 
ARTICULATING AERIAL DEVICE
Model: 2011 Ford F450
Unit Price: 117,949.69$                           
Total: 235,899.38$                           

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 


