CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES
BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM Interpacific Motors Inc
Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
ITEM 1: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
SEVEN (7) COMPACT 4-DOOR SEDANS. 7
alternate 1
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 2
NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 3 2011 Ford Fusion SE
$ 21,924.13 | $ 153,468.91
City MPG: 13
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
NO BID ABS: 7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 77,861.54
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 224,330.448
alternate 4 2011 Ford Fusion Hybrid
$ 30,693.76 | $ 214,856.32
City MPG: 41
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 7 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 29,707.32
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 237,563.637
alternate 5 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 6 2010 Dodge Caliber 2011 Ford Fusion S 2011 Ford Focus




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total
$ 19,965.44 | $ 139,758.08 | $ 18,719.94 ( $ 131,039.58 $ 18,274.00 [ $ 127,918.00
City MPG: 23|City MPG: 22 City MPG: 29
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 [Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
ABS: 7|ABS: 7 NO BID ABS: 7 NO BID
Non-White: 0|Non-White: 0 Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 52,956.52 [Total Fuel Cost: | $ 55,363.64 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 42,000.0
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 185,714.60 (Bid : $ 179,403.216 Bid : $ 162,918.000
ITEM 2: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF TWO
(2) HYBRID COMPACT SEDANS. 2
2011 Ford Fusion 2011 Ford Fusion
$ 29,815.00 | $ 59,630.00 $ 32,794.00 | $ 65,588.00
City MPG: 41 City MPG: 41
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 2 NO BID ABS: 2 NO BID
Non-White: 0 Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 8,487.80 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 8,487.80
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 66,117.805 Bid : $ 72,075.805
ITEM 3: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF SIX
(6) COMPACT SUVs. 6
alternate 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
allernate 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 4 2011 Ford Escape 2011 Ford Escape
$ 20,061.78 | $ 120,370.68 $ 22,429.00 | $ 134,574.00
City MPG: 34 City MPG: 21




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID
Non-White: 0 Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 30,705.882 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 49,714.29
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 145,076.562 Bid : $ 178,288.286
alternate 5 2011 Ford Escape
$ 20,061.78 | $ 120,370.68
City MPG: 21
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 49,714.29
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 164,084.966
alternate 6 2010 Jeep Patriot
$ 20,966.48 | $ 125,798.88
City MPG: 21
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
ABS: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 49,714.29
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 169,513.17
ITEM 4: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF SIX
(6) COMPACT SUVs WITH 4WD. 6
allernate 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
allernate 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
alternate 3 2011 Ford Escape
$ 23,502.69 | $ 141,016.14
City MPG: 13
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 66,738.46
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 201,754.602
alternate 4 2011 Ford Escape Hybrid 2011 Ford Escape
$ 35,366.94 | $ 212,201.64 $ 35,505.00 | $ 213,030.00
City MPG: 30 City MPG: 30
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID
Non-White: 0 Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 34,800.00 Total Fuel Cost: | $ 34,800.00
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 241,001.640 Bid : $ 241,830.000
alternate 5 2011 Ford Escape
$ 21,981.44 | $ 131,888.64
City MPG: 20
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
NO BID ABS: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 52,200.00
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 178,088.64
alternate 6 2010 Jeep Patriot 4AWD

$ 20,887.95 | $ 125,327.70
City MPG: 21
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM Interpacific Motors Inc
Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
ABS: 6 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 49,714.286
Total Evaluated
Bid : $169,041.986
ITEM 5: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
FOUR (4) COMPACT SUVs WITH SIX (6)
CYLINDER ENGINE AND HIDE-AWAY STROBE
SYSTEM.
4
allernate 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
altlernate 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 3 2011 Ford Escape 2011 Ford Escape
$ 23,981.23 | $ 95,924.92 | $ 25,319.88 | $ 101,279.52
City MPG: 14|City MPG: 19
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41 (Cost of Fuel: | $ 2.41
ABS: 4|ABS: 4
NO BID Non-White: 0|Non-White: 0 NO BID NO BID
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 41,314.29 |Total Fuel Cos| $ 30,442.11
Total
Total Evaluated Evaluated Bid
Bid : $ 133,239.21 |: $ 127,721.63
altlernate 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 5 2011 Ford Escape
$ 23,981.23 | $ 95,924.92
City MPG: 14
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
NO BID ABS: 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 41,314.29
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 133,239.21
alternate 6 2010 Dodge Nitro 2011 Ford Escape
$ 23,189.52 | $ 92,758.08 $ 25,288.00 | $ 101,152.00
City MPG: 16 City MPG: 19
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
ABS: 4 NO BID NO BID ABS: 4 NO BID
Non-White: 0 Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: [ $ 43,500.00 Total Fuel Cost: [ $  36,631.58
Total Evaluated Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 132,258.08 Bid : $ 133,783.58
6 CANCELLED
7 CANCELLED
ITEM 8: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF TWO
(2) COMPACT PICK-UP TRUCKS. 2
8 alternate 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
allernate 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 3 2010 Dodge Ram 1500
$ 22,339.26 | $ 44,678.52
City MPG: 9
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.41
ABS: 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Non-White: 0

Total Fuel Cost: | $ 32,133.33




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 74,811.85
alternate 4 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
alternate 5 2011 Ford Ranger 2011 Ford Ranger 2011 Ford Ranger
$ 15,828.26 | $ 31,656.52 | $ 19,188.86 | $ 38,377.72 | $ 19,060.00 | $ 38,120.00
City MPG: 19|City MPG: 19|City MPG: 19
Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90 |Costof Fuel: | $ 2.90 |Cost of Fuel: $ 2.90
ABS: 2|ABS: 2|ABS: 2
NO BID Non-White: 0|Non-White: 0|Non-White: 0 NO BID
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 18,315.79 [Total Fuel Cos| $ 18,315.79 [Total Fuel Cost: | $ 18,315.79
Total
Total Evaluated Evaluated Bid Total Evaluated
Bid : $ 47,972.31 |: $ 54,693.51 |Bid : $ 54,435.79
alternate 6 2010 Dodge Ram 1500
$ 21,03245|$ 42,064.90
City MPG: 14
Costof Fuel: | $ 290 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ABS: 2
Non-White: 0
Total Fuel Cost: | $ 24,857.14
Bid : $ 64,922.04
ITEM 9: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF ONE 2010 Dodge Grand Caravan
(1) SEVEN-PASSENGER VAN WITH FULL-
WINDOWS. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
1 $ 25,598.94 | $ 25,598.94
ITEM 10: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Express
ONE (1) 9,500 LBS. GVWR CARGO VAN, NO BID 2011 Ford E350 SD Van 2011 Ford E350 2011 Ford E350 S3E CG33405
EXTENDED LENGTH.
1 $ 28,590.57 | $ 28,590.57 | $ 31,631.68 | $ 31,631.68 | $ 31,420.00 | $ 31,420.00 | $30,165.00 | $ 30,165.00




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
ITEM 11: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
ONE (1) CARGO VAN, SIMILAR TO FORD E- 2011 Ford E150 Van 2011 Ford E250 2011 Ford E25 (E2E)
250, CHEVROLET EXPRESS, OR THEIR NO BID NO BID
EQUIVALENT
1 $ 25,085.86 | $ 25,085.86 | $ 29,497.79 | $ 29,497.79 | $ 29,720.00 | $ 29,720.00
ITEM 12: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Express
TWO (2) 8,500 LBS. GVWR CARGO VAN. NO BID 2011 Ford E150 Van 2011 Ford E150 2011 FORD E150 (E1E) CG33405
2 $ 24,735.07 | $ 49,470.14 | $ 27,696.21 [ $ 55,392.42 | $ 27,100.00 | $ 54,200.00 | $30,347.00 | $ 60,694.00
ITEM 13: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford E350 Van 2011 Ford E350 2011 E350 (E3E 2011 Chevrolet Express
THREE (3) 9,500 LBS. GVWR CARGO VAN
WITH SLIDE-DOWN LADDER RACK AND NO BID
CARGO PARTITION.
3 $ 30,060.72 | $ 90,182.16 | $ 34,227.46 | $ 102,682.38 | $ 33,480.00 [ $ 100,440.00 | $36,388.00 | $ 109,164.00
ITEM 14: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford E150 Van 2011 Ford E150 2011 FORD E150 (E1E) 2011 Chevrolet Express
ONE (1) 8,500 LBS. GVWR CARGO VAN. NO BID
1 $ 24,097.38 | $ 24,097.38 [ $ 26,577.01| $ 26,577.01 | $ 25,540.00 | $ 25,540.00 | $26,886.00 | $ 26,886.00
ITEM 15: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Colorado
THREE (3) PICKUP TRUCKS WITH EXTENDED 2010 Dodge Dakota 2011 Ford Ranger 4 Dr 4X4 2011 Ford Ranger 2011 FORD RANGER (R4F) CT15653
CAB, 4 -DOOR, 4WD AS SPECIFIED
HEREINAFTER.
3 $ 35,020.93 | $ 105,062.79 | $ 31,899.05 | $ 95,697.15| $ 35,406.22 | $ 106,218.66 | $ 35,597.00 [ $ 106,791.00 [ $36,540.00 | $ 109,620.00

ITEM 16: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
ONE (1) ONLY, 2010 MODEL, TRUCK WITH 60"

2010 Dodge Dakota Crew Cab

2010 Ford Explorer Sport Trac

2011 Ford Ranger 4 Door
Supercab

2011 Chevrolet Coloraddo CS
15343




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price Total
TO 65” BED, CREW CAB, 2WD, GVWR NO BID
BETWEEN 5,000 AND 6,010 LBS.
1 $ 24,101.56 | $ 24,101.56 | $ 24,693.76 | $ 24,693.76 | $ 23,771.19 | $ 23,771.19 $25,155.00 | $ 25,155.00
ITEM 17: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
TWO (2) MINIMUM 8,650 LBS. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
UTILITY BODY, 2WD, SRW, LADDER RACK
AND LIFT GATE. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS.
GVWR.
2 $ 37,359.15 | $ 74,718.30 | $ 33,280.09 | $ 66,560.18 | $ 34,166.80 | $ 68,333.60 | $ 37,842.00 | $ 75,684.00 | $39,815.00 | $ 79,630.00
ITEM 18: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
TWO (2) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 F2B CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
UTILITY BODY, 4WD, SRW, LADDER RACK
AND LIFT GATE. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS.
GVWR.
2 $ 36,790.56 | $ 73,581.12 | $ 34,131.48 | $ 68,262.96 | $ 37,360.30 | $ 74,720.60 | $ 40,592.00 | $ 81,184.00 | $41,709.00 | $ 83,418.00
ITEM 19: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2010 Dodge Ram Crew Cab 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,800 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 6 2500 2011 Ford F250 Crew Cab 2011 Ford F250 W2A 2011 Ford F250 W2A CC20903
MAN CREW CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 80"
PICKUP BODY, CROSS BED TOOL BOX, 2WD,
SRW. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS. GVWR.
1 $ 30,495.28 | $ 30,495.28 | $ 28,680.24 | $ 28,680.24 [ $ 30,24491 | $ 30,24491 | $ 31,754.00 | $ 31,754.00 | $36,252.00 | $ 36,252.00
ITEM 20: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, NO BID 2011 Ford F250 Super Cab Ford F250 X2A 2011 Ford F250 X2A CC20903




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total Unit Price Total
EXTENDED CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 80"
PICKUP BODY, 2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED
10,000 LBS. GVWR.
1 $ - $ 30,585.50 | $ 30,585.50 [ $ 29,033.76 [ $ 29,033.76 | $ 33,433.00|$ 33,433.00 $36,873.00| $ 36,873.00
ITEM 21: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY ONE (1) 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 Crew Cab 2011 Ford F250 F2A 2011 Ford F250 FA CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8
PICKUP BODY, 2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED
10,000 LBS. GVWR.
1 $ 26,903.65|% 26,903.65|% 24,556.57 | $ 24,556.57 [ $ 30,129.96 |$ 30,129.96|$ 33,719.00| $ 33,719.00 [ $35,123.00| $ 35,123.00
ITEM 22: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 F25 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8
PICKUP BODY, LIFT GATE, TWO-WAY RADIO,
2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS.
GVWR.
1 $ 35357.05(% 35357.05|% 31,716.22 | $ 31,716.22 [ $ 33,392.45|$% 33,39245|$% 38,814.00|$ 38,814.00 [ $38,072.00 | $  38,072.00
ITEM 23: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
PICKUP BODY, LIFT GATE, 2WD, SRW. NOT
TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS. GVWR.
1 $ 3102512 (3% 31,025.12|$ 27,155.49 | $ 27,155.49 [ $ 28,585.45|$% 28,585.45|$% 31,130.00|$ 31,130.00 | $33,360.00 | $  33,360.00




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Interpacific Motors Inc

Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total
ITEM 24: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
PICKUP BODY, LIFT GATE, 2WD, SRW. NOT
TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS. GVWR.
1 $ 30639.78|$ 30,639.78|$ 27,478.98|$ 27,478.98 | $ 28,308.53|$ 28,308.53|$ 30,964.00 [ $  30,964.00 | $33,082.00| $  33,082.00
ITEM 25: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
FOUR (4) MIMIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 F2011 Ford F250 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
PICKUP BODY, CROSS BED TOOL BOX, LIFT
GATE, 2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000
LBS. GVWR.
4 $ 30,405.75|%$ 121,623.00($  26,735.07|$  106,940.28 [ $ 28,246.87 |$ 112987.48|$ 29,880.00 [ $ 119,520.00 [ $32,333.00 [ $ 129,332.00
ITEM 26: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Chevrolet Silverado
ONE (1) MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR TRUCK, 2010 Dodge Ram 2500 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F250 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A CC20903
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 8’
PICKUP BODY, CROSS BED TOOL BOX, LIFT
GATE, 2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000
LBS. GVWR.
1 $ 31,68271|$% 3168271|$% 27,448.86 | $ 2744886 | $ 28,61262|$ 2861262 |$% 30,527.00[$ 30,527.00 | $33,102.00 | $  33,102.00

ITEM 27: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
ONE (1) ONLY, MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR

2010 Dodge Ram 2500

2011 Ford F250

2011 Ford F250 F2A

20111 Ford F250 F2A

2011 Chevrolet Silverado
CC20903




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU
BID ABSTRACT
SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES

BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM

Qty

Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge

Cutter Ford

Honolulu Ford, Inc.

Interpacific Motors Inc
dba Orchid Isle Auto Center

Rainbow Chevrolet

Unit Price Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price

Total

Unit Price Total

TRUCK, STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH
8’ PICKUP BODY, 2WD, SRW, LIFT GATE AND
JUMPER SYSTEM. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000
LBS. GVWR.

$ 31,638.73|$ 31,638.73

$ 27,702.90

27,702.90

$ 28,507.08 | $

28,507.08

$  31,920.00

$  31,920.00

$33,335.00 | $  33,335.00

ITEM 28: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
ONE (1) ONLY, MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR
TRUCK, STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH
8’ PICKUP BODY, HEADBOARD, LIFT GATE,
2WD, SRW. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000 LBS.
GVWR.

2010 Dodge Ram 2500

$ 30,837.68| % 30,837.68

2011 Ford F250

$ 27,676.95

27,676.95

$ 2841721 ($

F2011 Ford F250 F2A

28,417.21

2011 Ford F250

$  30,479.00

F2A

$ 30,479.00

2011 Chevrolet Silverado
CC20903

$33,345.00 [ $  33,345.00

ITEM 29: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
FOUR (4) EACH, MINIMUM 8,650 LB. GVWR
TRUCK, EXTENDED CAB AND CHASSIS WITH
8' PICKUP BODY, 2WD, SRW, LIFT GATE AND
JUMPER SYSTEM. NOT TO EXCEED 10,000
LBS. GVWR.

NO BID

2011 Ford F250

$ 30,167.00

120,668.00

$ 28,611.58

2011 Ford F250 F2A

$ 114,446.32

2011 Ford F250

$  33,420.00

X2A

$ 133,680.00

2011 Chevrolet Silverado
CC20903

$35,375.00 [ $ 141,500.00

ITEM 30: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF
FOUR (4) ONLY, 10,000 LB. GVWR TIRE
SERVICE TRUCK WITH LOW PROFILE 9’
STEEL TIRE SERVICE BODY; CHASSIS
MOUNTED ROTARY SCREW COMPRESOR
AND 1,250 LB. CAPACITY LIFTGATE; 2WD;
SRW.

NO BID

2011 Ford F350

$ 65,771.18

263,084.72

NO BID

2011 Ford F350

$  75,397.00

F3A

$ 301,588.00

NO BID




CITY & COUNTY OF HONOLULU

BID ABSTRACT

SOLICITATION NO. RFB-BFS-182823

DESCRIPTION: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES
BID OPENING: MAY 14, 2010 AT 2:00 P.M. HST

AMENDED 5/25/2010

BID ITEM Interpacific Motors Inc
Qty Cutter Chrysler Jeep Dodge Cutter Ford Honolulu Ford, Inc. dba Orchid Isle Auto Center Rainbow Chevrolet
UnitPrice |  Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total Unit Price | Total

ITEM 31: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford F250 2011 Ford F350 F2A 2011 Ford F250 F2A
TWO (2) ONLY, NEW REGULAR CAB, SRW
WITH UTILITY CHASSIS ONE (1) TON NO BID NO BID
TRUCKS.

2 $ 37,459.84 | $ 74,919.68 | $ 39,640.72 | $ 79,281.44 | $ 41,627.00 | $ 83,254.00
ITEM 32: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350 4X4 Chassis 2011 Ford F350 F3A 2011 Ford F350 F3H
NINE (9) ONLY, 11,500 LB. GVWR, REGULAR
CAB AND CHASSIS, 4WD, DRW, LADDER NO BID
RACK AND 108" SERVICE BODY.

9 $ 53,950.76 | $ 485,556.84 | $ 49,655.16 | $ 446,896.44 | $ 56,102.60 | $ 504,923.40( $ 52,846.00 | $ 475,614.00
ITEM 33: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350 2011 Ford F350 F3G 2011 Ford F350 F3G
ONE (1) ONLY, 11,500 LB. GVWR, REGULAR
CAB AND CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, LADDER NO BID
RACK AND 108" SERVICE BODY.

1 $ 48,336.11 | $ 48,336.11 | $ 4432404 | $ 44,324.04 | $ 49,700.93 | $ 49,70093 | $ 47,382.00 | $ 47,382.00
ITEM 34: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY ONE (1) 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 FAG 2011 Ford F450 FAG
15,000 LB. GVWR, STANDARD CAB AND
CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, 148" FLATBED WITH NO BID NO BID
STAKE SIDES AND LIFTGATE.

1 $ 4720639 |$  47,206.39 | $ 52,666.64|$ 52,666.64|$ 50,456.00|$  50,456.00
ITEM 35: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY TWO 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 F4G 2011 Ford F450 F4G
(2) 15,000 LB. GVWR, STANDARD CAB AND
CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, 148" FLATBED WITH NO BID NO BID
STAKE SIDES AND LIFTGATE.

2 $ 47,989.69 | $ 95,979.38 | $ 53,467.11 | $ 106,934.22 | $ 51,243.00 | $ 102,486.00
ITEM 36 FURNISHING AND DELIVERY ONE (1) 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 FAG 2011 Ford F450 FAG
15,000 LB. GVWR, STANDARD CAB AND
CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, 12’ FLATBED WITH NO BID NO BID
STAKE SIDES. 1 $  45655.04|$ 4565504 |$ 5041571|$ 5041571 |$  48,941.00|$  48,941.00
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ITEM 38: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY TWO 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 F4G 2011 Ford F450 F4G
(2) 15,000 LB. GVWR, STANDARD CAB AND
CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, 10’ FLATBED, STAKE NO BID NO BID
SIDES AND LIFTGATE.
2 $ 45,063.86 | $ 90,127.72 | $ 54,808.89 | $ 109,617.78 | $ 48,962.00 | $ 97,924.00
ITEM 39: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 F4G
TWO (2) ONLY, 15,000 LB. GVWR, STANDARD
CAB AND CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, 10’ FLATBED,
STAKE SIDES, 350 GALLON WATER TANK NO BID NO BID NO BID
W/PUMP AND 1250 LB. CAPACITY LIFTGATE.
2 $ 56,067.52 | $ 112,135.04 $ 66,374.00 | $ 132,748.00
ITEM 40: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY THREE 2011 Ford F450
(3) 15,000 LB. GVWR 4-DOOR CREW CAB AND
CHASSIS WITH SERVICE BODY & CANOPY. NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 $ 62,219.87 | $ 186,659.61
ITEM 41: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford F450 Ford F450 W4G
ONE (1) ONLY, 15,000 LB. GVWR, CREW CAB
AND CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, MATERIAL (PIPE) NO BID NO BID NO BID
RACK AND 108" SERVICE BODY.
1 $ 62,744.32 | $ 62,744.32 $ 64,708.00 | $ 64,708.00
ITEM 42: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 W4G 2011 Ford F450 W4G
ONE (1) ONLY, 15,000 LB. GVWR, CREW CAB
AND CHASSIS, 2WD, DRW, MATERIAL (PIPE) NO BID NO BID
RACK AND 108" SERVICE BODY.
1 $ 60,344.28 | $ 60,344.28 | $ 65,713.47 | $ 65,713.47 | $ 64,421.00 | $ 64,421.00

ITEM 43: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF

2011 Ford F450 (F46)
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TWO (2) ONLY, 15,000 LBS. GVWR TRUCK
CAB & CHASSIS WITH FIBERGLASS SERVICE
BODY AND 35 FT. TELESCOPIC NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ARTICULATING AERIAL DEVICE.
2 $ 114,034.00| $ 228,068.00
ITEM 44: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Ford F450 2011 Ford F450 F4AG
ONE (1) ONLY, 15,000 LB. GVWR TRUCK CAB
AND CHASSIS WITH AIR COMPRESSOR, NO BID NO BID NO BID
SERVICE BODY AND CRANE. 1 $ 58,763.41 | $ 58,763.41 $ 66,432.00 [ $ 66,432.00
ITEM 45: FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 2011 Dodge Ram 3500 2011 Ford F350
ONE (1) MINIMUM 12, 400 LB. GVWR TRUCK,
STANDARD CAB AND CHASSIS WITH 12’ NO BID NO BID NO BID
TRAFFIC CONE BODY, 2WD, DRW.
1 $ 70,384.24 | $ 70,384.24 | $ 53,740.82 | $ 53,740.82




