
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-257602             DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  NOVEMBER 18, 2009

For the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC
SIGNAL EQUIPMENT for the twelve-month ACT ONE EXCELLENCE PHOENIX SHAH
beginning January 1, 2010 and ending COMMUNICATIONS, OPTO. GEXPRO PACIFIC, INC. &
December 31, 2010 to the Department of INC. INC. ASSOCIATES
Transportation Services, City and County 
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. MODEL 332A CONTROLLER CABINET

Bid Price Unit 3 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $14,950.00 $14,760.00
Total $44,850.00 $44,280.00

Brand and No.: MTS 170E+332 Safetran 170/332

2. CCTV TRAFFIC CAMERA ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $4,804.00 NO BID

Total $120,100.00
Brand and No.: Pelco ES31

3. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING ELBOW
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.50

Total $3,300.00
Brand and No.: TSH-0174F

4. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING SHURLOCK TEE
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $24.95

Total $4,990.00
Brand and No.: TSH-0205F

5. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING REAMED TEE
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.05

Total $2,810.00
Brand and No.: TSH-0202F
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ACT ONE EXCELLENCE PHOENIX SHAH
COMMUNICATIONS, OPTO. GEXPRO PACIFIC, INC. &

INC. INC. ASSOCIATES

ITEM
NO.
6. ADA PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON 

ASSEMBLY W/HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 300 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $115.20 $112.15

Total $34,560.00 $33,645.00
Brand and No.: DCC Polara BDLM2X

57H+VRS+4EVR120

7. MODEL 400 MODEM BOARD
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $212.00 $198.00

Total $10,600.00 $9,900.00
Brand and No.: GDI #400/1200B PDC Model 400

8. TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE POST-TOP 
ADAPTER WITH FOUR SIDE PORTS
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $86.10 $82.50

Total $8,610.00 $8,250.00
Brand and No.: Pelco Traffic Parts 4-way

 #SE3176/SE0316 PT

9. STAINLESS STEEL 100A METER SOCKET
WITH BREAKER
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID NO BID $1,284.16 $1,402.00 NO BID

Total $32,104.00 $35,050.00
Brand and No.: B-Line 214MTB/50 SS B-Line #214MTBSS

(Cooper)

10. BIMODAL LEFT-TURN SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID NO BID $157.07 $159.85 $193.00

Total $7,853.50 $7,992.50 $9,650.00
Brand and No.: GE DR6-ECA6-01A Dialight Duralight

430-6370-1 MTS-TP10 JXJ-300 VIYGA
Series Housing
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INC. INC. ASSOCIATES

ITEM
NO.
11. 12 INCH RED LED RETROFIT TRAFFIC

SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $49.00 $37.50 $45.96 $45.25 $51.00

Total $4,900.00 $3,750.00 $4,596.00 $4,525.00 $5,100.00
Brand and No.: Act One, T1-12R-4 Excellence Opto. Inc. GE DR6-RTFB-20A-22 Dialight Duralight

TRV-R12SG-D27 433-1210-003 JXC300-CAR

12. 12 INCH YELLOW LED RETROFIT 
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $63.00 $56.30 $55.13 $54.10 $59.00

Total $6,300.00 $5,630.00 $5,513.00 $5,410.00 $5,900.00
Brand and No.: Act One, T1-12A-1 Excellence Opto. Inc. GE DR6-YTFB-20A-22 Dialight Duralight

TRV-Y12SG-D2T 433-3230-001 JXC300-CAY

13. 12 INCH GREEN LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $85.00 $50.20 $93.08 $67.70 $92.00

Total $8,500.00 $5,020.00 $9,308.00 $6,770.00 $9,200.00
Brand and No.: Act One, T1-12G-1 Excellence Opto. Inc. GE DR6-GCFB-20A-22 Dialight Duralight

TRV-G12SG-D2T 433-2220-001 JXC300-CAG

14. TRAFFIC SIGNAL VISOR
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.95 $18.25

Total $3,590.00 $3,650.00
Brand and No.: MTS-M19267 IDC

15. 210 CONFLICT MONITOR
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $338.25 $395.00

Total $16,912.50 $19,750.00
Brand and No.: EDI 210E EDI Model 210
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NO.
16. SINGLEMODE VIDEO RECEIVER AND 

DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,120.45 NO BID

Total $4,481.80
Brand and No.: 1FS-VR1930WDM

17. SINGLEMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER 
AND DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,120.45 NO BID

Total $4,481.80
Brand and No.: 1FS-VT1930WDM

18. ORNAMENTAL CAP FOR TRAFFIC
SIGNAL FIXTURES
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.22 $4.85

Total $422.00 $485.00
Brand and No.: Pelco SE-0361 Traffic Parts 6028G

19. COUNTDOWN LED PEDESTRIAN 
SIGNAL MODULE
TRANSCIEVER
Bid Price Unit 300 Each $202.00 $144.50 $232.69 $200.10 $196.00

Total $60,600.00 $43,350.00 $69,807.00 $60,030.00 $58,800.00
Brand and No.: Act One, Excellence Opto. Inc. GE PS7-CFF1-26A Dialight Duralight

TP-16WPC-2S TRP-C45D3154C10 430-6479-001* JXM-400VIEIL

20. MULTIMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER / 
DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $963.35 NO BID

Total $3,853.40
Brand and No.: 1FS VT1920WDM
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NO.
21. MULTIMODE VIDEO RECEIVER/DATA 

TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $963.35 NO BID

Total $3,853.40
Brand and No.: 1FS VR1920WDM

22. LED VEHICLE TRAFFIC SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $357.10 $395.00

Total $35,710.00 $39,500.00
Brand and No.: MTS-TP30 Series Peck 3-Section 

Housing Dialight Poly
LED Lamps

23. RED LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY 
LAMP
Bid Price Unit 300 Each NO BID $54.00 $61.52 $54.95 $73.00

Total $16,200.00 $18,456.00 $16,485.00 $21,900.00
Brand and No.: Electro-Tech GE-DR3-RCFB-01A Dialight ET PV18X10RD

PV18X10RD P463R33-003

24. YELLOW LED PROGRAMMED 
VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID $55.00 $61.52 $57.60 $73.00

Total $2,750.00 $3,076.00 $2,880.00 $3,650.00
Brand and No.: Electro-Tech GE DR3-YCFB-01A Dialight ET PV18X10YL

PV18X10YL P463Y33003

25. GREEN LED PROGRAMMED 
VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID $75.00 $118.67 $99.75 $122.00

Total $3,750.00 $5,933.50 $4,987.50 $6,100.00
Brand and No.: Electro-Tech GE DR3-GCFB-01A Dialight ET PV30X6BG

PV30X6BG P463G33003



PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-257602
Page 6

ACT ONE EXCELLENCE PHOENIX SHAH
COMMUNICATIONS, OPTO. GEXPRO PACIFIC, INC. &

INC. INC. ASSOCIATES

ITEM
NO.
26. AUDIO PEDESTRIAN BUTTON

Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $228.95 NO BID
Total $22,895.00

Brand and No.: Pelco SE2039

27. MODEL 242 DC ISOLATOR
LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $33.05 $38.50

Total $3,305.00 $3,850.00
Brand and No.: PDC #242 PDC Model 242

28. MODEL 242 DC ISOLATOR
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $22.90 $28.00

Total $2,290.00 $2,800.00
Brand and No.: PDC #200 PDC Model 200

29. MODEL 170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 75 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,323.60 $1,290.00

Total $99,270.00 $96,750.00
Brand and No.: MTS 170E Dynatrol Model

w/o Software 170E

30. PEDESTRIAN TRAFFIC SIGNAL 
HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 300 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $105.10 $103.00

Total $31,530.00 $30,900.00
Brand and No.: MTS M64648 Peek 4302, Poly

w/Alum Door
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31. TRAFFIC SIGNAL BULB

Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.25 NO BID
Total $225.00

Brand and No.: Hytron 
#100A21KTSR3

(Min order=120 ea.
or 1 carton)

32. FLASH TRANSFER RELAY
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $20.05 $35.10

Total $2,005.00 $3,510.00
Brand and No.: MTS #430 (M-11556) PDC Model FTR-91

33. LOCAL FIRMWARE W/EPROM FOR 170 
CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 50 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,105.00 NO BID

Total $55,250.00
Brand and No.: MTS #233/S-233RV

34. 3 SECTION STANDARD BAND ASTRO-
BRACKET ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $128.55 $133.00

Total $3,213.75 $3,325.00
Brand and No.: Pelco AB-0116-3-29 Traffic Parts

EZBRC-346
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35. 4 SECTION STANDARD BAND ASTRO-

BRACKET ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 10 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $135.95 $138.00

Total $1,359.50 $1,380.00
Brand and No.: Pelco AB011G-4-29 Traffic Parts 

EZBRC-361

36. PROGRAM BAND ASTRO-BRACKET 
ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 25 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $191.05 $195.00

Total $4,776.25 $4,875.00
Brand and No.: Pelco AB-0152-3-29 Traffic Parts

EZBRC-4MM

37. TYPE 1 - SIGNAL LOOP CABLE, IMSA 
20-1 CERTIFIED, 1000 LINEAR FOOT 
PER REEL
Bid Price Unit 10 REELS NO BID NO BID NO BID $3,166.00 NO BID

Total $31,660.00
Brand and No.: Falcon

#98261420-1-0-1R
(Footage is 1000 ft./

38. 10 FEET TRAFFIC SIGNAL STANDARD Reel +/- 10%)
HOT DIPPED GALVANIZED, WITH 
FOUR 1 1/4 INCH MOUNTING HOLES
Bid Price Unit 100 Each NO BID NO BID NO BID $382.00 NO BID

Total $38,200.00
Brand and No.: Ameron, Type I


