
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DFM-239915 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - PURCHASING DIVISION
OPENED:  NOVEMBER 13, 2009

For the furnishing of CRUSHED ROCK AND SAND for a twelve-month
period beginning January 1, 2009 and ending December 31, 2009 AMERON INTERNATIONAL CORP. GRACE PACIFIC HAWAIIAN CEMENT
to the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii DBA AMERON HAWAII CORPORATION  
ITEM

PLANT: Kapaa Quarry (KO) Sand Island (SI) Makakilo Quarry Campbell Industrial Halawa
Kailua, Oahu Sand Island, Oahu 91-920 Farrington Hwy. & Park (CIP) 99-1100 Halawa

LOCATION: Palehua Road (Mauka) 91-055 Kaomi Loop Valley Street
2010 KO 2010 SI Kapolei, HI 96707 Aiea, HI 96701

Grade "A: Crushed Rock EFF 01/01-12/31 EFF 01/01-12/31 Lower Quarry Upper Quarry CIP Halawa
1. Surge $42.34 $39.48 NO BID NO BID

#4217
2. No. 2 Coarse $41.95 $39.01 NO BID NO BID

#4205
3. No. 3 Coarse $36.95 $51.93 $34.45 NO BID $32.57

#4201
4. No. 3 Medium NO BID NO BID NO BID

5. No. 3 Fine $36.95 $51.93 $34.45 NO BID $34.56
#4211

6. Chips-Gravel $41.95 $56.86 $39.01 NO BID $35.60
#4208

7. Commercial No. 4 $45.53 $39.48 NO BID $37.70
#4204

Grade "B" Crushed Rock #4 ASPHALT FINES
8. Crusher Run 1-½" (C&C Base Coarse) $33.36 $31.10 NO BID $32.25

#4012
Borrow Material

9. Crusher Waste $21.42 $20.42 NO BID $23.72
#4005 SELECT BORROW

10. Bone Material NO BID NO BID NO BID

Crushed Limestone
11. Crusher Run 1-½" NO BID NO BID NO BID

Sand
12. Natural Beach (Golf Course) NO BID NO BID NO BID

13. Natural Beach or Manufactured (Construction) $71.16 $86.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID
#6031 CONCRETE SAND

14. Sandblast Sand $95.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID
#6022

15. Masonry Sand $69.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID
#6032

16. Silica Sand NO BID $136.13 NO BID
16a. Silica Sand #60

$136.13
16b. 21-30 Silica

$159.07
Molokai Cinderlite

17. Molokai Cinderlite 3/8 Fine NO BID NO BID NO BID

Volcanic Cinder
18. Crushed Volcanic Cinder NO BID NO BID $106.81

19. Top Soil (Screened) NO BID NO BID NO BID


