Abstract
Furnish and Deliver 24 Vehicles to the City and County of Honolulu

Bid Opening: May 22, 2009

Item = Total Rainbow Cutter
No. Qty Description Hon. Ford Chevrolet Servco Dodge Orchid Isle Cutter Ford Tony Group
Compact Chevrolet Toyota 1838
Sedan 4- Ford Focus Cobailt LT Corolla LE Ford Focus Ford Focus Honda Civic
1. 4 door 2010 2010 2010 NO BID 2010 2010 LX 2009
Unit Price $18,174.36 $20,935.00 $21,570.67 ’ $17,994.64 $18,181.15 $18,853.08
Total $72,697.44 $83,740.00 $86,282.68 $71,978.56 $72,724.60 $75,412.32
Compact
Hatchback / Dodge Ford Escape Ford Escape Honda Fit
2. 1 Crossover NO BID NO BID NO BID Caliber 2010 2010 2010 Base 2009
Unit Price $22,197.90 $23,161.39 $21,558.87 $16,841.98
Total $22,197.90 $23,161.39 $21,558.87 $16,841.98
id Size Toyota Dodge
Sedan 4- Ford Fusion Chevrolet Camry LE Avenger Ford Fusion Ford Fusion Honda
3. 4 door 2010 Malibu 2010 SXT 2010 2010 2010 Accord LX
Unit Price $26,936.68 $31,420.00 $33,516.22 $27,254.54 $26,788.89 $25,876.22 $21,735.01
Total $107,746.72 $125,680.00  $134,064.88  $109,018.16 $107,155.56  $103,504.88 $86,940.04
Dodge
Grand Honda
Minivan 7- Caravan SE Odyssey LX
4, 2 Passenger NO BID NO BID NO BID 2010 NO BID Ford Flex 2010 2009
Unit Price $27,112.03 $30,198.42 $26,328.90
Total $54,224.06 $60,396.84 $52,657.80




compact

Sport Utility
Vehicle Dodge Nitro Ford Escape Ford Escape Honda CRV
(SUV) NO BID NO BID NO BID SE 2010 2010 2010 2WD 2009
Unit Price $23,097.37 $25,611.40 $23,716.99 . $21,974.88
Total $115,486.85  $128,057.00  $118,584.95 $109,874.40
AYDITa
Compact
Sport Utility
Vehicle Ford Escape Ford Escape
(SUV) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Hybrid 2010 Hybrid 2010 NO BID
Unit Price $40,178.11 $41,009.20
Total $40,178.11 $41,009.20
Compact 4-
Wheel Drive
(4WD)Sport
Utility Jeep Liberty Ford Escape Ford Escape 4- Honda CRV
Vehicle Sport 4x4 4-Wheel Drive Wheel Drive LX 4WD
(SUV) NO BID NO BID NO BID 2010 (4WD) 2010 (4WD) 2010 2009
Unit Price $27,109.36 $27,279.84 $25,905.47 $22,998.65
Total $54,218.72 $54,559.68 $51,810.94 $45,997.30

Ford Chevrolet

Econoline Express CG Ford E150 " Ford E150
Cargo Vans E150 E14 2010 NO BID NO BID 2009/2010 2009 NO BID
Unit Price $24,723.37 $28,570.00 $23,655.40 $24,102.25
Total $49,446.74 $57,140.00 $47,310.80 $48,204.50




8,800 Ibs.

GVWR
Truck cab
and Chassis Chevrolet Dodge Ram
iw 8 ft PIU Ford F250 Silverado 250 Reg Cab Ford F250 Ford F250 4x2
0. body F2A 2010 NO BID 2010 2010 RC (F20) 2009 NO BID
Unit Price $31,899.30 $37,950.00 $32,529.83 $34,617.50 $31,651.30
Total $63,798.60 $75,900.00 $65,059.66 $69,235.00 $63,302.60
Tompact
Sport Utility
Vehicle Dodge Nitro Ford Escape Ford Escape Honda CRV
10. (SUV) NO BID NO BID NO BID SE 2010 2010 2010 2WD 2009
Unit Price $28,885.85 $31,333.02 $28,476.21 $21,974.88
Total $57,771.70 $62,666.04 $56,952.42 $43,949.76




