PROPOSAL NO. RFB-ESD-0900151
REQN NO. RQM-ESD-0900046
OPENED: March 12, 2009

By: RM & GT

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of
MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii

GROUP I. GLOVES, DISPOSABLE
LATEX - AMBIDEXTROUS

1) Small size; Approved Brand or equal:
Microflex Ultra One, Model No. UL-315-S
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
X 26,500 pairs =

2) Medium size; Approved Brand or equal:
Microflex Ultra One, Model No. UL-315-M
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 42,750 pairs =

3) Large size; Approved Brand or equal:
Microflex Ultra One, Model No. UL-315-L
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 53,500 pairs =

Bound Tree
Medical LLC

Comade, Inc.

GP Roadway
Solutions, Inc.

Magid Glove &
Safety MFG Co LLC **

** Bid Withdrawn

Rescue Safety
Pacific, Inc.

Safety Systems
Hawaii,Inc.

Microflex Ultra One
#290315
$0.338
$8,957.00

Microflex Ultra One
#290316
$0.338
$14,449.50

Microflex Ultra One
#290317
$0.338
$18,083.00

Microflex

UL-315-S
$0.348
$9,222.00

Microflex

UL-315-M
$0.348
$14,877.00

Microflex

UL-315-M
$0.348
$18,618.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-S
$0.50
$13,250.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-M
$0.50
$21,375.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-L
$0.50
$26,750.00

Microflex

UL-315-S
$0.1867
$4,947.55

Microflex

UL-315-M
$0.1867
$7,981.425*

Microflex

UL-315-L
$0.1867
$9,988.45

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-S
$0.258
$6,837.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-M
$0.258
$11,029.50

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-L
$0.258
$13,803.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-S
$4.100
$108,650.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-M
$4.100
$175,275.00

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-L
$4.100
$219,350.00
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4) Extra Large size; Approved Brand or equal:
Microflex Ultra One, Model No. UL-315-XL
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 45,750 pairs =

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I

Material Construction:

Length:

Glove Color:

Thickness (mils) - Cuff / Palm / Finger:

Tensile (Mpa) - Before Aging / After Aging:
Elasticity & Elongation - Before Aging / After Aging:
Glove Box Dimensions (inches) - L x W x D:

No. of Gloves/Box and No. of Boxes/Case:

Unit of Purchase for the ltems:

Bound Tree
Medical LLC

Comade, Inc.

GP Roadway
Solutions, Inc.

Magid Glove &
Safety MFG Co LLC **

** Bid Withdrawn

Rescue Safety
Pacific, Inc.

Safety Systems
Hawaii,Inc.

Microflex Ultra One
#290318
$0.338
$15,463.50

$56,953.00

Latex

300 mm/ 11.8in
Natural
7.1/9.8/13.8
21/ 18
750% / 600%
10x10x 15
50/box, 10bx/case
box of 50 only

Microflex
UL-315-XL
$0.348
$15,921.00

$58,638.00

Natural rubber latex,
non-sterile, powder free
11.8in
Natural
7.1/9.8/13.8
21/ 18
750% / 600%
5-1/2 x 3 x 10-1/2
50/box (25 pairs)
case

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-XL
$0.50
$22,875.00

$84,250.00

Premium Quality,
natural rubber latex
11-13/16in
Natural
7.1/9.8/13.8
21/ 18
750% / 600%
5-1/2x 10-1/2 x 3
50/box (25 pr), 10 bx/cs
by box

Microflex
UL-315-XL
$0.1867
$8,541.525*

$31,458.95%

Latex

11 in
Light Yellow
7.1/10/ 15
21/ 18
750% / 600%
5x 10-1/2 x 2-1/2
50/box, 10bx/case
box

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-XL
$0.258
$11,803.50

$43,473.00

Latex

300 mm/ 11.8in
Natural
7.1/9.8/13.8
21 /18
750% / 600%
10x5x3
50/box, 10bx/case
box or case

Microflex Ultra One
UL-315-XL
$4.100
$187,575.00

$690,850.00

Natural rubber latex

300 mm/ 11.8
Natural
7.1/9.8/13.8
21/ 18
750% / 600%
5-1/2 x 10-1/2 x 3
50/box, 10bx/case
box




PROPOSAL NO. RFB-ESD-0900151
REQN NO. RQM-ESD-0900046
OPENED: March 12, 2009

By: RM & GT

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of
MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii

GROUP II. GLOVES, DISPOSABLE
STERLING NITRLE - AMBIDEXTROUS

5) Extra Small size; Approved Brand or equal:
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA, Model No. 53137
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 3,000 pairs =

6) Small size; Approved Brand or equal:
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA, Model No. 53138
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 5,750 pairs =

7) Medium size; Approved Brand or equal:
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA, Model No. 53139
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 20,000 pairs =

Bound Tree Comade, Inc. GP Roadway Magid Glove & Rescue Safety Safety Systems
Medical LLC Solutions, Inc. Safety MFG Co LLC ** Pacific, Inc. Hawaii,Inc.
** Bid Withdrawn
Kimberly Clark Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Kimberly Clark Microflex Ultra Sense EC
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA 53137 53137 53137 USE880XS
#108-53137
$0.22706 $0.358 $0.38 $0.18 $0.17|NO BID
$681.18 $1,074.00 $1,140.00 $540.00 $510.00
Kimberly Clark Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Kimberly Clark Microflex Ultra Sense EC
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA 53138 53138 53138 USE880S
#108-53138
$0.22706 $0.358 $0.38 $0.18 $0.17|NO BID
$1,305.595 $2,058.50 $2,185.00 $1,035.00 $977.50
Kimberly Clark Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Kimberly Clark Microflex Ultra Sense EC
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA 53139 53139 53139 USE880M
#108-53140
$0.22706 $0.358 $0.38 $0.18 $0.17|NO BID
$4,541.20 $7,160.00 $7,600.00 $3,600.00 $3,400.00




PROPOSAL NO. RFB-ESD-0900151
REQN NO. RQM-ESD-0900046
OPENED: March 12, 2009

By: RM & GT

ABSTRACT

OF PROPOSAL
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of
MEDICAL EXAM GLOVES to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii

8) Large size; Approved Brand or equal:
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA, Model No. 53140
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 20,500 pairs =

9) Extra Large size; Approved Brand or equal:
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA, Model No. 53141
Brand and Model (Ordering) No.

Price per
x 5,500 pairs =

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP 11

* Corrected amount, mathematical error

Material Construction:

Length:

Glove Color:

Thickness (mils) - Cuff / Palm / Finger:

Tensile (Mpa) - Before Aging / After Aging:
Elasticity & Elongation - Before Aging / After Aging:
Glove Box Dimensions (inches) - L x W x D:

No. of Gloves/Box and No. of Boxes/Case:

Unit of Purchase for the Items:

Bound Tree Comade, Inc. GP Roadway Magid Glove & Rescue Safety Safety Systems
Medical LLC Solutions, Inc. Safety MFG Co LLC ** Pacific, Inc. Hawaii,Inc.
** Bid Withdrawn
Kimberly Clark Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Kimberly Clark Microflex Ultra Sense EC
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA 53140 53140 53140 USE880L
#108-53141
$0.22706 $0.358 $0.38 $0.18 $0.17|NO BID
$4,654.73 $7,339.00 $7,790.00 $3,690.00 $3,485.00
Kimberly Clark Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Sterling Nitrile-XTRA Kimberly Clark Microflex Ultra Sense EC
Sterling Nitrile-XTRA 53141 53141 53141 USE880XL
#108-53137
$0.22706 $0.358 $0.38 $0.20 $0.17|NO BID
$1,248.83 $1,969.00 $2,090.00 $1,100.00 $935.00
$12,431.535 $19,600.50* $20,805.00 $9,965.00 $9,307.50
Nitrile Natural rubber latex, [Sterling Nitrile (not made Nitrile Nitrile (Non-Latex)
non-sterile, powder free [from natural rubber latex)
305mm/ 12.0in 11.8 11.8 12 in 295 mm/ 11.4in
White Gray Grey Grey Blue
2.8/3.1/3.5 2.8/3.1/3.5 2.8/3.1/3.5 28/3.1/3.5 31/39/5.1
42 [ 38 43 / 38 42 / 38 42/ 38 18/ 16
650% / 550% 500% / 400% 500% / 400% 650% / 550% 500% / 400%
13x11x11 5-1/2 x 3 x 10-1/2 5-1/2x10-1/2x 3 5-1/2 x 10-1/2 x 3 10x5x3

100/box, 10bx/case

case of 1000 gloves only

50/box (25 pr), 250 pr/cs

box and/or case

100/box (50 pr), 10bx/cs

by box

75 pr/box, 10bx/case
Size XL: 70 pr/box, 10bx/case
by case only

100/box, 10bx/case

box or case




