ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-BFS-0900046
OPENED: September 29, 2008
By: RM & AW

For the furnishing and delivery of LEAD STORAGE BATTERIES to the City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

IBS OF HAWAII

Product Offered:
BCI Group (U-1)
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 36
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 300 300
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 30 33
1) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No SP 35
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 5 Unit $43.93
$219.65
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $1.22
BCI Group 4D
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 36
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 1000 1000
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 320 295
2) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No 4D-XHD
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 31 Unit $122.47
$3,796.57
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $3.40
BCI Group 8D
Regular type battery
Top terminal type
No. of plates per cell 31 31
Length (maximum, no excetions) 21" 21"
Width (maximum, no exceptions) 11 11"
Height, including caps (maximum, 9-3/4" 9 3/4"
no exceptions)
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 40 48
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 1400 1400
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 450 450

Label: Provided with manufacturer/distributor

identification label indicating product
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no., CCA rating, required warning
information, etc.
3) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No 8D-MHD
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 41 Unit $145.51
$5,965.91
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $3.03
BCI Group 8D
Regular type battery
Top terminal type
No. of plates per cell 31
Length 21"
Width 1
Height, max. 9-3/4"
Voltage 12
Minimum Months Warranty 40
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 1400
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 450
Label: Provided with manufacturer/distributor
identification label indicating product
no., CCA rating, required warning
information, etc.
4) Charge and Dry
Battery I.D. No
Battery Brand Name
Bid Price 15 Unit NO BID
BCI Group 8D
Regular type battery
Starting Type Battery
Side terminal, no exceptions, with
Hex nuts 3/8"
No. of plates per cell 31 31
Length (maximum, no excetions) 21" 21
Width (maximum, no exceptions) 11 11
Height, including caps (maximum, 9-3/4" 93/4
no exceptions)
Approx weight:
Wet: 127 1bs 124
Dry: 104 1bs 104
Voltage 12 12
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Minimum Months Warranty 40 48
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 1400 1375
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 450 435
Label: Provided with manufacturer/distributor
identification label indicating product
no., CCA rating, required warning
information, etc.
5) Charge and Wet
[Fill (electrolyte) to indicator level.]
Battery I.D. No U8D1400BUS
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 600 Unit $176.92
$106,152.00
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $3.69
BCI Group 8D - For Fire Apparatus
Regular type battery
Top terminal type
No. of plates per cell 31 31
Length (maximum, no excetions) 21" 21"
Width (maximum, no exceptions) 11.974" 11"
Height, (maximum, no exeptions) 9-3/4" 9 3/4"
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 48 48
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 1400 1400
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 450 450
Label: Provided with manufacturer/distributor
identification label indicating product
no., CCA rating, required warning
information, etc.
6) Charge and Wet
[Fill (electrolyte) to indicator level.]
Battery I.D. No 8D-MHD
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 50 Unit $145.51
$7,275.50
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $3.03
BCI Group 22NF
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 36
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 390 390
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Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 60 62
7) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No SP-22NF
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 5 Unit $50.21
$251.05
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $1.39
BCI Group 24
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 84
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 675 800
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 120 125
8) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No MTP-24
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 8 Unit $82.68
$661.44
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.98
BCI Group 24
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 84
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 800 800
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 125 125
9) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No MTP-24
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 46 Unit $82.68
$3,803.28
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.98

BCI Group 24F

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Voltage 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 600
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 125

10) Charge and Wet
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Battery I.D. No
Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 12 Unit NO BID
BCI Group 24F
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 84
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 800 800
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 125 125
11)Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No MTP-24F
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 159 Unit $82.68
$13,146.12
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.98
BCI Group 26
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 75
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 500 525
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 80 85
12) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No MT-26
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 1 Unit $65.92
$65.92
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.88
BCI Group 27
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 85
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 700 750
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 120 135
13)Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No MTP-27
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 28 Unit $69.11
$1,935.08
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.81
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BCI Group 27F
Regular type battery

Voltage 12 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24 85

Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 700 710

Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 120 165

14) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No MTP-27F

Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE

Bid Price 4 Unit $69.11

$276.44

Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.81

BCI Group 31

For RTS 06 Buses, Chance, Gillig

Etc. Threaded Terminals, Centrally

Located, Approximately an Inch from End.

For Oahu Transit Service.

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Shall be Delco 1150 Series Battery.

DO NOT SUBSTITUTE.

Delco 1150-A will be rejected.

Length 13"

Width 6-4/5"

Height 9-2/5"

Voltage 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24

Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 700

Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 180

Weight 60 lbs

Must have built-in hydrometer

15)Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No

Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 340 Unit NO BID

BCI Group 31
Interstate #31VHD or Equal, Post terminals.

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Length 13"
Width 6-4/5"

Post terminals? Yes

13"
6 3/4"
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Height 9-2/5" 9 3/8"

Voltage 12 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24 36

Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 700 950

Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 160 195

16) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No 31P-MHD

Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE

Bid Price 118 Unit $99.43

$11,732.74

Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $2.76

BCI Group 31

Threaded Terminals, Centrally Located,

Approximately an Inch from End.

Regular type battery.

Length 12-5/8" 13

Width 6-1/2" 6 3/4

Height 8-1/2" 9 3/8"

Voltage 12 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24 36

Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 900 950

Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 160 195

17)Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No 31-MHD

Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE

Bid Price 553 Unit $92.10

$50,931.30

Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $2.56

BCI Group 31

Optima D31T or equivalent

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Length 12-13/16" 12 13/16

Width 6-1/2" 61/2"

Height 9-3/8" 9 3/8"

Voltage 12 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24 24

Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 900 900

Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 155 155
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18)Charge and Dry

Battery I.D. No SC31 DS
Battery Brand Name OPTIMA
Bid Price 30 Unit $176.92
$5,307.60
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $7.37
BCI Group 31
Optima D31M or equivalent
Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.
Length 12-13/16" 12 13/16
Width 6-1/2" 61/2
Height 9-3/8" 9 3/8
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 900 900
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 155 155
19)Ccharge and Dry
Battery I.D. No SC31 DM
Battery Brand Name OPTIMA
Bid Price 20 Unit $176.92
$3,538.40
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $7.37
BCI Group 34
Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 65
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 770 800
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 120 110
20) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No 65-24
Battery Brand Name POWERVOLT
Bid Price 7 Unit $70.86
$496.02
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $1.09
BCI Group 34
Marine Battery, Exide Select
Orbital Sealed VRLA (AGM),
ORB34DC-36,Extra deep cycle
Voltage 12 12
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Minimum Months Warranty 36 36
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 750 750
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 100 120
Length 10-1/8" 10"
Width A 67/8
Height 8" 7 15/16
21)Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No SC34DM
Battery Brand Name OPTIMA
Bid Price 5 Unit $154.10
$770.50
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $4.28
BCI Group 34
800U Optima Battery. DO NOT SUBSTITUTE.
Dual terminals (side & post).
Maintenance-free type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 72 72
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 800 800
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 120 100
Length 9-15/16" 10"
Width 6-1/2" 67/8
Height 7-13/16" 7 13/16
Weight 39.5 1bs 41
22) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No 800U
Battery Brand Name OPTIMA
Bid Price 92 Unit $139.95
$12,875.40
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $1.94
BCI Group 35
Regular type battery for Ford Escort S/W,
Motorcraft BX-35
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 75
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 525 550
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 100 110

23) Charge and Wet
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Battery I.D. No MT-35
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 14 Unit $67.95
$951.30
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $0.91

BCI Group 58

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Voltage 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 525
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 75
Length 9.5"
width 7.2"
Height 6.7"

24) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No

Battery Brand Name
Bid Price 11 Unit NO BID

BCI Group 65
Regular type battery

Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 85
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 850 850
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 160 165

25) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No MTP-65
Battery Brand Name INTERSTATE
Bid Price 152 Unit $89.95
$13,672.40
Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months: $1.06

BCI Group 65

Maintenance-free type battery, completely sealed.

Voltage 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 875
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 165

26) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No
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Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 510 Unit NO BID

BCI Group 74 with Side Mounted Terminals

Regular type battery

Voltage 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ O0°F 620
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 135

27) Charge and Wet
Battery I.D. No

Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 10 Unit NO BID

BCI Group 75

Regular type battery
Voltage 12 12
Minimum Months Warranty 24 75
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 650 650
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 90 93

28) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No
Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 105 Unit

Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months:

MT-75
INTERSTATE
$74.95
$7,869.75
$1.00

BCI Group 78

Regular type battery

IBS 78A-72

Voltage 12

Minimum Months Warranty 24
Cold Crank Performance Amp. @ 0°F 770
Reserve Capacity Minutes @ 80°F 110

29) Charge and Wet

Battery I.D. No
Battery Brand Name

Bid Price 197 Unit

Unit Bid Price Divided by Warranty Months:

12
85
800
110

MTP-78
INTERSTATE
$85.95
$16,932.15
$1.01




