RFB-DPR-0900032
OPENED: SEPTEMBER 19, 2008

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

: FOR
DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM
NO.
1.

For the furnishing of TREE PRUNING
SERVICES IN WAIPIO GENTRY,
HAWAII KAl, AND NORTH SHORE
AREAS, for the Department of Parks
and Recreation

Tree Pruning Services in Waipio Gentry

Bid Price Unit 2,436 trees
Total

Bid Deposit

Tree Pruning Services in Hawaii Kai

Bid Price Unit 3,741 trees
Total

Bid Deposit

Tree Pruning Services in North Shore

Bid Price Unit 926 trees
Total

Bid Deposit

AKAHI ALL TREE GLAD'S H.T.M. JILSS HARLAN T. LOVES PARADISE SMALT & | TREES OF
SERVICES, | SERVICES, | LANDSCAPING { CONTRAC- {CONSTRUC- LANGI LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPE | COMPANY,| HAWAII,
INC. INC. & TREE TORS, INC.| TION, INC. | DBALOCAL CO.INC. MAINTENANCE INC. ‘ INC.
TRIMMING, INC. LANDSCAPING INC.
$122.50 $105.00 $400.00 $64.00 $105.00 . $79.50 $84.45 - $75.98| . $97.75
$298,410.00} $255,780.00 $974,400.00| $155,904.00} $255,780.00 $193,662.00] $205,720.20;  $306,300.00| $185,087.28| $238,119.00
'$14,920.50 5% 5%| $8,405.00 -— 5% 5% 5% 5%] $11,905.95
No Bid $71.25 $350.00 $64.00| No Bid No Bid $58.45 oo $79.80f No Bid
$266,546.25 $1,309,350.00{ $239,424.00 $218,661.45] $589,036.00| $298,531.80
$13,327.31 5%) $14,965.00 5% 5% 5%
No Bid - $143.25 $400.00 $97.00 $120.00 $89.50 $110.00 - $74.98 $98.75
$132,649.50 $370,400.00{ $89,822.00{ $111,120.00 $82,877.00f $101,860.00f $235,615.00| $69,431.48| $91,442.50
5% 5%| $5,001.00] $5,556.00 5% 5% 5% 5%] $4,572.13




