
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15087 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  AUGUST 7, 2007

For the furnishing and delivery of
FUNGICIDES, HERBICIDES, PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
INSECTICIDES AND FERTILIZERS to AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION
the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
Hawaii SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. FUNGICIDES
1. Pentathlon LF or equivalent

Bid Price Unit 75 gallons $20.62 NO BID $21.52
Total $1,546.50 $1,614.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- 2.5 gal SEPRO 

2. Daconil Weather Stik or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 50 cont. $130.71 $171.82 $196.34

Total $6,535.50 $8,591.00 $9,817.00
Brand Name and Number: Mainsail 6.0F Quali-Pro SYNGENTA 

Chlorothalonil 
720 SFT 

3. Insignia or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 15 cont. $371.23 NO BID $364.40

Total $5,568.45 $5,466.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- BASF 

HERBICIDES
4. Sencor 75 Turf or equivalent

Bid Price Unit 70 bags $200.13 $209.67 $194.40
Total $14,009.10 $14,676.90 $13,608.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- Bayer - Sencor BAYER 
75 T & O 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
5. MSMA-6 Plus Surfactant or equivalent

Bid Price Unit 100 gallons $19.48 $18.40 $18.35
Total $1,948.00 $1,840.00 $1,835.00

Brand Name and Number: Turf Max MSMA 6+ Drexel MSMA 2.5 gal. DREXEL 
6 Plus 2.5 gal. 

6. Rodeo or AquaMaster, or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 100 cont. $62.40 $98.58 $88.69

Total $6,240.00 $9,858.00 $8,869.00
Brand Name and Number: Aqua Neat Monsanto AQUAMASTER 

Aquamaster 

7. Glyphosate Plus (generic Roundup Pro) or
equivalent
Bid Price Unit 200 cont. $53.95 $42.13 $43.20

Total $10,790.00 $8,426.00 $8,640.00
Brand Name and Number: Buccaneer Monsanto Honcho HONCHO - 

Plus MONSANTO 

8. Roundup ProDry or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 50 boxes $159.90 $196.95 $181.86

Total $7,995.00 $9,847.50 $9,093.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Monsanto Roundup MONSANTO 

Pro Dry 

9. Chipco Ronstar G or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 50 bags $73.66 $79.00 $70.68

Total $3,683.00 $3,950.00 $3,534.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Bayer Ronstar G BAYER 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
10. ProTurf or equivalent

Bid Price Unit 100 bags $90.92 NO BID NO BID
Total $9,092.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- 

11. Revolver or equivalent
Bid Price Unit 100 cont. $171.71 $173.63 $165.63

Total $17,171.00 $17,363.00 $16,563.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Bayer Revolver BAYER 

INSECTICIDE
12. Dursban Pro or equivalent 2.5 jugs 

Bid Price Unit 5 cont. $98.71 $141.05 $99.48
Total $493.55 $352.63 $497.40

Brand Name and Number: ----- Quali-Pro DOW 
Chlorpyrifos 42.5% 

MISCELLANEOUS
13. Turf Mark or equivalent

Bid Price Unit 120 cont. $63.70 $68.37 $60.20
Total $7,644.00 $8,204.40 $7,224.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- Becker Underwood TURF TRAX - LPI 
Turfmark 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. CONTROLLED-RELEASE FERTILIZER
14. 21-4-11 + S, Fe & Mn

Bid Price Unit 50 bags NO BID NO BID $24.08
Total 14 & 15 $1,204.00

Brand Name and Number: LESCO - AS SPEC 

15. 18-9-18 + FE + Mn
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $45.67 NO BID

Total $9,134.00 15 & 16
Brand Name and Number: ----- 

16. 18-6-12 with polymer coated urea
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $30.09 $24.50

Total $6,018.00 $4,900.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Short Kut 18-6-12 

17. 24-4-16 + Fe
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $28.92 $22.12 $19.53

Total $8,676.00 $6,636.00 $5,859.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Gaviota 24-4-16 SIGNATURE 

18. 22-5-12
Bid Price Unit 500 bags NO BID $26.85 $24.08

Total $13,425.00 $12,040.00
Brand Name and Number: Lebanon 22-5-12 LESCO 21-4-11 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO. 40-lb. bag 
19. 19-3-19 125 bags 

Bid Price Unit 100 bags $45.26 NO BID NO BID
Total $5,657.50 19 & 20

Brand Name and Number: Andersons 
19-3-19DG 

20. 18-2-24
Bid Price Unit 150 bags $37.59 $37.96

Total $5,638.50 $5,694.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Greensking 18-2-24 

21. 22-2-11 with polymer coated urea
Bid Price Unit 300 bags NO BID $23.94 $19.95

Total $7,182.00 $5,985.00
Brand Name and Number: BEST 22-2-11 LESCO 22-2-9 

CONTROLLED-RELEASE FERTILIZER
WITH PRE-EMERGENT HERBICIDE

22. 21-0-20 + 1.38% Oxadiazon
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $60.79 NO BID $45.03

Total $12,158.00 $9,006.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- LESCO 19-2-19 

.95% RONSTAR 

23. 20-4-10 + 1.0% Oxadiazon
Bid Price Unit 300 bags $48.80 $45.17 $45.03

Total $14,640.00 $13,551.00 $13,509.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Lebanon 20-4-10 LESCO 19-2-19 

with 1% Ronstar .95% RONSTAR 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
24. 22-0-10 + 1.0% Oxadiazon

Bid Price Unit 120 bags $52.16 NO BID $45.03
Total $6,259.20 $5,403.60

Brand Name and Number: ----- LESCO 19-2-19 
.95% RONSTAR 

25. 19-0-23 with 1.5% Oxadiazon
Bid Price Unit 50 bags $58.99 $64.95 $45.03

Total $2,949.50 $3,247.50 $2,251.50
Brand Name and Number: ----- Lebanon 19-0-23 LESCO 19-2-19 

with 1.5% Ronstar .95% RONSTAR 

26. 16-6-8 with herbicide and dimension
Bid Price Unit 150 bags $44.03 $41.67 NO BID

Total $6,604.50 $6,250.50
Brand Name and Number: ----- BEST One Shot 

27. Dimension 0.15% Plus Fertilizer 19-0-19
Bid Price Unit 150 bags NO BID NO BID $31.41

Total $4,711.50
Brand Name and Number: LESCO - AS SPEC 

LAWN FERTILIZER
28. 16-8-8

Bid Price Unit 100 bags $19.82 $15.24 NO BID
Total $1,982.00 $1,524.00 28 - 30

Brand Name and Number: ----- Mini Turf 16-8-8 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
29. 22-5-5

Bid Price Unit 250 bags $24.03 $20.52
Total $6,007.50 $5,130.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- Turf Gold 22-5-5 

30. Di-Ammonium Phosphate 18-46-0
Bid Price Unit 100 bags $24.19 $20.28

Total $2,419.00 $2,028.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- Gaviota 18-46-0 

ORGANIC FERTILIZER
31. 5-3-1

Bid Price Unit 100 bags $25.82 NO BID $19.00
Total $2,582.00 31 - 32 $1,900.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- UAP 

32. 6-2-10
Bid Price Unit 200 bags $32.54 NO BID

Total $6,508.00
Brand Name and Number: ----- 

STARTER FERTILIZER
33. 10-30-10

Bid Price Unit 200 bags $18.39 $16.84 $15.34
Total $3,678.00 $3,368.00 $3,068.00

Brand Name and Number: ----- Gaviota 10-30-10 UAP 
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PACIFIC PHOENIX V LLC UAP
AGRICULTURAL dba DISTRIBUTION

SALES & BEI HAWAII INC.
SERVICES, INC.

ITEM
NO.
34. Roundup Pro 40.835 jugs 

Bid Price Unit 50 cont. $98.27 $91.29 $96.49
Total $4,913.50 $3,727.83 $4,824.50

Brand Name and Number: ----- Monsanto - MONSANTO 
Roundup Pro 
Concentrate 


