

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DES-0900102

OPENED: DECEMBER 12, 2008

For the furnishing of COCONUT TREE TRIMMING AND COCONUT TREE REMOVAL SERVICES AT THE NBC AND WAIKIKI SHELL for the Department of Enterprise Services, City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii	ALL TREES SERVICES	ARBORIST SERVICES LLC	HARLAN T. LANGI DBA LOCAL LANDSCAPING	H.T.M. CONTRACTORS, INC.	LOVES LANDSCAPING CO., INC.	SMALT & COMPANY INC.	SUMMITT FORESTS, INC.																																	
1. TRIM AND SHAPE COCONUT TREES AT: Neal S. Blaisdell Center																																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">233</td> <td></td> <td align="right">trees</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Number of Services</td> <td align="right">2</td> <td></td> <td align="right">times</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>		233		trees					Number of Services	2		times																												
	233		trees																																					
Number of Services	2		times																																					
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Bid Price</td> <td align="right">Unit</td> <td align="right">466</td> <td align="right">trees</td> <td align="right">\$11,184.00/service</td> <td align="right">\$33.00</td> <td align="right">\$47.50</td> <td align="right">\$39.95</td> <td align="right">\$64.45</td> <td align="right">\$54.45</td> <td align="right">NO BID</td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">Total</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td align="right">\$22,368.00</td> <td align="right">\$15,378.00</td> <td align="right">\$22,135.00</td> <td align="right">\$18,616.70</td> <td align="right">\$30,033.70</td> <td align="right">\$25,373.70</td> <td align="right">\$0.00</td> </tr> </table>	Bid Price	Unit	466	trees	\$11,184.00/service	\$33.00	\$47.50	\$39.95	\$64.45	\$54.45	NO BID		Total			\$22,368.00	\$15,378.00	\$22,135.00	\$18,616.70	\$30,033.70	\$25,373.70	\$0.00																		
Bid Price	Unit	466	trees	\$11,184.00/service	\$33.00	\$47.50	\$39.95	\$64.45	\$54.45	NO BID																														
	Total			\$22,368.00	\$15,378.00	\$22,135.00	\$18,616.70	\$30,033.70	\$25,373.70	\$0.00																														
2. Waikiki Shell																																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">66</td> <td></td> <td align="right">trees</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">2</td> <td></td> <td align="right">times</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>		66		trees									2		times																									
	66		trees																																					
	2		times																																					
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Bid Price</td> <td align="right">Unit</td> <td align="right">132</td> <td align="right">trees</td> <td align="right">\$3,168.00/service</td> <td align="right">\$33.00</td> <td align="right">\$47.50</td> <td align="right">\$39.95</td> <td align="right">\$64.45</td> <td align="right">\$54.45</td> <td align="right">NO BID</td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">Total</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td align="right">\$6,336.00</td> <td align="right">\$4,356.00</td> <td align="right">\$6,270.00</td> <td align="right">\$5,273.40</td> <td align="right">\$8,507.40</td> <td align="right">\$7,187.40</td> <td align="right">\$0.00</td> </tr> </table>	Bid Price	Unit	132	trees	\$3,168.00/service	\$33.00	\$47.50	\$39.95	\$64.45	\$54.45	NO BID		Total			\$6,336.00	\$4,356.00	\$6,270.00	\$5,273.40	\$8,507.40	\$7,187.40	\$0.00																		
Bid Price	Unit	132	trees	\$3,168.00/service	\$33.00	\$47.50	\$39.95	\$64.45	\$54.45	NO BID																														
	Total			\$6,336.00	\$4,356.00	\$6,270.00	\$5,273.40	\$8,507.40	\$7,187.40	\$0.00																														
3. Removal of Diseased Coconut Trees for the NBC AND Waikiki Shell																																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">1</td> <td></td> <td align="right">tree</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">2</td> <td></td> <td align="right">times</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>		1		tree									2		times																									
	1		tree																																					
	2		times																																					
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Bid Price</td> <td align="right">Unit</td> <td align="right">2</td> <td align="right">tree</td> <td align="right">\$500.00</td> <td align="right">\$325.00</td> <td align="right">\$750.00</td> <td align="right">\$100.00</td> <td align="right">\$1,000.00</td> <td align="right">\$500.00</td> <td align="right">NO BID</td> </tr> <tr> <td></td> <td align="right">Total</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td align="right">\$1,000.00</td> <td align="right">\$650.00</td> <td align="right">\$1,500.00</td> <td align="right">\$200.00</td> <td align="right">\$2,000.00</td> <td align="right">\$1,000.00</td> <td align="right">\$0.00</td> </tr> </table>	Bid Price	Unit	2	tree	\$500.00	\$325.00	\$750.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$500.00	NO BID		Total			\$1,000.00	\$650.00	\$1,500.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$0.00																		
Bid Price	Unit	2	tree	\$500.00	\$325.00	\$750.00	\$100.00	\$1,000.00	\$500.00	NO BID																														
	Total			\$1,000.00	\$650.00	\$1,500.00	\$200.00	\$2,000.00	\$1,000.00	\$0.00																														
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEMS 1 - 3:	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$29,704.00</td> </tr> </table>	\$29,704.00	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$20,384.00</td> </tr> </table>	\$20,384.00	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$29,905.00</td> </tr> </table>	\$29,905.00	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$24,090.10</td> </tr> </table>	\$24,090.10	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$40,541.10</td> </tr> </table>	\$40,541.10	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$33,561.10</td> </tr> </table>	\$33,561.10	<table border="0"> <tr> <td align="right">\$0.00</td> </tr> </table>	\$0.00																										
\$29,704.00																																								
\$20,384.00																																								
\$29,905.00																																								
\$24,090.10																																								
\$40,541.10																																								
\$33,561.10																																								
\$0.00																																								
<table border="0"> <tr> <td>Surety Bond</td> <td align="right">5%</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td align="right">5%</td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Cashier's Check</td> <td></td> </tr> <tr> <td>Legal Tender</td> <td></td> <td align="right">\$1,022.50</td> <td align="right">\$1,500.00</td> <td align="right">\$1,209.00</td> <td></td> <td></td> <td></td> <td align="right">\$1,678.06</td> <td></td> <td></td> </tr> </table>	Surety Bond	5%							5%			Cashier's Check											Legal Tender		\$1,022.50	\$1,500.00	\$1,209.00				\$1,678.06									
Surety Bond	5%							5%																																
Cashier's Check																																								
Legal Tender		\$1,022.50	\$1,500.00	\$1,209.00				\$1,678.06																																