
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-BFS-0900096                              DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 9, 2008

For the furnishing and delivery of COOLANT,
BRAKE FLUID AND BRAKE CLEANER BACON GARLOW ISLAND OIL PACIFIC POWER PENNZOIL
for the six-month period beginning February 1, 2009 UNIVERSAL, PETROLEUM, AND SUPPLY PRODUCTS DISTRIBUTORS
and ending July 31, 2009 to the City and INC. INC. CO., INC. COMPANY OF HAWAII INC.
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.

GROUP I:
1. Ethylene Glycol, Phosphate-Free, Heavy

Duty Coolant, Concentrate. 55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 25 drums $689.53 $988.85 $1,191.57 $682.46 $609.95

Total $17,238.25 $24,721.25 $29,789.25 $17,061.50 $15,248.75
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2741 Chevron, Delo Shell Rotella ELC Old World Service Pro

Extended Life Coolant 9404100055 Industries SPE16707D
#227808 23512139 

2. Ethylene Glyco Coolant, 50/50 Mix, (pre-mix),
Phosphate-Free, Heavy Duty. 55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 36 drums $400.17 $593.19 $620.26 $451.95 $409.20

Total $14,406.12 $21,354.84 $22,329.36 $16,270.20 $14,731.20
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2826 Chevron, Delo Shell Rotella ELC Old World Service Pro

Extended Life Coolant 50/50 9404200055 Industries SPE 16709D
50/50 #227811 23518918 

3. Fleetguard DCA 75L or Equal, 5-gallon
Container
Bid Price Unit 10 containers $80.36  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $803.60 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard DCA75L

4. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, 50/50 Pre-Diluted,
Phosphate Free, 1-gallon container
Bid Price Unit 72 containers $8.53  NO BID $12.06 NO BID $4.98

Total $614.16 $0.00 $868.32 $0.00 $358.56
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleeetguard CC2746 Shell Rotella ELC Service Pro

50/50 9404206021 SPE 16706
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ITEM
NO.

GROUP II:
5. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate.

50/50 Mix, (Pre-Mix), Phosphate-Free,
Heavy Duty, 1-Gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 90 containers $8.53  NO BID  NO BID NO BID $7.56

Total $767.70 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $680.40
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2825 Service Pro

SPE 16709

6. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate.
1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 511 containers $13.79  NO BID  NO BID NO BID $6.96

Total $7,046.69 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $3,556.56
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard CC2820 Service Pro

SPE 16705

7. Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant or
Equal, 1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 138 containers NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID $10.30

Total $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,421.40
Manufacturer and Part Number: Prestone

SPE 86095

8. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 12-oz containers
Bid Price Unit 360 containers $2.72 NO BID  NO BID NO BID $2.10

Total $979.20 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $756.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson's 2212 Pennzoil 8568

9. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 1-gallon containers
Bid Price Unit 58 gallons $22.46 NO BID  NO BID NO BID $18.46

Total $1,302.68 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,070.68
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson's 2234 Pennzoil 8569
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10. Brake Fluid, DOT 4 in 12-oz. container

Bid Price Unit 50 containers 4.51 NO BID  NO BID NO BID $2.66
Total $225.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $133.00

Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson's 5012 Pennzoil 8543

11. Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner, 13-14 oz
net weight container
Bid Price Unit 5,452 containers $3.72 NO BID  NO BID NO BID $1.82

Total $20,281.44 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $9,922.64
Manufacturer and Part Number: CRC 05088 Cyclo Industries

C111

GROUP II Total Lump Sum (Items 5 - 11): $30,603.21 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $17,540.68


