PROPOSAL NO. RFB-DTS-0800329
OPENED: MAY 13, 2008

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

ITEM
NO.
1.

For the furnishing and delivery of TRAFFIC
SIGNAL EQUIPMENT for the twelve-month
beginning July 1, 2008 and ending June 30,
2009 to the Department of Transportation
Services, City and County of Honolulu,
Honolulu, Hawaii

MODEL 332A CONTROLLER CABINET
Bid Price Unit 3 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

MODEL 334 CAMERA CABINET

Bid Price Unit 2 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

CCTV TRAFFIC CAMERA ASSEMBLY
Bid Price Unit 25 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

SURGE PROTECTOR FOR CAMERA
Bid Price Unit 20 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING ELBOW
Bid Price Unit 200 Each
Total

Brand and No.:

PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
$13,100.00 $12,525.00 NO BID
$39,300.00 $37,575.00
MTS 170E/332 Safetran 332A
$3,615.00 NO BID NO BID
$7,230.00
MTS 334
$4,665.00 NO BID NO BID
$116,625.00
Pelco ES31
$230.25 NO BID NO BID
$4,605.00
ECLIPS 12HWCP
NO BID $16.70 NO BID
$3,340.00
TSH-0174F
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PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
NO.
6. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING
SHURLOCK TEE
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID $25.25 NO BID
Total $5,050.00
Brand and No.: TSH-0205F
7. SIGNAL FIXTURE MOUNTING REAMED
TEE
Bid Price Unit 200 Each NO BID $14.10 NO BID
Total $2,820.00
Brand and No.: TSH-0202F
8. ADA PEDESTRIAN PUSH BUTTON
ASSEMBLY W/HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 500 Each $112.95 $145.35 NO BID
Total $56,475.00 $72,675.00
Brand and No.: DCC Polara BDLMX2
4EVR/57H/VRS
9. MODEL 400 MODEM BOARD
Bid Price Unit 75 Each $230.00 $155.00 NO BID
Total $17,250.00 $11,625.00
Brand and No.: GDI 1200B PDC Model 400
10. TRAFFIC SIGNAL POLE POST-TOP
ADAPTER WITH FOUR SIDE PORTS
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $81.60 $85.25 NO BID
Total $8,160.00 $8,525.00
Brand and No.: Pelco Products TSH-0056F

SE 3176/SEO316
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PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
NO.
11. STAINLESS STEEL 100A METER SOCKET
WITH BREAKER
Bid Price Unit 25 Each $1,349.00 NO BID NO BID
Total $33,725.00
Brand and No.: Cooper B-Line
0214MTBSS
12. SCHOOL ZONE TIME CLOCK WITH
ENCLOSURE
Bid Price Unit 25 Each $749.50 $625.00 NO BID
Total $18,737.50 $15,625.00
Brand and No.: Pelco SE1004 Tr. Parts AP21TR
13. BIMODAL LEFT-TURN SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $197.00 $195.00 $134.81
Total $9,850.00 $9,750.00 $6,740.50
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight LED/ [GE DR6-ECA6-01A
430-6370-001 IDC Housing
MTS-TP10 Housing
14. 12 INCH RED LED RETROFIT TRAFFIC
SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $53.01 $48.60 $54.34
Total $5,301.00 $4,860.00 $5,434.00
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight JXC-300 GE
433-1210-003 CAR | DR6-RTFB-20A-22
15. 12 INCH YELLOW LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $61.61 $61.25 $60.61
Total $6,161.00 $6,125.00 $6,061.00
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight JXC-300 GE

433-3230-001

CAY

DR6-YTFB-20A-22
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PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
NO.
16. 12 INCH GREEN LED RETROFIT
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $68.68 $92.40 $104.50
Total $6,868.00 $9,240.00 $10,450.00
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight JXC-300 GE
433-2220-001 CAG | DR6-GCFB-20A-22
17. TRAFFIC SIGNAL VISOR
Bid Price Unit 200 Each $17.95 $19.25 NO BID
Total $3,590.00 $3,850.00
Brand and No.: MTS M19267 IDC
18. 210S CONFLICT MONITOR
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $453.50 $413.25 NO BID
Total $22,675.00 $20,662.50
Brand and No.: EDI 210E EDI Model 210 cmv
19. SINGLEMODE VIDEO
RECEIVER/TRANSMITTER AND DATA
TRANSCIEVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each $998.50 NO BID NO BID
Total $3,994.00
Brand and No.: IFS VR1930WDM
20. SINGLEMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER AND
DATA TRANCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 4 Each $998.50 NO BID NO BID
Total $3,994.00

Brand and No.:

IFS VT1930WDM
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PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
NO.
21. ORNAMENTAL CAP FOR TRAFFIC
SIGNAL FIXTURES
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $4.69 $4.85 NO BID
Total $234.50 $242.50
Brand and No.: Pelco SE-0361 TR PARTS 1109-G
22. COUNTDOWN LED PEDESTRIAN
SIGNAL MODULE
Bid Price Unit 200 Each $230.00 $229.85 $259.16
Total $46,000.00 $45,970.00 $51,832.00
Brand and No.: Dialight Duralight [ GE PS7-CFF1-26A
430-6479-001 JXM-400VIEIL
23. MULTIMODE VIDEO TRANSMITTER/
DATA TRANSCEIVER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each $965.40 NO BID NO BID
Total $4,827.00
Brand and No.: IFS VT1920WDM
24. MULTIMODE VIDEO RECEIVER/DATA
TRAMSCEOVER
Bid Price Unit 5 Each $965.40 NO BID NO BID
Total $4,827.00
Brand and No.: IFS VR1920WDM
25. GPS TIME SOURCE
Bid Price Unit 40 Each $929.00 $835.00 NO BID
Total $37,160.00 $33,400.00
Brand and No.: MTS 'GPS' Time Safetran GPS Time
Source Source
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PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
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26. LED VEHICLE TRAFFIC SIGNAL
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $407.60 $405.00 NO BID
Total $40,760.00 $40,500.00
Brand and No.: MTS TP30 Series IDC Housing/
Dialight LED Lamps Duralight LED
27. RED LED PROGRAMMED VISIBILITY
LAMP
Bid Price Unit 300 Each $65.10 $73.75 $59.57
Total $19,530.00 $22,125.00 $17,871.00
Brand and No.: Dialight ET PV18X10RD |GE DR3-RCFB-01A
P463R33003
28. YELLOW LED PROGRAMMED
VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $72.10 $75.25 $59.57
Total $3,605.00 $3,762.50 $2,978.50
Brand and No.: Dialight ET PV18X10YL | GE DR3-YCFB-01A
P463Y33003
29. GREEN LED PROGRAMMED
VISIBILITY LAMP
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $111.90 $118.00 $129.58
Total $11,190.00 $11,800.00 $12,958.00
Brand and No.: Dialight ET PV30X6BG |GE DR3-GCFB-01A
P463G33003
30. AUDIO PEDESTRIAN BUTTON
Bid Price Unit 50 Each $219.35 NO BID NO BID
Total $10,967.50

Brand and No.:

Pelco SE2039
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PHOENIX SHAH GENERAL SUPPLY
PACIFIC, INC. & & SERVICES, INC.
ASSOCIATES DBA GEXPRO
ITEM
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31. MODEL 242 DC ISOLATOR
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $34.75 $33.95 NO BID
Total $3,475.00 $3,395.00
Brand and No.: PDC 242 PDC DCI-82
32. MODEL 200 LOAD SWITCH
Bid Price Unit 100 Each $24.10 $23.80 NO BID
Total $2,410.00 $2,380.00
Brand and No.: PDC 200 PDC SSS-88
33. MODEL 170E CONTROLLER
Bid Price Unit 75 Each $1,449.00 $1,365.00 NO BID
Total $108,675.00 $102,375.00
Brand and No.: MTS 170E DTS 170E
w/o Software
34. PEDESTRIAN TRAFFIC SIGNAL HOUSING
Bid Price Unit 300 Each $103.10 $118.00 NO BID
Total $30,930.00 $35,400.00
Brand and No.: MTS M64648 IDC Ped Housing

w/Alum Door




