ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. RFB-HPD-0800282
OPENED: March 31, 2008

For the Furnishing and Delivery of Ammunition and

Reloads to the Honolulu Police Department, City and Advanced Tactical Precision Security Thunder Bug, Inc. dba
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii. Supply, LLC Ammunition, LLC Equipment Corp. Magnum Firearms

1. 12 Ga 00 Buck Ammunition

Bid Price 100,000 rounds $690.00/m no bid $392.13/m $395.00/m

Total: $69,000.00 $39,213.00 $39,500.00

Make and Model Number: Hornady #8627 Federal Cart. F127 00 Remington 12B00
2. .223 Caliber (5.56 mm) Ammunition

Bid Price: 300,000 rounds $470.00/m no bid $477.20/m $523.04

Total: $141,000.00 $143,160.00 $156,912.00

Make and Model Number: Hornady #80225 Federal Cart. #T223A Remington R223 R1
3. 9 MM Luger (Parabellum) Ammunition

124 grain metal case bullet

Bid Price: 700,000 rounds $440.00/m no bid $160.42/m $235.00

Total: $308,000.00 $112,294.00 $164,500.00

Make and Model Number: Hornady #90245 Federal Cart. #AEQAP Remington LOMM2
4. 12 Ga Rifle Slug Ammunition

Bid Price: 100,000  rounds no bid no bid $392.13/m $460.00

Total $39,213.00 $46,000.00

Make and Model Number: Federal Cart. #127-RS Remington SP12RSB
5. 12 Ga Target Ammunition

Bid Price 5,000 rounds no bid no bid $265.74/m $383.00

Total: $1,328.70 $1,915.00

Make and Model Number:

Federal Cart. #7115-9

Remington GC12L9




For the Furnishing and Delivery of Ammunition and
Reloads to the Honolulu Police Department, City and

Advanced Tactical

Precision

Security

Thunder Bug, Inc. dba

County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii. Supply, LLC Ammunition, LLC Equipment Corp. Magnum Firearms

6. "Bean Bag" Cartridge

Bid Price: 5,000 rounds $4.50 no bid $4.49 $6.30

Total: $22,500.00 $22,450.00 $31,500.00

Make and Model Number: ALS #122 Combined Tactical Sys |Defense Technology 3027

#2581

7. 9 MM Luger (Parabellum)

124 grain tactical hollow point

Bid Price: 150,000 rounds no bid no bid $327.21/m $345.00

Total: ' $49,081.50 $51,750.00

Make and Model Number: CCl/Speed #53618 Remingto GSB 9MMD
8. 40 Caliber S&W Ammunition

165 grain tactical hollow point

Bid Price: 60,000 rounds no bid no bid $355.93/m $345.00/m

Total: $21,355.80 $20,700.00

Make and Model Number: CCS/Speer #53970 Remington GSB40SWA
9. 40 Caliber S&W Ammunition

165 grain total metal jacket

Bid Price: 80,000 rounds no bid no bid $220.10/m $255/m

Total: $17,608.00 $20,400.00

Make and Model Number: CCl/Speer #53955 Remington L40SW4
10. .38 Caliber Special Caliber Ammunition

Bid Price: 20,000  rounds no bid no bid $198.09/m $250.00/m

Total: $3,961.80 $5,000.00

Make and Model Number: Federal Cart. #AE38B Remington R38S5
11. Buckshot

Bid Price: 90,000 rounds no bid $0.85 $885.27/m $539.00/m

Total: $76,500.00 $79,674.30 $48,510.00

Make and Model Number:

Precision Ammun.
CMBS

Federal Cart. #8C132-00

Remington LF129B00
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County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii. Supply, LLC Ammunition, LLC Equipment Corp. Magnum Firearms
12. 12 Ga. Rifled Slug Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 90,000 rounds no bid $0.85 $832.44/m $555.00/m
Total: $76,500.00 $74,919.60 $49,950.00
Make and Model Number: Precision Ammun. {Federal Cart. #8C127 LRG| Remington LF12FSS25
CMSG
13. .308 Caliber Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 10,000 rounds no bid $1.04 $916.97/m no bid
Total: $10,400.00 $9,169.70
Make and Model Number: Precision Amm. international Cart.
CM308-S #038-125TLF
14. 9 MM Luger Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 300,000 rounds no bid $0.29 $335.92/m $377.00/m
Total: $87,000.00 $100,776.00 $113,100.00
Make and Model Number: Precision Amm. CM9 CCl/Speer #53365 Remington CTFOMMB
15. 40 Caliber S&W Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 50,000  rounds no bid $0.31 $362.57/m $377.00
Total $15,500.00 $18,128.50 $18,850.00
Make and Model Number: Precision Amm. Federal Cart. #53375 Remington CTF40SWA
CM40
16. .38 Special Caliber Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 20,000  rounds no bid $0.34 $646.20/m $394.00/m
Total: $6,800.00 $12,924.00 $7,880.00
Make and Model Number: Precision Amm. International Cart. Remington LF38SA
CM38 #038-110TLF
17. .223 Caliber Non-Toxic Frangible
Bid Price: 100,000 rounds no bid $0.47 $699.80/m $555.00
Total:" $47,000.00 $69,980.00 $55,500.00

Make and Model Number:

Precision Amm.
CM223

Federal Cart. #BC223NT5

Remington LF223RA




