
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

RFB-DFM-0800279 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  MARCH 4, 2008

For the furnishing of Ground Maintenance
Services at Various Areas, 2008-01, for the A M DIVERSIFIED FAMILY FIFITA HO'ONANI KAM SERVICES LAWNS BY LOCAL NOAH'S ARK PROFESSIONAL RJ Y2KLEENING,
Department of Facility Maintenance, LANDSCAPING JANITORIAL CLEANING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPE/ ROBERT LANDSCAPING SERVICES LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPING INC.
Division of Road Maintenance, City and SERVICES, INC. SERVICE, INC. INC. LTD. JANITORIAL MGMT. INC. SERVICES
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii for
the seven-month period beginning
April 1, 2008 and ending October 31,
2008

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. WAIP-Aiki Street, between Loaa Street and

Kupuna Loop
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,200.00 $2,617.80 $975.00 $1,985.00 $3,628.80 $845.00 NO BID $950.00 $465.00 $950.00 $955.00 $925.00

Total $8,400.00 $18,324.60 $6,825.00 $13,895.00 $25,401.60 $5,915.00 1 - 5 $6,650.00 $3,255.00 $6,650.00 $6,685.00 $6,475.00
2. KAPO-Kapolei Parkway  [Phase 8A

(Renton Road to Oahu Railway)]
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,490.00 $2,617.80 $1,500.00 $1,500.00 $2,100.00 $775.00 $600.00 $930.00 $450.00 $299.00 $500.00

Total $10,430.00 $18,324.60 $10,500.00 $10,500.00 $14,700.00 $5,425.00 $4,200.00 $6,510.00 $3,150.00 $2,093.00 $3,500.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $18,830.00 $36,649.20 $17,325.00 $24,395.00 $40,101.60 $11,340.00 $10,850.00 $9,765.00 $9,800.00 $8,778.00 $9,975.00

GROUP II
3. DT-Downtown Post Office Parking Lot

(Richards Street)
Bid Price Unit 7 NO BID $680.63 $700.00 $200.00 $840.00 $220.00 $400.00 NO BID NO BID $210.00 NO BID

Total 3 - 15 $4,764.41 $4,900.00 $1,400.00 $5,880.00 $1,540.00 $2,800.00 3 - 15 3 - 15 $1,470.00 3 - 15
4. DT-Booth/Ahekolo Triangle

Bid Price Unit 7 $261.78 $700.00 $75.00 $140.00 $190.00 $200.00 $140.00
Total $1,832.46 $4,900.00 $525.00 $980.00 $1,330.00 $1,400.00 $980.00

5. KAL/PAL-Kokea Street and Kohou Street
Sidewalk Strips and Stream Banks
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,596.85 $1,300.00 $2,200.00 $4,082.40 $1,350.00 $1,850.00 $1,250.00

Total $11,177.95 $9,100.00 $15,400.00 $28,576.80 $9,450.00 $12,950.00 $8,750.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $17,774.82 $18,900.00 $17,325.00 $35,436.80 $12,320.00 $17,150.00 $11,200.00
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A M DIVERSIFIED FAMILY FIFITA HO'ONANI KAM SERVICES LAWNS BY LOCAL NOAH'S ARK PROFESSIONAL RJ Y2KLEENING,
LANDSCAPING JANITORIAL CLEANING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPE/ ROBERT LANDSCAPING SERVICES LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPING INC.

SERVICES, INC. SERVICE, INC. INC. LTD. JANITORIAL MGMT. INC. SERVICES

ITEM
NO. GROUP III
6. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

203 Paokalani Avenue - corner of Kuhio/
Paokalani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 NO BID $750.00 $450.00 $630.00 $315.00 $608.00 $300.00 NO BID

Total 6 - 15 $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $4,410.00 $2,205.00 $4,256.00 $2,100.00 6 - 12
7. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

2476 Kuhio Avenue - between Liliuokalani
Avenue and Kapuni Street
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $450.00 $630.00 $315.00 $608.00 $300.00

Total $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $4,410.00 $2,205.00 $4,256.00 $2,100.00
8. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

2418/2424 Kuhio Avenue - between Uluniu
and Kaiulani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $450.00 $630.00 $315.00 $608.00 $200.00

Total $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $4,410.00 $2,205.00 $4,256.00 $1,400.00
9. WAIK-Ala Moana Boulevard, Kalia Road to

Kalakaua Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $1,200.00 $1,120.00 $315.00 $733.00 $1,850.00

Total $5,250.00 $8,400.00 $7,840.00 $2,205.00 $5,131.00 $12,950.00
10. WAIK-Kuhio Avenue Median, Kapahulu

Avenue to Kealohilani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $500.00 $840.00 $365.00 $515.00 $500.00

Total $5,250.00 $3,500.00 $5,880.00 $2,555.00 $3,605.00 $3,500.00
11. WAIK-Medial Strip on Kalakaua Avenue

and Makaoe Lane
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $450.00 $1,120.00 $85.00 $97.00 $150.00

Total $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $7,840.00 $595.00 $679.00 $1,050.00
12. WAIK-Medial Strips between Kuhio Avenue

and Namahana Street
Bid Price Unit 7 $750.00 $450.00 $560.00 $150.00 $70.00 $200.00

Total $5,250.00 $3,150.00 $3,920.00 $1,050.00 $490.00 $1,400.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III: $36,750.00 $27,650.00 $38,710.00 $13,020.00 $22,673.00 $24,500.00
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A M DIVERSIFIED FAMILY FIFITA HO'ONANI KAM SERVICES LAWNS BY LOCAL NOAH'S ARK PROFESSIONAL RJ Y2KLEENING,
LANDSCAPING JANITORIAL CLEANING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPE/ ROBERT LANDSCAPING SERVICES LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPING INC.

SERVICES, INC. SERVICE, INC. INC. LTD. JANITORIAL MGMT. INC. SERVICES

ITEM
NO. GROUP IV
13. KAIM-Waialae Avenue Parking Islets,

located on Waialae Avenue between 11th
and Koko Head Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,000.00 $995.00 $1,400.00 $190.00 $235.00 $350.00 $165.00

Total $7,000.00 $6,965.00 $9,800.00 $1,330.00 $1,645.00 $2,450.00 $1,155.00
14. WKAH-Hunakai Traffic Medial Strip, located

on Hunakai Street between Waialae
Avenue and Pahoa Avenue
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,000.00 $800.00 $840.00 $220.00 $175.00 $500.00 $180.00

Total $7,000.00 $5,600.00 $5,880.00 $1,540.00 $1,225.00 $3,500.00 $1,260.00
15. H.K.-Lunalilo Home Road Medial

(Kalanianaole Highway to Kaluka Street)
Bid Price Unit 7 $1,000.00 $1,200.00 $1,400.00 $800.00 $803.00 $1,250.00 $763.00

Total $7,000.00 $8,400.00 $9,800.00 $5,600.00 $5,621.00 $8,750.00 $5,341.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $21,000.00 $20,965.00 $25,480.00 $8,470.00 $8,491.00 $14,700.00 $7,756.00


