
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

RFB-DFM-0800247 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JANUARY 16, 2008

For the furnishing of Ground Maintenance
Services at Various Areas, 2008-01, for the A M ALOHA HOME DIVERSIFIED EMPICO INC. FAGASA & FIFITA HO'ONANI KAM SERVICES LAWNS BY NOAH'S ARK PROFESSIONAL RJ TREES OF
Department of Facility Maintenance, LANDSCAPING & YARD JANITORIAL dba JANI-KING SONS INC. LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPE/ ROBERT SERVICES LANDSCAPE LANDSCAPING HAWAII, INC.
Division of Road Maintenance, City and SERVICE, LLC SERVICES, INC. HAWAII INC. LTD. JANITORIAL MGMT. INC. SERVICES
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii for
the twelve-month period beginning
February 1, 2008 and ending January 31,
2009

ITEM
NO. GROUP I
1. WAIP-Aiki Street, between Loaa Street and

Kupuna Loop
Bid Price Unit 12 $1,257.00 $975.00 $3,725.00 $2,995.00 $1,500.00 NO BID $2,613.61 $849.90 NO BID $1,000.00 $999.00 $837.78 $1,800.00

Total $15,084.00 $11,700.00 $44,700.00 $35,940.00 $18,000.00 1 & 2 $31,363.32 $10,198.80 1 - 5 $12,000.00 $11,988.00 $10,053.36 $21,600.00
2. KAPO-Kapolei Parkway  [Phase 8A

(Renton Road to Oahu Railway)]
Bid Price Unit 12 $1,500.00 $309.00 $2,575.00 $4,000.00 $1,500.00 $1,633.51 $779.90 $500.00 $500.00 $597.00 $1,200.00

Total $18,000.00 $3,708.00 $30,900.00 $48,000.00 $18,000.00 $19,602.12 $9,358.80 $6,000.00 $6,000.00 $7,164.00 $14,400.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $33,084.00 $15,408.00 $75,600.00 $83,940.00 $36,000.00 $50,965.44 $19,557.60 $18,000.00 $17,988.00 $17,217.36 $36,000.00

GROUP II
3. DT-Downtown Post Office Parking Lot

(Richards Street)
Bid Price Unit 12 NO BID $189.00 $750.00 NO BID $1,000.00 $200.00 $653.40 $225.00 NO BID NO BID $157.00 $800.00

Total 3 - 15 $2,268.00 $9,000.00 3 - 15 $12,000.00 $2,400.00 $7,840.80 $2,700.00 3 - 15 3 - 15 $1,884.00 $9,600.00
4. DT-Booth/Ahekolo Triangle

Bid Price Unit 12 $75.00 $300.00 $100.00 $100.00 $108.90 $190.00 $63.00 $500.00
Total $900.00 $3,600.00 $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $1,306.80 $2,280.00 $756.00 $6,000.00

5. KAL/PAL-Kokea Street and Kohou Street
Sidewalk Strips and Stream Banks
Bid Price Unit 12 $1,625.00 $1,525.00 $2,000.00 $2,200.00 $2,940.31 $1,350.00 $315.00 $2,900.00

Total $19,500.00 $18,300.00 $24,000.00 $26,400.00 $35,283.72 $16,200.00 $3,780.00 $34,800.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $22,668.00 $30,900.00 $37,200.00 $30,000.00 $44,431.32 $21,180.00 $6,420.00 $50,400.00
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ITEM
NO. GROUP III
6. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

203 Paokalani Avenue - corner of Kuhio/
Paokalani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $415.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID $490.05 $315.00 $305.00 NO BID NO BID

Total $4,980.00 6 - 15 6 - 12 6 - 12 $5,880.60 $3,780.00 $3,660.00 6 - 15 6 - 15
7. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

2476 Kuhio Avenue - between Liliuokalani
Avenue and Kapuni Street
Bid Price Unit 12 $415.00 $490.05 $315.00 $305.00

Total $4,980.00 $5,880.60 $3,780.00 $3,660.00
8. WAIK-Kuhio Mini Park/Bus Stop area,

2418/2424 Kuhio Avenue - between Uluniu
and Kaiulani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $415.00 $490.05 $315.00 $305.00

Total $4,980.00 $5,880.60 $3,780.00 $3,660.00
9. WAIK-Ala Moana Boulevard, Kalia Road to

Kalakaua Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $715.00 $871.20 $318.00 $410.00

Total $8,580.00 $10,454.40 $3,816.00 $4,920.00
10. WAIK-Kuhio Avenue Median, Kapahulu

Avenue to Kealohilani Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $915.00 $653.40 $365.00 $515.00

Total $10,980.00 $7,840.80 $4,380.00 $6,180.00
11. WAIK-Medial Strip on Kalakaua Avenue

and Makaoe Lane
Bid Price Unit 12 $83.00 $871.20 $85.00 $97.00

Total $996.00 $10,454.40 $1,020.00 $1,164.00
12. WAIK-Medial Strips between Kuhio Avenue

and Namahana Street
Bid Price Unit 12 $193.00 $435.60 $150.00 $70.00

Total $2,316.00 $5,227.20 $1,800.00 $840.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III: $37,812.00 $51,618.60 $22,356.00 $24,084.00
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ITEM
NO. GROUP IV
13. KAIM-Waialae Avenue Parking Islets,

located on Waialae Avenue between 11th
and Koko Head Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $174.00 $1,000.00 $341.18 $1,089.00 $190.00 $150.00

Total $2,088.00 $12,000.00 $4,094.16 $13,068.00 $2,280.00 $1,800.00
14. WKAH-Hunakai Traffic Medial Strip, located

on Hunakai Street between Waialae
Avenue and Pahoa Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 $174.00 $1,500.00 $800.00 $653.40 $225.00 $70.00

Total $2,088.00 $18,000.00 $9,600.00 $7,840.80 $2,700.00 $840.00
15. H.K.-Lunalilo Home Road Medial

(Kalanianaole Highway to Kaluka Street)
Bid Price Unit 12 $989.00 $1,300.00 $1,000.00 $1,089.00 $820.00 $135.00

Total $11,868.00 $15,600.00 $12,000.00 $13,068.00 $9,840.00 $1,620.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $16,044.00 $45,600.00 $25,694.16 $33,976.80 $14,820.00 $4,260.00

Cashier's Check $1,654.20 $4,650.00 $5,325.00 $4,197.00 $5,940.00 $2,784.70 $9,049.63 $3,895.68 $1,450.00 $900.00 $899.40 $1,181.86 $4,320.00


