BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700056

PROPOSAL FOR THE FURNISHING AND SDELIVERY OF ONE SPORTS UTILITY VEHICLE AND TWO MID-SIZE SEDANS

ITEM 1
INTERPACIFIC
MOTORS INC.
CUTTER DBA ORCHID ISLE CUTTER RAINBOW JACKSON
DODGE CENTER FORD, INC** CHEVROLET, INC. AUTO GROUP*
DESCRIPTION 2008 DODGE DURANGO SUV 2008 FORD EXPEDITION 2008 FORD EXPEDITION 2008 CHEVY TAHOE
4-WD SSV 4-WD 4-WD 4DR, 4WD
UNIT PRICE $29,826.17 $31,000.00 $33,902.99 $36,006.00 NO BID
QTY 1 1 1 1
TOTAL SUM BID $29,826.17 $31,000.00 $33,902.99 $36,006.00
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST
MILES 60,000 60,000 60,000 60,000
CITY EPA MPG 13 14 14 14
GASOLINE PRICE PER GAL $2.25 $2.25 $2.25 $2.25
oTY 1 1 1 1
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST $10,384.62 $9,642.86 $9,642.86 $9,642.86
TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE $40,210.79 $40,642.86 $43,545.85 $45,648.86 NO BID
ITEM 2
INTERPACIFIC
MOTORS INC. JACKSON
CUTTER CUTTER RAINBOW DBA ORCHID ISLE AUTO GROUP*
DODGE FORD, INC CHEVROLET, INC. CENTER
DESCRIPTION 2008 DODGE CHARGER 2008 FORD 2008 CHEVY IMPALA
SEDAN TAURUS SEDAN LT
UNIT PRICE $23,186.38 $23,992.21 $25,600.00 NO BID NO BID
QTY 2 2 2
TOTAL SUM BID $46,372.76 $47,984.42 $51,200.00
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST
MILES 60,000 60,000 60,000
CITY EPA MPG 18 18 18
GASOLINE PRICE PER GAL $2.25 $2.25 $2.25
oTY 2 2 2
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST $15,000.00 $15,000.00 $15,000.00
NO BID
TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE $61,372.76 $62,984.42 $66,200.00 NO BID

* CITY CANNOT ACCEPT PROPOSAL SINCE PROPOSAL NOT SIGNED (PROPOSAL PAGES 5 AND 6 NOT SUBMITTED)

**BID OFFER FOR ITEM 1 DOES NOT LIST EPA MILES PER GALLON- CITY DETERMINED CITY EPA TO 14 MPG
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