RFB-DFM-0700035
OPENED: SEPTEMBER 28, 2007

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing of GROUND
MAINTENANCE SERVICES AT VARIOUS
AREAS, 2007-03, for the twelve-month
period beginning November 1, 2007 and
ending October 31, 2008 for the
Department of Facility Maintenance,
Division of Road Maintenance, City and
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP |
1. Pua Alowalo Street Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
2. Makalani Street/Kulanuli Street Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
3. Kamehameha Highway Medial Strip in
Kaneohe
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
4. Aikahi/Mokapu Boulevard Triangles and
Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
5. Kainui Medial Strip in Kailua
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
6. Kihapai Road
Bid Price Unit 12 months
Total
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I:
GROUP I
7. Kailua Municipal Parking Lot, Lot 2
Bid Price Unit 12 months

Total

DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
NO BID $40.00 NO BID NO BID $54.97 NO BID $40.00
1-16 $480.00 1-29 1-16 $659.64 1-16 $480.00
$40.00 $54.97 $40.00
$480.00 $659.64 $480.00
$800.00 $1,172.77 $1,100.00
$9,600.00 $14,073.24 $13,200.00
$1,500.00 $2,052.36 $1,600.00
$18,000.00 $24,628.32 $19,200.00
$780.00 $879.58 $800.00
$9,360.00 $10,554.96 $9,600.00
$150.00 $586.39 $150.00
$1,800.00 $7,036.68 $1,800.00
$39,720.00 $57,612.48 $44,760.00
$700.00 $879.58 $100.00
$8,400.00 $10,554.96 $1,200.00
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DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING | CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
ITEM
NO.
8. Kailua Municipal Parking Lot, Lot 1
Bid Price Unit 12 months $75.00 $1,759.16 $650.00
Total $900.00 $21,109.92 $7,800.00
9. Kailua Road Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $140.00 $2,198.95 $200.00
Total $1,680.00 $26,387.40 $2,400.00
10. Kailua/Kuulei Road Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months $210.00 $879.58 $275.00
Total $2,520.00 $10,554.96 $3,300.00
11. Kailua Road Medial
Bid Price Unit 12 months $190.00 $2,198.95 $275.00
Total $2,280.00 $26,387.40 $3,300.00
12. Kailua/Wanaao Road Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months $50.00 $109.95 $100.00
Total $600.00 $1,319.40 $1,200.00
13. Kalapawai Triangle at South Kalaheo
Avenue
Bid Price Unit 12 months $130.00 $73.30 $150.00
Total $1,560.00 $879.60 $1,800.00
14. Lanikai Traffic Triangle at Mokulua Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $80.00 $54.97 $150.00
Total $960.00 $659.64 $1,800.00
15. Lanipo Drive Parkway
Bid Price Unit 12 months $100.00 $73.30 $175.00
Total $1,200.00 $879.60 $2,100.00
16. Hamakua Drive Parkway and Hamakua
Drive Hibiscus Hedge
Bid Price Unit 12 months $200.00 $586.39 $250.00
Total $2,400.00 $7,036.68 $3,000.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $22,500.00 $105,769.56 $27,900.00
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DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING | CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP llI
17. Kalakaua Avenue Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $580.00 NO BID $749.00 $2,638.74 $703.00 NO BID
Total $6,960.00 17 - 30 $8,988.00 $31,664.88 $8,436.00 17 - 46
18. Piikoi Street Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $375.00 $548.00 $1,026.98 $350.00
Total $4,500.00 $6,576.00 $12,323.76 $4,200.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP llI: $11,460.00 $15,564.00 $43,988.64 $12,636.00
GROUP IV
19. Waiakamilo Road Medial Strip and
Dillingham Boulevard Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $310.00 $700.00 $952.88 NO BID
Total $3,720.00 $8,400.00 $11,434.56 19-30
20. Kohou/Halona Street Traffic Calming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $250.00 $600.00 $329.84
Total $3,000.00 $7,200.00 $3,958.08
21. Houghtailing/Kohou Street Traffic Calming
Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $250.00 $600.00 $439.79
Total $3,000.00 $7,200.00 $5,277.48
22. Lanakila Avenue TrafficCalming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $250.00 $400.00 $329.84
Total $3,000.00 $4,800.00 $3,958.08
23. Likelike Highway Beautification Triangles
Bid Price Unit 12 months $470.00 $849.00 $1,099.48
Total $5,640.00 $10,188.00 $13,193.76
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $18,360.00 $37,788.00 $37,821.96
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DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP V
24. Ala Lilikoi/Likini/Ala llima Street Traffic
Calming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $310.00 $250.00 $879.58
Total $3,720.00 $3,000.00 $10,554.96
25. Likini Street/Ala Napuanani Traffic Calming
Bid Price Unit 12 months $210.00 $200.00 $329.84
Total $2,520.00 $2,400.00 $3,958.08
26. Salt Lake Boulevard Medial and Sidewalk
Planters
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,125.00 $950.00 $4,397.90
Total $13,500.00 $11,400.00 $52,774.80
27. Salt Lake Boulevard Medial and Sidewalk
Planters
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,475.00 $1,600.00 $4,397.90
Total $17,700.00 $19,200.00 $52,774.80
28. Salt Lake Boulevard Sidewalk Area and
Drainage Retention Basins
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,525.00 $4,900.00 $4,397.90
Total $18,300.00 $58,800.00 $52,774.80
29. Kahuapaani Street/Salt Lake Boulevard to
Kalaloa Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $210.00 $1,500.00 $4,397.90
Total $2,520.00 $18,000.00 $52,774.80
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $58,260.00 $112,800.00 $225,612.24
GROUP VI
30. Salt Lake Boulevard Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $375.00 $1,000.00 NO BID $3,518.32
Total $4,500.00 $12,000.00 $42,219.84
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI: $4,500.00 $12,000.00 $42,219.84
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DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP VII
31. Ohina/Honokahua Remnant
Bid Price Unit 12 months NO BID $80.00 $150.00 $200.00 $54.97 $20.00
Total 31-39 $960.00 $1,800.00 $2,400.00 $659.64 $240.00
32. Poola Street Circle
Bid Price Unit 12 months $40.00 $80.00 $300.00 $54.97 $20.00
Total $480.00 $960.00 $3,600.00 $659.64 $240.00
33. Puu Panini Avenue Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months $40.00 $50.00 $300.00 $73.30 $20.00
Total $480.00 $600.00 $3,600.00 $879.60 $240.00
34. Kaimuki/6th Avenue Triangle
Bid Price Unit 12 months $95.00 $100.00 $200.00 $439.79 $168.00
Total $1,140.00 $1,200.00 $2,400.00 $5,277.48 $2,016.00
35. St. Louis Circle, St. Louis Drive and Dole
Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $120.00 $60.00 $300.00 $659.69 $168.00
Total $1,440.00 $720.00 $3,600.00 $7,916.28 $2,016.00
36. Koko Head and 12th Avenue Traffic
Calming Island
Bid Price Unit 12 months $40.00 $80.00 $200.00 $439.79 $168.00
Total $480.00 $960.00 $2,400.00 $5,277.48 $2,016.00
37. 10th Avenue and Paalea Street Traffic
Calming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $40.00 $150.00 $300.00 $219.90 $80.00
Total $480.00 $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $2,638.80 $960.00
38. 10th Avenue and Kaiwila Street Traffic
Calming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $100.00 $80.00 $400.00 $293.19 $80.00
Total $1,200.00 $960.00 $4,800.00 $3,518.28 $960.00
39. Palolo Avenue and Kalua Street Traffic
Calming Area
Bid Price Unit 12 months $100.00 $80.00 $300.00 $293.19 $80.00
Total $1,200.00 $960.00 $3,600.00 $3,518.28 $960.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $7,860.00 $9,960.00 $30,000.00 $30,345.48 $9,648.00
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DIVERSIFIED FAGASA & FIFITA HTM HO'ONANI LAWNS BY Y2KLEENING
JANITORIAL SONS LANDSCAPING | CONTRACTORS LANDSCAPE, ROBERT INC.
SERVICES, INC. INC. LTD.
ITEM
NO. GROUP VIiI
40. Moanalua Road-Kaahumanu Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $170.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $500.00 $879.58 NO BID
Total $2,040.00 $18,000.00 $1,800.00 $6,000.00 $10,554.96 40 - 46
41. Overpass: Hoolaulea Street-Noelani Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $150.00 $350.00 $60.00 $400.00 $293.19
Total $1,800.00 $4,200.00 $720.00 $4,800.00 $3,518.28
42. Overpass: Hoolaulea Street-Nanakai
Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $150.00 $350.00 $60.00 $550.00 $293.19
Total $1,800.00 $4,200.00 $720.00 $6,600.00 $3,518.28
43. Overpass: Waimanu Home Road-Hoelani
Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $150.00 $300.00 $80.00 $400.00 $293.19
Total $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $960.00 $4,800.00 $3,518.28
44, Overpass: Waimanu Home Road-Nanakai
Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $150.00 $300.00 $80.00 $300.00 $293.19
Total $1,800.00 $3,600.00 $960.00 $3,600.00 $3,518.28
45. Pacific Palisades Entrance Park and Medial
Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,730.00 $1,500.00 $1,800.00 $825.00 $2,052.36
Total $20,760.00 $18,000.00 $21,600.00 $9,900.00 $24,628.32
46. Kuala Street, Medial Strip
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,120.00 $1,500.00 $850.00 $700.00 $1,759.16
Total $13,440.00 $18,000.00 $10,200.00 $8,400.00 $21,109.92
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIII: $43,440.00 $69,600.00 $36,960.00 $44,100.00 $70,366.32
Cashier's Check $6,801.00 $6,984.00 $2,946.00 $13,367.40 $29,103.13 $1,120.00 $3,633.00




