
BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700185
PROPOSAL FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES 

  COLLECTION SYSTEM, MAINTENANCE DIVISION, DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU

OPENED ON 12/12/07
BY ALVIN WASHIASHI

ITEM 1

CUTTER DODGE CUTTER FORD, INC. RAINBOW CHEVROLET HONOLULU FORD, INC ORHID ISLE AUTO CENTER
DESCRIPTION 2008 FORD F-450 CAB & 

CHASSIS
2008 FORD F-450 CAB & 

CHASSIS
UNIT PRICE NO BID $69,964.37 NO BID $74,352.95 NO BID
NO. OF UNITS 1 1 1
TOTAL SUM BID BO BID $69,964.37 NO BID $74,352.95 BO BID

ITEM 2
DESCRIPTION 2008 DODGE CALIBER SE 2008 FORD FOCUS 2008 CHEVY COBALT 2008 FORD FOCUS 4-DOOR 

SEDAN
2008 FORD FOCUS 4-DOOR 

SEDAN
UNIT PRICE $18,914.13 $15,793.71 $16,621.00 $15,598.72 $14,986.00
NO. OF UNITS 1 1 1 1 1
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM 2 $18,914.13 $15,793.71 $16,621.00 $15,598.72 $14,986.00

TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE
NO. OF UNITS 1 1 1 1 1
MILES 60,000 60,000 60,000 60,000 60,000
CITY EPA 23 24 22 $24.00 24
MPG $2.25 $2.25 $2.25 $2.25 $2.25
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE $5,869.57 $5,625.00 $6,136.36 $5,625.00 $5,625.00

TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE  ITEM 2 $24,783.70 $21,418.71 $22,757.36 $21,223.72 $20,611.00
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