
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15075 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 22, 2007

For the furnishing, delivery and/or removal
and installation of REMANUFACTURED JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
ALLISON TRANSMISSIONS for the City AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.
for the twelve-month period beginning
July 1, 2007 and ending June 30, 2008

ITEM
NO.
1. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model MTB-643
Bid Price $4,875.00 $9,050.00 $6,568.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $1,000.00 $7,100.00 $3,500.00
Net Bid Price Unit 4 each $3,875.00 $1,950.00 $3,068.00

Total $15,500.00 $7,800.00 $12,272.00
2. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model MTB-643
Bid Price Unit 4 each NO BID $500.00 $820.00

Total $2,000.00 $3,280.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 1 & 2: ----- $9,800.00 $15,552.00

3. Remanufactured Allison Transmission
Model HT-740D
Bid Price $6,832.00 $10,000.00 $10,675.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: Custom * $7,150.00 $6,980.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $6,832.00 $2,850.00 $3,695.00

Total $6,832.00 $2,850.00 $3,695.00
4. Additional Charges for Removing Old *need your core in remanufacturable

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle condition to build this transmission

and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model HT-740D
Bid Price Unit 1 each NO BID $900.00 $717.00

Total $900.00 $717.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 3 & 4: ----- $3,750.00 $4,412.00
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
5. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model MD-3560
Bid Price $12,078.00 $10,000.00 $12,496.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $5,000.00 $7,150.00 $9,309.00
Net Bid Price Unit 2 each $7,078.00 $2,850.00 $3,187.00

Total $14,156.00 $5,700.00 $6,374.00
6. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model MD-3560
Bid Price Unit 2 each NO BID $600.00 $717.00

Total $1,200.00 $1,434.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 5 & 6: ----- $6,900.00 $7,808.00

7. Remanufactured Allison Transmission
Model HD4060P
Bid Price $16,360.00 $17,000.00 $15,221.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $7,000.00 $13,700.00 $9,308.00
Net Bid Price Unit 2 each $9,360.00 $3,300.00 $5,913.00

Total $18,720.00 $6,600.00 $11,826.00
8. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model HD4060P
Bid Price Unit 2 each NO BID $900.00 $1,370.00

Total $1,800.00 $2,740.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 7 & 8: ----- $8,400.00 $14,566.00
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
9. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model HD4560P
Bid Price $16,740.00 $17,000.00 $15,221.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $7,000.00 $13,700.00 $9,308.00
Net Bid Price Unit 6 each $9,740.00 $3,300.00 $5,913.00

Total $58,440.00 $19,800.00 $35,478.00
10. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model HD4560P
Bid Price Unit 6 each NO BID $900.00 $1,370.00

Total $5,400.00 $8,220.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 9 & 10: ----- $25,200.00 $43,698.00

11. Remanufactured Allison Transmission
Model 4R100
Bid Price
Less Trade-In of Old Core:
Net Bid Price Unit 4 each

Total
12. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model 4R100
Bid Price Unit 4 each

Total

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 11 & 12:

ITEMS DELETED PER
ADDENDUM NO. 1
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
13. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model HT-754
Bid Price $8,875.00 $10,000.00 $7,511.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $2,000.00 $7,150.00 $2,911.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $6,875.00 $2,850.00 $4,600.00

Total $6,875.00 $2,850.00 $4,600.00
14. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model HT-754
Bid Price Unit 1 each NO BID $900.00 $717.00

Total $900.00 $717.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 13 & 14: ----- $3,750.00 $5,317.00

15. Remanufactured Allison Transmission
Model MT-653
Bid Price $5,358.00 $9,050.00 $3,500.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $1,500.00 $7,100.00 $1,500.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $3,858.00 $1,950.00 $2,000.00

Total $3,858.00 $1,950.00 $2,000.00
16. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model MT-653
Bid Price Unit 1 each NO BID $500.00 $717.00

Total $500.00 $717.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 15 & 16: ----- $2,450.00 $2,717.00
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
17. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model MD-3060P
Bid Price $10,522.00 $10,000.00 $9,639.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $5,000.00 $7,150.00 $5,817.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $5,522.00 $2,850.00 $3,822.00

Total $5,522.00 $2,850.00 $3,822.00
18. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model MD-3060P
Bid Price Unit 1 each NO BID $600.00 $717.00

Total $600.00 $717.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 17 & 18: ----- $3,450.00 $4,539.00

19. Remanufactured Allison Transmission
Model MD-3560P
Bid Price $12,078.00 $10,000.00 $9,839.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $5,000.00 $7,150.00 $5,817.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $7,078.00 $2,850.00 $4,022.00

Total $7,078.00 $2,850.00 $4,022.00
20. Additional Charges for Removing Old

Allison Transmission from a City Vehicle
and Reinstalling New Remanufactured
Allison Transmission Model MD-3560P
Bid Price Unit 1 each NO BID $600.00 $717.00

Total $600.00 $717.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEM 19 & 20: ----- $3,450.00 $4,739.00
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
21. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model VR-731
Bid Price $10,416.00 $14,000.00 $9,675.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $3,000.00 $11,350.00 $5,000.00
Net Bid Price Unit 1 each $7,416.00 $2,650.00 $4,675.00

Total $7,416.00 $2,650.00 $4,675.00
22. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model B400R
Bid Price $11,589.00 $16,000.00 $9,371.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $5,000.00 $13,200.00 $6,000.00
Net Bid Price Unit 8 each $6,589.00 $2,800.00 $3,371.00

Total $52,712.00 $22,400.00 $26,968.00
23. Remanufactured Allison Transmission

Model B500R
Bid Price $14,340.00 $18,000.00 $14,066.00
Less Trade-In of Old Core: $6,000.00 $14,700.00 $8,666.00
Net Bid Price Unit 4 each $8,340.00 $3,300.00 $5,400.00

Total $33,360.00 $13,200.00 $21,600.00

TOTAL BID PRICE FOR ITEMS 21 - 23: $93,488.00 $38,250.00 $53,243.00
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JASPER ENGINES MATT'S PACIFIC POWER
AND TRANSMISSION PRODUCTS

TRANSMISSIONS REPAIR, INC.

ITEM
NO.
24. Component parts to remanufacture trans

Estimated Amount of Total Component Parts
for the Contract Period: $80,000.00 $80,000.00 $80,000.00

From the Factory Parts List Price:

a.  Percent of Discount 30% 33.5% 
NO BID $24,000.00 $26,800.00

or

b.  Percent of Markup NO BID 

Subtotal for Item No. 24: ----- $56,000.00 $53,200.00

c.  If applicable, Hawaii State General 4.712% 
     Excise Tax: $2,638.72 $2,506.78

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM 24: ----- $58,638.72 $55,706.78

TOTAL SUM BID FOR 1 - 24: ----- $164,038.72 $212,297.78


