
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15074 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JUNE 22, 2007

For the furnishing and delivery of
COOLANT, BRAKE FLUID AND BRAKE ALOHA ALOHA BACON CHARLES W. CSK AUTO PACIFIC POWER PENNZOIL
CLEANER for the six-month period AUTOMOTIVE PETROLEUM UNIVERSAL CARTER INC. PRODUCTS DISTRIBUTORS
beginning August 1, 2007 and ending DISTRIBUTING LTD. CO., INC. CO. - HAWAII COMPANY OF HAWAII
January 31, 2008 to the City and County INC. INC.
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. Ethylene Glycol Coolant, Concentrate.

1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 540 containers $7.47 $8.27 $16.24 $8.16 $8.35 $13.03 $7.10

Total $4,033.80 $4,465.80 $8,769.60 $4,406.40 $4,509.00 $7,036.20 $3,834.00
Manufacturer and Part Number: Motorcraft VC5 Prime Fleetguard Prime Flag #6-1 Old World Service Pro 

AV - AF3000 CC2820 AF 3000 Industries SPE 16705 
23512138 

2. Ethylene Glycol, Phosphate-Free, Heavy
Duty Coolant, Concentrate. 55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 30 drums $737.15 $740.30 $812.78 NO BID NO BID $661.94 $669.79

Total $22,114.50 $22,209.00 $24,383.40 2 & 3 2 & 3 $19,858.20 $20,093.70
Manufacturer and Part Number: Prestone AF9055 Prestone - AF9055 Fleetguard Old World Pennzoil 159690 

CC2741 Industries 
23512139 

3. Ethylene Glyco Coolant, 50/50 Mix,
(pre-mix), Phosphate-Free, Heavy Duty.
55-gallon Drum
Bid Price Unit 7 drums $501.67 $484.00 $471.70 $381.64 NO BID

Total $3,511.69 $3,388.00 $3,301.90 $2,671.48
Manufacturer and Part Number: Prestone AF9155 Preston - AF9155 Fleetguard Old World 

CC2826 Industries 
23518918 

4. Prestone 5/150 Extended Life Coolant or
Equal, 1-gallon Container
Bid Price Unit 25 containers $9.35 NO BID NO BID $10.38 $11.25 NO BID $12.75

Total $233.75 4 - 8 $259.50 $281.25 4 & 5 $318.75
Manufacturer and Part Number: Motorcraft VC3 Prestone Prestone Pennzoil 8562 

AF888P #AF888 
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ALOHA ALOHA BACON CHARLES W. CSK AUTO PACIFIC POWER PENNZOIL
AUTOMOTIVE PETROLEUM UNIVERSAL CARTER INC. PRODUCTS DISTRIBUTORS
DISTRIBUTING LTD. CO., INC. CO. - HAWAII COMPANY OF HAWAII

INC. INC.
ITEM
NO.
5. Fleetguard DCA 75L or Equal, 5-gallon

Container
Bid Price Unit 2 containers $164.68 $96.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $329.36 $193.18
Manufacturer and Part Number: Fleetguard Fleetguard 

DCA 75L DCA 75L 

6. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 12-oz containers
Bid Price Unit 252 containers $1.20 $1.68 $1.37 $1.17 $1.40 $1.92

Total $302.40 $423.36 $345.24 $294.84 $352.80 $483.84
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson Gunk Wagner Pryoil #BF12 Penray 6012 Pennzoil 8568 

RM4312DS FC134280 

7. Brake Fluid, DOT 3 in 1-gallon containers
Bid Price Unit 46 gallons $9.17 $16.62 $12.98 $10.99 $12.47 $16.31

Total $421.82 $764.52 $597.08 $505.54 $573.62 $750.26
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson 2234 Gunk Wagner Pyroil #BF1 Penray 6001 Pennzoil 8569 

RM4334DS FC134282 

8. Non-Chlorinated Brake Cleaner, 13-14 oz
net weight container
Bid Price Unit 4,110 containers $1.60 $2.58 $1.74 NO BID $2.00 $1.58

Total $6,576.00 $10,603.80 $7,151.40 $8,220.00 $6,493.80
Manufacturer and Part Number: Johnson 2413 Gunk CRC 05088 Penray 4520 Cyclo CC111 

RM715DS 


