
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15055 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: MAY 30, 2007

For the furnishing and delivery of
PNEUMATIC TIRES AND TUBES for the EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS
twelve-month period beginningJuly 1, 2007 COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
and ending June 30, 2008 to the City and RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.

MOTORCYCLE TIRES
1. 120/70ZR17 D205 Tubeless Radial for BMW

Motorcycle, Dunlop 36 12 0 418 771.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID 116.43

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $5,821.50
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 120/70ZR17 D205

36120418771

Stock or Import: I
2. 160/60ZR18 D205 Tubeless Radial for BMW

Motorcycle, Dunlop Sportman 36 12 0 418 772.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 127.32

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $12,732.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 160/60ZR18 D205

36120418772

Stock or Import: I
3. 120/70ZR17 D205 Tubeless Radial for BMW

Motorcycle, Dunlop 36 12 0 418 722.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 156.64

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $15,664.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 120/70ZR17 D205

36120418722

Stock or Import: I
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4. 170/60ZR17 D205 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlop 36 12 0 418 764.
NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 300 NO BID NO BID NO BID 166.69

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $50,007.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 170/602R17 D205

36120418764
Stock or Import: I

5. 120/70R17 D220 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlop. NO SUBSTITUTE.
Bid Price Unit 30 NO BID NO BID NO BID 148.26

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $4,447.80
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 120/70ZR17 D220

36310421724
Stock or Import: I

6. 180/55ZR17 D220 Tubeless Radial for BMW
Motorcycle, Dunlop. NO SUBSTITUTE.
Bid Price Unit 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID 170.04

Total ----------- ----------- ----------- $17,004.00
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DUNLOP 180/55ZR17 D220

36310421725
Stock or Import: I

II. PASSENGER CAR TIRES
7. P175/70R13

Bid Price Unit 36 $30.37 $39.48 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,093.32 $1,421.28 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7024 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402136477

Stock or Import: S S
8. P165/80R13

Bid Price Unit 43 $29.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $1,257.32 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT 8024

Stock or Import: S S



PROPOSAL NO. 15055
PAGE 3 EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS

COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.

9. P175/80R13
Bid Price Unit 32 $30.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $971.84 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT 8027

Stock or Import: S 
10. P185/80R13

Bid Price Unit 14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total ----------- ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.:

Stock or Import:
11. P175/70R14

Bid Price Unit 28 $33.75 $38.36 NO BID NO BID
Total $945.00 $1,074.08 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT A700 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402268047

Stock or Import: S S
12. P185/70R14

Bid Price Unit 10 $33.75 $39.33 NO BID NO BID
Total $337.50 $393.30 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7032 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402102477

Stock or Import: S S
13. P185/75R14, black wall (on at least one side)

Bid Price Unit 24 $35.99 $40.75 NO BID NO BID
Total $863.76 $978.00 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7520 REP. ENSIGN
356721267

Stock or Import: S S
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14. P185/75R14, white wall
Bid Price Unit 25 $35.99 $40.75 NO BID NO BID

Total $899.75 $1,018.75 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7520 REP. ENSIGN

356721267

Stock or Import: S S
15. P195/75R14, white wall

Bid Price Unit 15 $38.24 $42.58 NO BID NO BID
Total $573.60 $638.70 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7524 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402645436

Stock or Import: S S
16. P205/75R14

Bid Price Unit 42 $41.62 $44.44 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,748.04 $1,866.48 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7528 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402728436

Stock or Import: S S

17. P215/75R14
Bid Price Unit 26

Total NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: ----------- ----------- ----------- -----------

Stock or Import:

18. P215/60R15 Unit 40 NO BID 51.82 NO BID NO BID
Total ----------- $2,072.80 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: REP. ENTERPRISE
353209013

Stock or Import: S
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19. P205/65R15
Bid Price Unit 40 $48.36 $48.94 NO BID NO BID

Total $1,934.40 $1,957.60 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 6548 REP. ENSIGN

356313268

Stock or Import: S S
20. P215/65HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

special radial ply design, speed rated at 
130 mph.
Bid Price Unit 64 $49.49 $32.65 NO BID NO BID

Total $3,167.36 $2,089.60 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI6548 GOODYEAR EAGLE GT HR

100474200

Stock or Import: S S
21. P215/65R15

Bid Price Unit 12 $49.49 $49.17 NO BID NO BID
Total $593.88 $590.04 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI6548 REP. ENSIGN
356410268

Stock or Import: S S
22. P205/70R15

tubeless, special radial ply design, speed
rated at 130 MPH
Bid Price Unit 52 $44.99 $50.21 NO BID NO BID

Total $2,339.48 $2,610.92 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT 102393 REP. ENSIGN

356099268

Stock or Import: S S
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23. P215/65R17
Bid Price Unit 24 $101.23 $60.88 NO BID NO BID

Total $2,429.52 $1,461.12 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CONT. 1547380000 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

402432047

Stock or Import: S S
24. P215/70R15

Bid Price Unit 78 $51.74 $43.86 NO BID NO BID
Total $4,035.72 $3,421.08 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI 7070 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402020047

Stock or Import: S S
25. P215/70R15, white wall

Bid Price Unit 30 $51.74 $52.34 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,552.20 $1,570.20 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI7070 GODDYEAR INTEGRITY
402431436

Stock or Import: S S
26. P225/70HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

special radial ply design, speed rated at
130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT+4, or 
RS-A", "B.F. Goodrich Euro T/A" or General
Tire XP2000H or XP2000ASH". 
NO SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock at 
least 20 tires for Honolulu Police Department
(HPD) emergency purchases during the first
11 months of the contract regardless of whether
bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 375 $60.59 $71.20 NO BID NO BID

Total $22,721.25 $26,700.00 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR GT+4 104876486 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA100V

732478500

Stock or Import: S S
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27. P225/70R15
Bid Price Unit 143 $60.59 $60.05 NO BID NO BID

Total $8,664.37 $8,587.15 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR GT+4 104876486 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY

402392436

Stock or Import: S S
28. P235/70R15

Bid Price Unit 30 $77.73 $64.60 NO BID NO BID
Total $2,331.90 $1,938.00 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR RS-A 732807500 GOODYEAR EAGLE GT II
116969011

Stock or Import: S S
29. P235/70HR15, high speed police tire, tubeless,

special radial ply design, speed rated at 
130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT, GT+4, or 
RS-A", "B.F. Goodrich Euro T/A" or "General
Tire XP2000H or TP2000ASH". 
NO SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for Honolulu Police Department (HPD)
emergency purchases during the first 11 months
of the contract regardless of whether bidding 
Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 54 $77.73 $76.75 NO BID NO BID

Total $4,197.42 $4,144.50 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR RS-A 732807500 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA100V

732807500

Stock or Import: S S
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30. P205/75R15
Bid Price Unit 58 $43.87 $46.34 NO BID NO BID

Total $2,544.46 $2,687.72 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7540 REP. ENSIGN

356099355

Stock or Import: S S
31. P205/75R15, white wall

Bid Price Unit 42 $43.87 $50.03 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,842.54 $2,101.26 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT7540 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402705436

Stock or Import: S S
32. P215/75R15

Bid Price Unit 60 $44.99 $52.88 NO BID NO BID
Total $2,699.40 $3,172.80 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7544 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402391436

Stock or Import: S S
33. P215/75R15, white wall

Bid Price Unit 20 44.99 52.88 NO BID NO BID
Total $899.80 $1,057.60 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7544 GOODYEAR INTEGRITY
402391436

Stock or Import: S S
34. P225/75R15, white wall

Bid Price Unit 60 48.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $2,901.60 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7548

Stock or Import: S
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35. P235/75R15
Bid Price Unit 16 $52.86 $51.87 NO BID NO BID

Total $845.76 $829.92 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7552 REP. ENSIGN

356770267

Stock or Import: S S
36. P235/75R15, white wall

Bid Price Unit 62 $52.86 $51.87 NO BID NO BID
Total $3,277.32 $3,215.94 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 7552 REP. ENSIGN
356770267

Stock or Import: S S
37. P245/50ZR16, high speed police tire, tubeless,

radial ply design, speed rated to 160 MPH,
Goodyear Eagle ZR50" or BF Goodrich Comp
ZR50". NO SUBSTITUTE
Bid Price Unit 40 $99.46 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $3,978.40 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR EAGLE RS-A

732333182

Stock or Import: S 
38. P215/60R16

Bid Price Unit 82 NO BID $54.26 NO BID NO BID
Total ----------- $4,449.32 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: REP. ENSIGN
356769268

Stock or Import: S
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39. P225/60HR16, high speed police tire, tubeless
special radial ply design, speed rated at 
130 MPH, "Goodyear Eagle GT, GT+4, or 
RS-A", "B.F. Goodrich Euro T/A" or "General
Tire XP2000H or TP2000ASH". 
NO SUBSTITUTE. Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for Honolulu Police Department (HPD)
emergency purchases during the first 11 months
of the contract regardless of whether bidding 
Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 750 $52.86 $72.41 NO BID NO BID

Total $39,645.00 $54,307.50 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI6064 GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA97H

732366500

Stock or Import: S S
40. P225/60R16

Bid Price Unit 26 $52.86 $56.15 NO BID NO BID
Total $1,374.36 $1,459.90 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CWI6064 REP. ENSIGN
356158268

Stock or Import: S S
41. P235/55R17, high speed police tire, tubeless,

special radial ply design, speed rated at 
130 MPH. "Goodyear Eagle RSA". 
NO SUBSTITUTE.
Bid Price Unit 50 $102.65 $106.63 NO BID NO BID

Total $5,132.50 $5,331.50 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA GOODYEAR EAGLE RSA98W

732002500 732002500

Stock or Import: S S
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42. P235/70R17-XL
Bid Price Unit 16 NO BID $129.51 NO BID NO BID

Total ----------- $2,072.16 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR WRL SLTARM

758595189

Stock or Import: S
III. TRUCK TIRES

A.  TRUCK TIRES, TUBE TYPE ONLY,
On-Highway only (all-terrain tires not acceptable
unless specified), All-Position only, 
Non-Directional only, unless otherwise specified

43. 10.00 X 20, 12 PR, Tube or Tubeless
Bid Price Unit 8 $226.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,814.16 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 179949

Stock or Import: S 
44. 11.00 X 20, 14 PR, Tube or Tubeless

Bid Price Unit 28 $265.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $7,424.76 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 179884

Stock or Import: S

B.  TRUCK TIRES, TUBELESS,
On-Highway only (for this bid "all-Terrain" is
not acceptable as "on-highway only"), 
All-Position only, Non-Directional only, unless
otherwise specified:



PROPOSAL NO. 15055
PAGE 12 EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS

COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.

45. 8 X 14.5, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 32 $86.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $2,771.52 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 375011409

Stock or Import: S
46. LT235-75R15, 6 PR, SBR, All Terrain

Bid Price Unit 39 $79.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $3,114.54 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT 9024

Stock or Import: S
47. 235-70R16, 10 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 40 $75.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $3,014.40 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT GSV9046

Stock or Import: S
48. 7.50 X 16, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 46 $73.11 $115.63 NO BID NO BID
Total $3,363.06 $5,318.98 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MEWRIT K075016-1 GOODYEAR E WH
312100090

Stock or Import: S S
49. LT225/75R16, 8 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 138 NO BID 88.29 NO BID NO BID
Total ----------- $12,184.02 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: REP. TRAILMARK AP D
357943033

Stock or Import: S
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50. LT225/75R16, 8 PR, SBR, All Terrain
Bid Price Unit 36 $79.86 $107.52 NO BID NO BID

Total $2,874.96 $3,870.72 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT IGT9036 REP. TRAILMARK APR E

357072170

Stock or Import: S S
51. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 331 89.98 95.99 NO BID NO BID
Total $29,783.38 $31,772.69 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHT9340 REP. TRAILMARK AP E
357046071

Stock or Import: S S
52. LT245/75R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on

both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading.  Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent.  Contractor must
stock at least 10 tires for Oahu Transit
Services emergency purchases during the
first 11 months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 30 191.56 178.72 NO BID NO BID

Total $5,746.80 $5,361.60 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MICHELIN XPS RIB 26848 GOODYEAR G647 RSS

Stock or Import: S S
53. LT265/75R16, 6 PR, SBR

Bid Price Unit 60 93.35 93.75 NO BID NO BID
Total $5,601.00 $5,625.00 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT9344 REP. TRAILMARK AP
357846072

Stock or Import: S S
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54. LT215/85R16, 8 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 144 $79.86 $88.16 NO BID NO BID

Total $11,499.84 $12,695.04 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT9048 REP. TRAILMARK AP

357268033

Stock or Import: S S
55. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, black wall on

both sides of tire.
Bid Price Unit 45 $131.60 $92.80 NO BID NO BID

Total $5,922.00 $4,176.00 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: BFG 42205 REP. TRAILMARK AP

357458071

Stock or Import: S S
56. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on

both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading.  Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent.  Contractor must
stock at least 60 tires for Oahu Transit
emergency purchases during the first 11
months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 560 $183.10 175.76 NO BID NO BID

Total $102,536.00 $98,425.60 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MICHELIN XPS RIB 39510 GOODYEAR G647 RSS

Stock or Import: S S



PROPOSAL NO. 15055
PAGE 15 EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS

COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.

NO.
57. LT215-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on

both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
commercial light truck, all steel casing,
designed for multiple retreading.  Goodyear
G-159 LT, Bridgestone Metro Radial R187
All Steel, or equivalent.  Contractor must
stock at least 60 tires for Oahu Transit
emergency purchases during the first 11
months of the contract regardless of
whether bidding "Stock" or "Import".
Bid Price Unit 80 $191.79 $179.45 NO BID NO BID

Total $15,343.20 $14,356.00 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MICHELIN XPS RIB 03530 GOODYEAR G149 RSA

139045907

Stock or Import: S S
58. LT235-85R16, 10 PR, SBR, 

Bid Price Unit 145 $89.98 $94.28 NO BID NO BID
Total $13,047.10 $13,670.60 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CHT 9352 REP. TRAILMARK AP E
357045071

Stock or Import: S S
59. LT235/85R16, 10 PR, SBR, All Terrain

Bid Price Unit 8 92.23 102.35 NO BID NO BID
Total $737.84 $818.80 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GT CGT 9352 REP.TRAILMARK APR E
367433220

Stock or Import: S S
60. 8.75 X 16.5, 10 PR

Bid Price Unit 4 93.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $373.40 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 36-50616-875E

Stock or Import: S
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61. 9.50R16.5, 10 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 24 $201.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $4,847.76 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: MICHELIN XPS RIB

03530

Stock or Import: S 
62. 12 X 16.5LT, 12 PR

Bid Price Unit 13 $155.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $2,021.50 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: KOMET FL180401

Stock or Import: S 
63. LT245/75R17, 10 PR, SBR, (black wall on

both sides of tire), all-position, highway,
light truck, Contractor must stock at least
10 tires for Honolulu Emergency Services
Department emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or S 
"Import"
Bid Price Unit 80 $174.34 $144.95 NO BID NO BID

Total $13,947.20 $11,596.00 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: BFG 86693 GOODYEAR WRL SILARMR 

PROGRD E 748636189

Stock or Import: S S
64. 215/75R17.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G114

or comparable, SBR, Trailer service.
Bid Price Unit 27 $145.09 170.69 NO BID NO BID

Total $3,917.43 $4,608.63 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: TRI TR685 TR21515175-1 GOODYEAR G114 H

756246567

Stock or Import: S S
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65. 225/70R19.5, 12 PR, SBR
Bid Price Unit 127 $163.09 $204.22 NO BID NO BID

Total $20,712.43 $25,935.94 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: TRI TR685 TR22570195-1 DUNLOP SP342 F

271132352

Stock or Import: S S
66. 255/70R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159 or

comparable, SBR, all position rib tire
Bid Price Unit 52 $223.83 $253.28 NO BID NO BID

Total $11,639.16 $13,170.56 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL R210 RL2557R225HHY2 GOODYEAR G169 RSA

756780519

Stock or Import: S S
67. 315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile.

Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 631 317.58 379.92 $313.29 NO BID

Total $200,392.98 $239,729.52 $197,685.99 -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL3158022.5-3 GOODYEAR G291 AEOLUS HN08 20 PLY 

756256420 #706380

Stock or Import: S S I



PROPOSAL NO. 15055
PAGE 18 EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS

COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.

68. 315/80R22.5, 20 PR, Low Profile, Goodyear
Unisteel G287, all position, SBR, servere
service application, on/off highway, resistant
to chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 60 317.58 458.91 $313.29 NO BID

Total $19,054.80 $27,534.60 $18,797.40 -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL31580225-3 GOODYEAR G287 MSA AEOLUS HN08 20 PLY

756141662 #706380

Stock or Import: S S I
69. 385/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel

G286 or comparable, on/off highway, SBR,
all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 11 422.91 427.23 NO BID NO BID

Total $4,652.01 $4,699.53 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL3856522.5-1 GOODYEAR G286 A

759315200

Stock or Import: S S
70. 385/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel

G287, all position, on/off highway, SBR,
severe service application, resistant to
chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 25 422.91 427.25 NO BID NO BID

Total $10,572.75 $10,681.25 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL3856522.5-1 GOODYEAR G286A

756141662

Stock or Import: S S
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71. 425/65R22.5, 18 PR, Goodyear Unisteel
G286 on/off highway, SBR, all position,
severe service application, resistant to
chunking and rib tear (for Honolulu Fire
Department).
Bid Price Unit 20 $649.91 $477.31 NO BID NO BID

Total $12,998.20 $9,546.20 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR G286 759452541 GOODYEAR G286A "L"

759313200

Stock or Import: S S
72. 425/65R22.5, 20 PR, Goodyear Unisteel

G286 or comparable, on/off highway,
SBR, all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib rear.
Bid Price Unit 9 $649.91 $477.31 NO BID NO BID

Total $5,849.19 $4,295.79 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR G286 759452541 GOODYEAR G286A "L" 

759313200

Stock or Import: S S
73. 10R22.5, 12 PR

Bid Price Unit 14 298.86 161.13 NO BID NO BID
Total $4,184.04 $2,255.82 ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GEN 0568374 GOODYEAR G149 "F"
138947125

Stock or Import: S S
74. 11R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G159

or comparable, SBR, all position rib tire.
Contractor must stock at least 40 tires for
the Division of Automotive Equipment
Service for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
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Bid Price Unit 866 $235.04 $293.19 $221.70 NO BID
Total $203,544.64 $253,902.54 $191,992.20 -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL11R225GRB2 GOODYEAR G149 "H" AEOLUS HN08 16 PLY 
138179125 #706369

Stock or Import: S S I
75. 11R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G167

or comparable, SBR, drive wheel tire.
Contractor must stock at least 20 tires for
the Division of Refuse Collection and
Disposal for emergency purchases during
the first 11 months of the contract
regardless of whether bidding "Stock" or
"Import".
Bid Price Unit 16 $251.73 $319.89 $254.80 NO BID

Total $4,027.68 $5,118.24 $4,076.80 -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL11R225HTRC2 GOODYEAR G182 "H" AEOLUS HN306 16 PLY

138803185 #709389
Stock or Import: S S I

76. 12R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286
or comparable.  SBR, all position, severe
service application, on/off highway, resistant
to chunking and reb tear.
Bid Price Unit 26 $303.69 $383.64 NO BID NO BID

Total $7,895.94 $9,974.64 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL1222.5-1 GOODYEAR G287 "H"

138864662

Stock or Import: S S
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77. 12R22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G287, 
SBR, all position, severe service application,
resistant to chunking and rib tear 
(for Honolulu Fire Department).
Bid Price Unit 175 $303.69 $383.64 NO BID NO BID

Total $53,145.75 $67,137.00 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: RL RL1222.5-1 GOODYEAR G287 H

138864662

Stock or Import: S S
78. 12R24.5, 16 PR, GoodyearUnisteel G286 or

comparable. SBR, all position, severe service
application, on/off highway, resistant to 
chunking and rib tear.
Bid Price Unit 12 534.52 392.86 NO BID NO BID

Total $6,414.24 $4,714.32 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CONTINENTAL 0238476 GOODYEAR G287 H

Stock or Import: S S
79. 445/65r22.5, 16 PR, Goodyear Unisteel G286,

on/off highway, SBR, all position, severe service
highway, resistant to chunking and rib tear 
(for Honolulu Fire Department).
Bid Price Unit 20 NO BID 539.21 NO BID NO BID

Total ----------- $10,784.20 ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR G286A

759314200

Stock or Import: S

IV. FARM TRACTOR TIRES, NYLON OR RAYON
CORD, unless otherwise specified
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80. 7.50 X 16 (F2), 6 PR, Tube or Tubeless, Rib
Traction
Bid Price Unit 18 95.61 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,720.98 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DEN FT48

Stock or Import: S
81. 11L X 16, (TU F3), Tube or Tubeless,

12 PR
Bid Price Unit 5 $105.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $528.65 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DEN EB1116-1

Stock or Import: S
82. 16.9 X 24, AT UTIL, 8PR, Tube or Tubeless

(without disosal)
Bid Price Unit 1 $351.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $351.35 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDBAL 104112201

Stock or Import: S
83. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 1 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $40.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $391.35 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 82 PLUS ITEM NO. 83)

84. 17.5L X 24, 10 PR, Tube or Tubeless
(without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 4 $356.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,426.84 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDBAL 104112401

Stock or Import: S
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Stock or Import:
85. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4 $40.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $160.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $1,586.84 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 84 PLUS ITEM NO. 85)

V. ROAD GRADER TIRES, TUBE OR TUBELESS,
NYLON CORD, unless otherwise specified:

86. 12.5/80 X 18-E, Sure Grip, 10 PR, 
 (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 4 $357.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,430.72 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR 170604113

Stock or Import: S
87. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4 $10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $40.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $1,470.72 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 86 PLUS ITEM NO. 87)

VI. LOADER - DOZER, LOADER, PAVER, 
TUBELESS, NYLON CORD, unless otherwise
specified:

88. 10 X 16.5NHS-C, 6 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 18 $98.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,764.36 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 10X11144

Stock or Import: S
89. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 18 $6.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $108.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $1,872.36 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 88 PLUS ITEM NO. 89)
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90. 17.5 X 25-F, L2, Directional, 12 PR,
(without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 6 $440.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $2,641.56 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL EB17.525-1

Stock or Import: S
91. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 6 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $300.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $2,941.56 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 90 PLUS ITEM NO. 91)

92. 23.5 X 25, L4, 20 PR, (without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 4 $2,241.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $8,966.12 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: F/S 416193 BS 

Stock or Import: S
93. Cost to Dispose of City Tire

Bid Price Unit 4 $80.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $320.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $9,286.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 92 PLUS ITEM NO. 93)

94. 18.4 X 28, R-4 Industrial Sure Grip, 12 PR
(without disposal)
Bid Price Unit 2 $493.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $987.54 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 104112901

Stock or Import: S



PROPOSAL NO. 15055
PAGE 25 EAST BAY TIRE GOOD YEAR TIRE NATIONAL INDUSTRIAL SOUTH SEAS

COMPANY AND TIRE OF HAWAII, INC CYCLE
RUBBER COMPANY EXCHANGE INC.

95. Cost to Dispose of City Tire
Bid Price Unit 2 $50.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $100.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

TOTAL BID PRICE $1,087.54 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
(ITEM NO. 94 PLUS ITEM NO. 95)

VII. LAWN AND GARDEN TIRES
96. 480/400-8, Tube Type Only, Stud Tread,

designed for long wearing traction, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 12 $21.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $256.44 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR 202075085

Stock or Import: S
97. 11 X 4.00-5 Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower,

Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar type tread;
designed to minimize turf damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 12 $13.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $162.00 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR 303332582 

Stock or Import: S
98. 16 X 750-8, Terra, Tubeless, Lawn Mower,

Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar type tread;
designed to minimize turf damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 48 $37.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,799.52 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CARL 474349

Stock or Import: S
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99. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar type tread, designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 78 $28.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $2,193.36 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 37-29308-188C

Stock or Import: S
100. 18 X 850-8, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-

Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread, designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 6 PR
Bid Price Unit 31 $28.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $871.72 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 37-293308-0155C

Stock or Import: S
101. 18 X 950-8, Terra Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-

Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 16 $31.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $503.84 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 37-23608-189B

Stock or Import: S
102. 20 X 800-10, Industrial, Terra, Tubeless,

Softrac, Multi-Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread;
Designed to Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 14 $44.99 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $629.86 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CARL 474318

Stock or Import: S
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103. 23 X 8.50-12, Terra, Tubeless, Softrac, Multi-
Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 49 $62.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $3,086.02 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CARL 474301

Stock or Import: S
104. 23 X 10.50-12, Terra, Tubeless, Softract, Multi-

Trac, or Turf Bar Type Tread; Designed to
Minimize Turf Damage, 4 PR
Bid Price Unit 38 $70.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $2,692.68 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: CARL 474367

Stock or Import: S
105. 31 X 13.50 X 15NHS-B, Softrac, 4 PR

Bid Price Unit 14 $251.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $3,522.82 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: GOODYEAR 4SR34A

Stock or Import: S
VIII. INDUSTRIAL TIRES
106. 6.50 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or

Tubeless, Lug Tread, 10 PR
Bid Price Unit 12 $69.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $835.56 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 102110141

Stock or Import: S
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107. 750 X 10, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or
Tubeless, Lug Tread, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 10 $88.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $883.80 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 102110201

Stock or Import: S
108. 700 X 12, Industrial (Forklift), Tube or

Tubeless, Lug Tread, 12 PR
Bid Price Unit 16 $95.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,525.44 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 10211022

Stock or Import: S
109. 250 X 15, Industrial (Forklift), Tube Type

Only, 16 PR
Bid Price Unit 8 $223.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,785.36 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 102111241

Stock or Import: S
110. 8.25 X 15-F, Industiral, (Forklift), Lug Tread,

12 PR
Bid Price Unit 20 $140.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $2,812.00 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 102110441

Stock or Import: S
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111. 10.5 X 20-E, Industrial, Multi-Purpose,
Traction, 10 PR
Bid Price Unit 4 $252.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $1,008.52 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: SOLIDEAL 10911325

Stock or Import: S
HIGHWAY RIB OR TRAILER TIRES

112. 5.70 X 8, Tubeless, Highway Rib or
Highway Trailer, 6 PR
Bid Price Unit 24 $25.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $620.64 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: DURO 352320856

Stock or Import: S
PART 2 - UNMOUNTED TUBES
TUBES, PLAIN INNER, PNEUMATIC

I. TRUCK AND BUS TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY:
113. 7.50 xX15, Long Rubber Valve Stem

Bid Price Unit 12 $11.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $141.60 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 522003

Stock or Import: S
114. 7.50 X 16, Long Rubber Valve Stem

Bid Price Unit 4 $11.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $47.20 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 552062

Stock or Import: S
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115. 10.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 16 $18.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $288.00 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 553071

Stock or Import: S
116. 11.00 X 20, Metal Valve Stem

Bid Price Unit 13 $24.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $321.75 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 533297

Stock or Import: S
II. FARM, INDUSTRIAL, TRACTOR TUBES, 

HEAVY-DUTY:
117. 4.80/4.00 X 8

Bid Price Unit 12 $5.06 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $60.72 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 533149

Stock or Import: S
118. 5.70/500 X 8

Bid Price Unit 16 $7.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $126.08 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 542814

Stock or Import: S
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119. 6.50 X 10
Bid Price Unit 17 $10.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $181.73 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 543098

Stock or Import: S
120. 7.50 X 10

Bid Price Unit 8 $10.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $85.52 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 543098

Stock or Import: S
121. 7.00 X 12

Bid Price Unit 16 $11.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $180.00 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 533343

Stock or Import: S
122. 8.15 X 15, Long Metal Valve Stem

Bid Price Unit 7 $11.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Total $82.60 ----------- ----------- -----------

Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 540025

Stock or Import: S
III. LOADER TUBES, HEAVY-DUTY:

123. 16.9/18.4 X 28, Metal Valve Stem
Bid Price Unit 2 $42.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $85.50 ----------- ----------- -----------
Manufacturer, Model, Stock/Catalog No.: FS 556879

Stock or Import: S


