PROPOSAL NO. 15046
OPENED MAY 7, 2007

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of
SWIMMING POOL CHEMICALS, for the
twelve-month period beginning

June 1, 2007 and ending May 31, 2008
to the City and County of Honolulu.

ALL POOL & SPA, INC.

BEI HAWAII

SHELTER TECH COMPANY INC
DBA
ISLAND POOL & SPA SUPPLY

ITEM
NO.
1.

Calcium Hypochlorite, 100 Ib. drum

Bid Price Unit 30 drums
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.:

Sodium Hypochlorite, 15 gallon carboy

Bid Price Unit 200 carboys
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.:

Sodium Hypochlorite, 53 gallon drum

Bid Price Unit 1,200 drums
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.:

Sodum Hypochlorite, 330 gallon tote

Bid Price Unit 150 totes
Total

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.:

Algaecide, 1 gal. or 1 gt. container
Bid Price Unit
Total

gallon

STATE OF HAWAII REGISTRATION NO.:

$135.00
$4,050.00

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

204
$34.00
$6,936.00

8134.3

$132.50
$3,975.00
9363.33

$48.00
$9,600.00
9430.86

$119.80
$143,760.00
9430.86

$669.90
$100,485.00
9430.86

203
$40.45
$8,211.35

8134.3

$167.54
$5,026.20
1258-1069

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

203
$34.97
$7,098.91

8134.1
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NO.
6. Calcium Chloride, 50 Ib. bag
Bid Price Unit 50 bags NO BID $23.35 $22.25
Total $1,167.50 $1,112.50
7. Chlorine Sticks for Widget Chemical
Feeder, 8 o0z. size, 100 sticks per container
Bid Price Unit 25 cont. $118.00 NO BID $136.13
Total $2,950.00 $3,403.25
8. Muiriatic Acid, 1 gal. container
Bid Price Unit 500 gal. $7.15 $6.10 $7.90
Total $3,575.00 $3,050.00 $3,950.00




