
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15044 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  APRIL 30, 2007

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PAPER PRODUCTS for a seven-month CONRAD OFFICE MAX, INC.
period beginning May 15, 2007and ending ENTERPRISES DBA
November 30, 2007 to the City and County INC. HOPACO
of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I - PAPER HAND TOWELS
1. Multi-fold type

Bid Price Unit 3,000 cases $21.63 19.62
Total $64,890.00 $58,860.00

Make and Model: Kimberly - Clark Georgia Pacific
Kim - 01804 W5 20389

Packaging - sht./pkg. and pkgs./case: 250/pkg 250/pk
16 pkg/case 16 pk/ct

2. Multi-fold type; unbleached (Kraft/Brown)
Bid Price Unit 1000 cases $19.89 15.85

Total $19,890.00 $15,850.00

Make and Model: Kimberly - Clark Georgia Pacific
Kim - 01801 W5 23304

Packaging - shts./pkg. and pkgs./case: 250/pkg 250/pk
16 pkg/case 16 pk/ct

GROUP II - PAPER ROLL HAND TOWELS AND DISPENSERS
3. Paper Roll Hand Towels and Dispenser

Bid Price Unit 600 each NO BID NO BID
Total

Make and Model:

Packaging - ft./roll and rolls/case:
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4. Dispenser
Bid Price Unit 200 each NO BID NO BID

Total

Make and Model:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II, ITEM $0.00 $0.00
NOS. 3 AND 4:

GROUP III - TOILET TISSUES
5. Toilet Tissue

Bid Price Unit 600 cases NO BID 41.75
Total $25,050.00

Make and Model: Georgia Pacific
W5 H 14580

Packaging - shts./roll and rolls/case: 1210 sh/rl
80 rl/ct

6. Toilet Tissue
Bid Price Unit 400 cases NO BID 47.87

Total $19,148.00

Make and Model: Georgia Pacific
W5 10101

Packaging - shts./pkg, and pkgs./case: 400/pk
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 GROUP IV - TOILET SEAT COVERS

7. Half-fold type; bleached
Bid Price Unit 200 cases $29.80 28.19

Total $5,960.00 $5,638.00

Packaging - shts./pkg. and pkgs./case: 250/Pkg 250/pk
20 Pkg/Case 20 pk/ct

GROUP V - SANITARY NAPKIN DISPOSABLE BAG

8. Sanitary Napkin Disposable Bag
Bid Price Unit 5 cartons 22.13 NO BID

Total $110.65

Make and Model: Westland Papercon
PLS-R75

Packaging - pkgs./carton: 1000/case


