PROPOSAL NO. 15034
OPENED: APRIL 3, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

For the furnishing of CRUSHED RO
AND SAND for the twelve-month pe
beginning May 1, 2007 and ending

April 30, 2008 to the City and Count

CK

AMERON INTERNATIONAL CORP.

DBA
AMERON HAWAII

GRACE PACIFIC
CORPORATION

HAWAIIAN CEMENT

SPHERE LLC
DBA
PACIFIC AGGREGATE

PACIFIC
AGRICULTURAL
SALES & SERVICES,

Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii INC.
ITEM 2007 2008 2007 2008
PLANT: Kapaa Kapaa Sand Sand Makakilo Quarry Campbell Halawa Nanakuli Quarry Site Kapolei
Quarry Quarry Island Island Industrial Park 87-601 Paakea Road
LOCATION: Kailua Kailua Sand Sand 91-920 Farrington Hwy. & 91-055 Kaomi Lp 99-1100 Waianae, HI 96792 91-262 Olai Street
Oahu Oahu Island Island Palehua Road (Mauka) Kapolei Halawa Kapolei, HI 96707
Grade "A: Crushed Rock Hawaii Valley St. FOB Oahu
Plant: Lower Quarr Upper Quarr Campbell Halawa NQ Kapolei Jobsite
1. Surge $34.50 $36.60 $31.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4217
2. No. 3 Coarse $34.19 $36.23 $30.52 NO BID $26.28 NO BID NO BID
#4205
3. No. 3 Medium $30.10 $31.94 $43.04 $44.87 $26.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#4201
4. No. 3 Fine $30.10 $31.94 $43.04 $44.87 $26.86 NO BID $26.28 NO BID NO BID
#4211
5. Chips-Gravel $34.19 $36.23 $47.12 $49.16 $30.52 NO BID $29.32 NO BID NO BID
#4208
6. Commercial No. 4 $37.12 39.37 $31.78 NO BID $31.41 NO BID NO BID
#4204
Grade "B" Crushed Rock
7. Crusher Run 1-%" (C&C Base Coars $27.23 $28.85 $23.51 NO BID $24.40 NO BID NO BID
#4012
Borrow Material
8. Crusher Waste $15.50 $16.44 $14.66 NO BID $15.86 NO BID NO BID
#4005
Crushed Limestone
9. Crusher Run 1-%2" NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.73 NO BID NO BID
Sand
10. Natural Beach (Golf Course) NO BID $82.72 NO BID $66.87 NO BID NO BID
11. Natural Beach or Manufactured $58.01 $61.47 $70.94 $74.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID $44.00 NO BID NO BID
(Construction)
#6031
12. Sandblast Sand $77.59 $82.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
#6022
13. Masonry Sand $56.34 $59.74 $69.27 $72.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID $57.20 NO BID NO BID
#6032
14. Silica Sand NO BID $95.29 NO BID $420.80 $420.80
14a. Silica Sand
$95.29
14b. 20-30
Silica
$107.85 Ton Ton
Molokai Cinderlite
15. Molokai Cinderlite 3/8 Fine NO BID NO BID NO BID
Volcanic Cinder
16. Crushed Volcanic Cinder NO BID NO BID $77.70 $92.00 $102.00
cu. yd. cu. yd.




