
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15030 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  APRIL 4, 2007

For the furnishing of GROUND
MAINTENANCE SERVICES AT VARIOUS DIVERSIFIED FAGASA FIFITA HO'ONANI JILSS LANAKILA LAWNS LOCAL PROFESSIONAL RANDALL
AREAS IN HONOLULU, for the twelve JANITORIAL & LANDSCAPINGLANDSCAPINGCONSTRUCTION REHAB BY LANDSCAPING LANDSCAPING K.T. MEW
month period beginning July 1, 2007 SERVICES, SONS, INC. LTD. INC. CENTER, ROBERT MGMT LANDSCAPING
and ending June 30, 2008, to the INC. INC. INC.
Department of Facility Maintenance, City
and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO. GROUP I

1. Date Street/Citron Street/Isenberg Street
Triangle (TMK: 2-7-6; .11 acre, and Date Street/
Kapiolani Boulevard/Kamoku Street Triangles
(TMK: 2-7-15, 19; .23 acre) NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Price Unit 12 months $250.00 $72.00 $249.99 $205.00

Total $3,000.00 $864.00 $2,999.88 $2,460.00

2. Date Street/Kapahulu Avenue (Haw'n Dredging
to BWS Supply Pumping Station)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $75.00 $70.00 $333.32 $205.00

Total $900.00 $840.00 $3,999.84 $2,460.00

3. Laau Street Sidewalk Strip (TMK: 2-7-21; .08 
acre), and Date Street Sidewalk Strip, next to the
Ala Wai Golf Course (TMK: 2-7-36;, .80 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $725.00 $150.00 $666.64 $430.00

Total $8,700.00 $1,800.00 $7,999.68 $5,160.00

4. Ala Wai Boulevard Parkway  
Kapahulu Avenue  to McCully Street)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $2,650.00 $600.00 $18,665.88 $715.00

Total $31,800.00 $7,200.00 $223,990.56 $8,580.00

5. Ala Wai Bikepath
Bid Price Unit 12 months $425.00 $120.00 $1,999.92 $520.00

Total $5,100.00 $1,440.00 $23,999.04 $6,240.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP I: $49,500.00 $12,144.00 $262,989.00 $24,900.00
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GROUP II

6. University Avenue Medial Strip
(TMK: 2-8-7,23; 2-7-14, 15, 16; .97 acre) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,475.00 $300.00 $1,999.92 $900.00 $734.00 $800.00 $275.00

Total $17,700.00 $3,600.00 $23,999.04 $10,800.00 $8,808.00 $9,600.00 $3,300.00

7. East Manoa Road/East Manoa Road Triangle
(TMK: 2-9-43; .01 acre) 
East Manoa Road/Akaka Place Triangle
(TMK: 2-9-38; .01 acre)
Oahu Avenue/Kaala Circle 
(TMK: 2-9-02; .01 acre)
Oahu Avenue/Walu Way Circle 
(TMK: 2-9-02; .01 acre)
Hunnewell Street/Haena Street Circle
(TMK: 2-9-20; .01 acre, and Lanikaula Street/
Woolsey Place Triangle, Road-Way 
Intersection Vicinity of TMK: 2-9-57; between
lots 26, 27, & 28, on Lanikaula Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $310.00 $80.00 $749.97 $130.00 $357.00 $280.00 $80.00

Total $3,720.00 $960.00 $8,999.64 $1,560.00 $4,284.00 $3,360.00 $960.00

8. Kapiolani Boulevard Medial Strip
(TMK: 2-7-12, 13, 14; .44 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $375.00 $80.00 $1,249.95 $300.00 $324.00 $300.00 $72.00

Total $4,500.00 $960.00 $14,999.40 $3,600.00 $3,888.00 $3,600.00 $864.00

9. Manoa Triangle 
(TMK: 2-9-07:16; 0.82 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $310.00 $200.00 $166.66 $400.00 $627.00 $900.00 $235.00

Total $3,720.00 $2,400.00 $1,999.92 $4,800.00 $7,524.00 $10,800.00 $2,820.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP II: $29,640.00 $7,920.00 $49,998.00 $20,760.00 $24,504.00 $27,360.00 $7,944.00
(Item Nos. 6 through 9):
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GROUP III

10. Keeaumoku/Heulu Street Traffic Calming Area,
located near 1654-1704-1707
Keeaumoku Street and 1423 Heulu Street
(TMK: 2-4-025:041; 2-4-025:009;
2-4-024:062; and 2-4-024:032) NO BID NO BID NO BID
Bid Price Unit 12 months $70.00 $15.00 $166.66 $260.00 $225.00 $75.00 $75.00

Total $840.00 $180.00 $1,999.92 $3,120.00 $2,700.00 $900.00 $900.00

11. Piikoi/Lewalani/Mott-Smith Drive Traffic Calming
Area, fronting 1635 Piikoi Street (corner of 
Piikoi Street and Lewalani Drive) (TMK: 2-4-030)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $210.00 $45.00 $333.32 $280.00 $250.00 $280.00 $72.00

Total $2,520.00 $540.00 $3,999.84 $3,360.00 $3,000.00 $3,360.00 $864.00
12. Punchbowl Street Medial Strip, fronting 

1301 Punchbowl Street Queen's Hospital/
Medical Center (TMK: 2-1-035:003)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $140.00 $75.00 $1,999.92 $240.00 $475.00 $280.00 $90.00

Total $1,680.00 $900.00 $23,999.04 $2,880.00 $5,700.00 $3,360.00 $1,080.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP III: $5,040.00 $1,620.00 $29,998.80 $9,360.00 $11,400.00 $7,620.00 $2,844.00
(Item Nos. 10 through 12):

GROUP IV

13. Ulumaika Street Circle (TMK: 3-5-30; .02 acre),
and Koae Place Circle (TMK: 3-5-70; .02 acre) NO BID
Bid Price Unit 12 months $120.00 $50.00 $20.00 $83.33 $160.00 $15.00 $300.00 $14.50 $55.00

Total $1,440.00 $600.00 $240.00 $999.96 $1,920.00 $180.00 $3,600.00 $174.00 $660.00

14. Puulani Place Circle (TMK: 3-5-27; .02 acre),
and Pahoa Avenue/Kilauea Avenue Medial Strip
(TMK: 3-2-10: .004)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $120.00 $95.00 $20.00 $83.33 $180.00 $15.00 $200.00 $17.50 $45.00

Total $1,440.00 $1,140.00 $240.00 $999.96 $2,160.00 $180.00 $2,400.00 $210.00 $540.00
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GROUP IV

15. Elepaio Street/Kilauea Avenue Medial Strip
(TMK: 3-5-32; .01 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $150.00 $75.00 $20.00 $83.33 $130.00 $15.00 $150.00 $17.50 $35.00

Total $1,800.00 $900.00 $240.00 $999.96 $1,560.00 $180.00 $1,800.00 $210.00 $420.00
16. Kolohala Street/Onaha Street Circle

(TMK: 3-5-35; .06 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $110.00 $140.00 $25.00 $166.66 $200.00 $35.00 $350.00 $14.50 $35.00

Total $1,320.00 $1,680.00 $300.00 $1,999.92 $2,400.00 $420.00 $4,200.00 $174.00 $420.00

17. Kilauea Avenue Parkway Medial Strip
(TMK: 3-5; 0.936 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $1,975.00 $1,300.00 $480.00 $2,666.55 $480.00 $733.00 $300.00 $188.00 $245.00

Total $23,700.00 $15,600.00 $5,760.00 $31,998.60 $5,760.00 $8,796.00 $3,600.00 $2,256.00 $2,940.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV: $29,700.00 $19,920.00 $6,780.00 $36,998.40 $13,800.00 $9,756.00 $15,600.00 $3,024.00 $4,980.00
(Item Nos. 13 through 17):

GROUP V

18. Keanu Street/6th Avenue Circle 
(TMK: 3-3-03; .02 acre) NO BID
Bid Price Unit 12 months $60.00 $140.00 $30.00 $83.33 $250.00 $100.00 $20.00 $44.00 $35.00

Total $720.00 $1,680.00 $360.00 $999.96 $3,000.00 $1,200.00 $240.00 $528.00 $420.00

19. Aina Koa Medial Strip (TMK: 3-5-19; , .04 acre)
and Hind Drive Medial Strip 
(TMK: 3-6-13; .08 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $110.00 $150.00 $20.00 $249.99 $420.00 $300.00 $35.00 $48.00 $55.00

Total $1,320.00 $1,800.00 $240.00 $2,999.88 $5,040.00 $3,600.00 $420.00 $576.00 $660.00

20. Halemaumau Street Medial Strip
(TMK: 3-7-5, 10: .06 acre)
Bid Price Unit 12 months $60.00 $140.00 $20.00 $249.99 $380.00 $150.00 $20.00 $48.00 $65.00

Total $720.00 $1,680.00 $240.00 $2,999.88 $4,560.00 $1,800.00 $240.00 $576.00 $780.00
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21. Koko Nani Street
Bid Price Unit 12 months $725.00 $1,500.00 $150.00 $1,999.92 $500.00 $450.00 $511.00 $300.00 $249.00

Total $8,700.00 $18,000.00 $1,800.00 $23,999.04 $6,000.00 $5,400.00 $6,132.00 $3,600.00 $2,988.00

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $11,460.00 $23,160.00 $2,640.00 $30,998.76 $18,600.00 $12,000.00 $7,032.00 $5,280.00 $4,848.00
(Item Nos. 18 through 21):

Cashier's Check $6,267.00 $2,154.00 $1,552.00 $20,550.00 ----- ----- $2,500.00 $2,148.00 $415.20 $1,050.00


