
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15013 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JANUARY 22, 2007
Reqn. No. G32988

For the furnishing of SUMMER FUN BUS ROBERT'S HAWAII TOMASA'S YAMAGUCHI BUS
SERVICES to the Department of Parks and SCHOOL BUS BUS INC. SERVICE INC.
Recreation, City and County of Honolulu, INC.
Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. AINA HAINA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 1: $4,050.00 NO BID NO BID
2. KAHALA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 2: $1,360.00 NO BID NO BID
3. KAIMUKI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 3: $2,895.00 NO BID NO BID
4. KAMILO IKI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 4: $5,510.00 NO BID NO BID
5. KANEWAI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 5: $3,225.00 NO BID NO BID
6. KAPAOLONO COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 6: $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID
7. KILAUEA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 7: $1,005.00 NO BID NO BID
8. KOKO HEAD DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 8: $7,795.00 NO BID NO BID
9. MANOA VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 9: $9,050.00 NO BID NO BID
10. MCCULLY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 10: NO BID NO BID NO BID
11. PAKI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 11: $2,990.00 NO BID NO BID
12. PALOLO VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 12: $2,055.00 NO BID NO BID
13. WILSON COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 13: $2,980.00 NO BID NO BID
14. AIEA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 14: NO BID NO BID NO BID
15. AIEA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 15: NO BID $3,310.00 NO BID
16. ALA PUUMALU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 16: $3,130.00 NO BID NO BID
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SCHOOL BUS INC. SERVICE INC.

INC.
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17. BERETANIA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 17: $3,830.00 NO BID NO BID
18. BOOTH COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 18: $1,305.00 NO BID NO BID
19. BOOTH DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 19: $6,085.00 NO BID NO BID
20. FERN COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 20: $1,630.00 NO BID NO BID
21. HALAWA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 21: NO BID NO BID NO BID
22. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 22: NO BID NO BID NO BID
23. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 23: NO BID NO BID NO BID
24. HALAWA DISTRICT PARK TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 24: NO BID NO BID NO BID
25. KALAKAUA COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 25: $1,830.00 NO BID NO BID
26. KALAKAUA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 26: $1,830.00 NO BID NO BID
27. KALIHI UKA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 27: $2,920.00 NO BID NO BID
28. KALIHI VALLEY COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 28: $2,005.00 NO BID NO BID
29. KALIHI VALLEY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 29: $1,790.00 NO BID NO BID
30. KAMEHAMEHA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 30: $960.00 NO BID NO BID
31. LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 31: $1,920.00 $1,460.00 NO BID
32. LANAKILA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 32: $490.00 $340.00 NO BID
33. MAKIKI COMPLEX TEEN PROGRAM

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 33: $710.00 NO BID NO BID
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34. MAKIKI DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 34: $3,135.00 NO BID NO BID
35. MOANALUA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 35: $4,700.00 NO BID NO BID
36. PU'UNUI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 36: NO BID $370.00 NO BID
37. PU'UNUI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 37: NO BID $720.00 NO BID
38. SALT LAKE DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 38: $3,000.00 NO BID NO BID
39. SHERIDAN COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 39: $860.00 NO BID NO BID
40. STEVENSON RECREATION CENTER

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 40: $1,560.00 NO BID NO BID
41. ASING COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 41: NO BID $2,740.00 NO BID
42. ASING COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 42: NO BID $1,110.00 NO BID
43. CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 43: NO BID $2,460.00 $3,185.00
44. CRESTVIEW COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 44: NO BID $370.00 NO BID
45. EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 45: NO BID $2,205.00 NO BID
46. EWA BEACH COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 46: NO BID $1,110.00 NO BID
47. EWA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 47: NO BID $1,510.00 NO BID
48. EWA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 48: NO BID $185.00 NO BID
49. EWA TEEN COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 49: NO BID $1,800.00 NO BID
50. HO'AE'AE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 50: $1,395.00 $1,045.00 NO BID
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51. MAILI COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 51: NO BID NO BID $2,900.00
52. MAKAHA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 52: $3,720.00 NO BID NO BID
53. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 53: $6,435.00 NO BID NO BID
54. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 54: $1,800.00 NO BID NO BID
55. MAKAKILO COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 55: $325.00 NO BID NO BID
56. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - LOWER DIVISION

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 56: $3,180.00 NO BID NO BID
57. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - UPPER DIVISION

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 57: $2,455.00 NO BID NO BID
58. MILILANI DISTRICT PARK - UPPER DIVISION

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 58: $215.00 NO BID NO BID
59. MILILANI COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 59: $900.00 NO BID NO BID
60. NANAKULI BEACH PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 60: NO BID NO BID NO BID
61. PACIFIC PALISADES COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 61: NO BID NO BID NO BID
62. PEARL CITY DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 62: NO BID $4,740.00 NO BID
63. PEARL CITY COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 63: NO BID $2,890.00 NO BID
64. PILILAAU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 64: NO BID NO BID $3,670.00
65. PROJECT HO'OMANA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 65: $285.00 NO BID $2,380.00
66. WAIANAE DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 66: NO BID NO BID $760.00
67. WAIANAE COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 67: NO BID NO BID $1,665.00
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68. WAIANAE COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 68: NO BID NO BID $1,665.00
69. WAIAU DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 69: NO BID $2,070.00 NO BID
70. WAHIAWA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 70: $5,350.00 NO BID $5,100.00
71. WAHIAWA COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 71: $1,110.00 NO BID $1,020.00
72. WAIKELE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 72: NO BID $2,910.00 NO BID
73. WAIPAHU DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 73: $1,820.00 NO BID NO BID
74. WAIPAHU COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 74: $2,740.00 NO BID NO BID
75. WHITMORE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 75: $960.00 NO BID $990.00
76. AHUIMANU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 76: NO BID NO BID NO BID
77. AIKAHI SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 77: NO BID NO BID NO BID
78. BEN PARKER SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 78: NO BID NO BID NO BID
79. BEN PARKER SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 79: NO BID NO BID NO BID
80. ENCHANTED LAKE COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 80: NO BID NO BID NO BID
81. HAUULA COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 81: NO BID NO BID NO BID
82. KAHALUU COMMUNITY PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 82: NO BID NO BID NO BID
83. KAHUKU DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 83: NO BID NO BID NO BID
84. KAILUA SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 84: NO BID NO BID NO BID
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85. KAPUNAHALA NEIGHBORHOOD PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 85: NO BID NO BID NO BID
86. LAIE SUMMER FUN

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 86: NO BID NO BID NO BID
87. SUNSET BEACH NEIGHBORHOOD PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 87: $2,490.00 NO BID $1,690.00
88. WAIALUA DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 88: $1,860.00 $1,260.00 $1,430.00
89. WAIMANALO BEACH PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 89: NO BID NO BID NO BID
90. WAIMANALO DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 90: NO BID NO BID NO BID
91. KAHALUU COMPLEX TEENS

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 91: NO BID NO BID NO BID
92. KAILUA COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 92: NO BID NO BID NO BID
93. KANEOHE COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 93: NO BID NO BID NO BID
94. WAIALUA COMPLEX

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 94: $1,720.00 $1,290.00 $1,485.00
95. WAIMANLO DISTRICT PARK

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 95: NO BID NO BID NO BID
96. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 96: $805.00 NO BID NO BID
97. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 97: $805.00 NO BID NO BID
98. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 98: $575.00 NO BID NO BID
99. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 99: $575.00 NO BID NO BID
100. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 100: $1,250.00 NO BID NO BID
101. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 101: $1,250.00 NO BID NO BID
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102. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 102: NO BID $450.00 NO BID
103. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 103: NO BID $450.00 NO BID
104. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 104: NO BID NO BID NO BID
105. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 105: NO BID NO BID NO BID
106. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 106: NO BID $660.00 NO BID
107. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 107: NO BID $680.00 NO BID
108. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 108: NO BID $660.00 NO BID
109. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 109: NO BID $680.00 NO BID
110. TO CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 110: NO BID NO BID NO BID
111. FROM CAMP KUALOA

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM NO. 111: NO BID NO BID NO BID


