
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 15007 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 27, 2006
Reqn. No. G57457 & G57458

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU FORD RAINBOW
MOTOR VEHICLES for the Department of DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. INC. CHEVROLET, INC.
Facility Maintenance, City and County of
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

ITEM
NO.
1. Three (3) Each, 8,800 Lbs. GVWR Truck

Cab and Chassis with Standard Profile
Utility Body and Telescopic Cover
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Cab Ford F-250 SID Cab & Ford F250 F20 Chevrolet CC20903 

4X2 Diesel 9000 GVW Chassis Silverado 
(DH2L62) 

Year of production model: 2007 2008 2008 2007 
Bid Price Unit 3 units $42,604.17 ----- $47,507.03 $54,275.00

Total $127,812.51 $51,238.00 $142,521.09 $162,825.00
Manuals:  (Five (5) sets): $375.00 $850.00 $350.00 $590.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 1: $128,187.51 $52,088.00 $142,871.09 $163,415.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

2. Two (2) Each, 8,800 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Cab and Chassis with Standard Profile
Utility Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram 2500 Reg Cab Ford F-250 SID Cab & Ford F250 F20 Chevrolet CC20903 

4X2 Diesel 9000 GVW Chassis Siverado 
(DH2L62) 

Year of production model: 2007 2008 2008 2007 
Bid Price Unit 2 units $42,279.98 $50,380.00 $46,388.88 $52,900.00

Total $84,559.96 $100,760.00 $92,777.76 $105,800.00
Manuals:  (Five (5) sets): $375.00 $850.00 $350.00 $590.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 2: $84,934.96 $101,610.00 $93,127.76 $106,390.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU FORD RAINBOW
DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. INC. CHEVROLET, INC.

ITEM
NO.
3. Two (2) Each, 3/4 Ton Pickup with 8 Ft.

Bed, Dump with Canvas Cover
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-250 SID 2WD Pickup Ford F250 F20 Chevrolet CC20903 

Silverado 

Year of production model: 2008 2008 2007 
Bid Price Unit 2 units NO BID $36,406.00 $35,248.13 $40,310.00

Total $72,812.00 $70,496.26 $80,620.00
Manuals:  (Five (5) sets): $850.00 $350.00 $590.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 3: $73,662.00 $70,846.26 $81,210.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

4. Four (4) Each, Sport Utility Vehicle, 6,000
Lbs. GVWR (Full Size)
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Durango SXT 4X2 Ford Explorer 2WD 4DR SUV Ford Explorer U63 Chevrolet CS15506 4X2 

SUV 6400 GVWR Trailblazer 

Year of production model: 2007 2007 2007 2007 
Bid Price Unit 4 units $23,578.00 $24,745.00 $24,507.02 $24,862.00

Total $94,312.00 $98,980.00 $98,028.08 $99,448.00
Manuals:  (One (1) set of Five): $375.00 $850.00 $350.00 $590.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 4: $94,687.00 $99,830.00 $98,378.08 $100,038.00

BID EVALUATION - Please check one:

      Applicable information available X X X
      Applicable information not available X



PROPOSAL NO. 15007
Page 3

CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU FORD RAINBOW
DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. INC. CHEVROLET, INC.

ITEM
NO. BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND

COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED.
60,000  Miles
X 2.25 = $8,437.50 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $8,437.50
X 4 units = $33,750.00 $36,000.00 $36,000.00 $33,750.00
             City EPA MPG 16 15 15 16

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $128,437.00 $135,830.00 $134,378.08 $133,788.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

5. Two (2) Each, Compact Van, Seven
Passenger
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Grand Caravan 

SE RSKL53 

Year of production model: 2007 
Bid Price Unit 2 units $22,918.32 NO BID NO BID NO BID

Total $45,836.64 5 & 6
Manuals:  (One (1) set of Five): $375.00

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 4: $46,211.64

BID EVALUATION - Please check one:

      Applicable information available X
      Applicable information not available
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU FORD RAINBOW
DODGE, INC. FORD, INC. INC. CHEVROLET, INC.

ITEM
NO. BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND

COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED.
60,000  Miles
X 2.25 = $7,105.26
X 2 units = $14,210.53
             City EPA MPG 19

Total Evaluated Bid Price: $60,422.17

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

6. One (1) Only, 12,000 Lbs. GVWR Truck
Cab and Chassis with Telescopic Boom
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 SID Cab & Chevrolet Kodiak CC4C042 

Chassis 

Year of production model: 2008 2007 
Total Sum Bid (Vehicle & Manuals): NO BID $101,532.00 $116,415.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

7. One (1) Only, 3/4 Ton Pickup Truck Cab
and Chassis, with 6-ft. Bed
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Ram Reg Cab 2500 Ford F-250 SID 2WD Ford F350 F30 Chevrolet CC20903 

4X2 140.5 WB 8' Bed Regular Cab Pickup Silverado 
DH2L62 

Year of production model: 2007 2008 2008 2007 
Total Sum Bid (Vehicle & Manuals): $33,325.64 $34,911.49 $32,475.06 $35,901.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days


