PROPOSAL NO. 14985
OPENED: DECEMBER 15, 2006

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

For the furnishing and delivery of TACTICAL

OPTICAL SIGHTS AND ACCESSORIES THUNDER BUG INC. MILLI MICRO NATIONAL SECURITY
to the Honolulu Police Department, DBA SYSTEMS INC. SECURITY EQUIPMENT
City and County of Honolulu, MAGNUM FIREARMS ASSOCIATES INC. CORPORATION
Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO. Mount, Quick Detachable; advanced combat
1. Optical gunsight; Approved Brand: LaRue
Tactical ACOG Mount, Model No. LT100.
Bid Price Unit 8 ea $150.00 $125.00 $159.00 $175.40
Total $1,200.00 $1,000.00 $1,272.00 $1,403.20

Brand Name and Number:

Description of Warranty:

2. Scope with Holographic Reticle Pattern;
Approved Brand: EOTech HOLOgraphic
Weapon Sight, Model No. 553.A65/1
SU-231/PEQ (M553).

Bid Price Unit
Total

58 ea

Brand Name and Number:

Description of Warranty:

LaRue Tactical #LT100

Lifetime guarantee means as

long as Mark LaRue is alive you
can return anything for a full refund
or exchange.

$575.00
$33,350.00

EOTech #553.A65/1

EOTech warrants every product to
be free from defects in materials
and workmanship for a period of

2 years from the date of original
purchase

LaRue-LT-100

Manufactor's Standard Warranty

$528.90
$30,676.20

EOTech #553.A65/1

Manufacturer's Standard Warranty

LaRue LT100

1 Year from Purchase

$530
$30,740.00

EOTech 553.A65/1

1 Year from Purchase

LaRue Tactical Model LT100

Life Time Warranty

$549.74
$31,884.92

EOTech Model 553.A65/1
SU-231
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3. Rear Folding Battle Sight; Approved Brand:
Troy Industries Rear Folding Battle Sight,
Model No. FVSRA4
Bid Price Unit 60 ea $150.00 $110.00 $149.50 NO BID
Total $9,000.00 $6,600.00 $8,970.00 $0.00
Brand Name and Number: Troy Industries #FBSRA4 Troy #FBSRA4 Troy Industries #FDSRA4
Description of Warranty: Factory Warranty | Manufacturer's Standard Warranty 1 Year from Purchase
4. Rifle Scope with Crosshair Reticle; dual
illuminated scope; includes mount; Approved
Brand: Trijicon, Model No. TA31DOC ACOG
4X32 BAC and Model No. TA51 Mount
Bid Price Unit 8 ea $1,150.00 $996.00 $1,434.00 NO BID
Total $9,200.00 $7,968.00 $11,472.00 $0.00
Brand Name and Number: Trijicon #TA31 DOC Trijicon #TA31 DOC Trijion TA31DOC
Description of Warranty: See attached warranty card | Manufacturer's Standard Warranty Lifetime from Manufacturer
5. Shipping, f.o0.b. to the Honolulu Police
Department in Honolulu, Hawaii (cost must
be an exact amount, not an estimate.)
Bid Price Unit 1 service NO BID $436.00 $150.00 NO BID
Total $0.00 $436.00 $150.00 $0.00
TOTAL SUM BID ITEM NOS. 1 THROUGH 5 $52,750.00 $46,680.20 $52,604.00f e




