ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR
PROPOSAL NO. 14941 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED: OCTOBER 6, 2006

Reqgn. No. G57411, G57412 & G57413

For the furnishing and delivery of Various CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
Motor Vehicles, to the Division of Road DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
Maintenance, City and County of Honolulu, INC.
Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
NO.
1. Two (2) Only, Subcompact, 4-Door Sedan
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Caliber 4 Dr. Ford Focus 4D| Chevrolet Cobalt
Sedan PMDL49 Sedan P34 4 Dr. Sdn.
LT1ALGY9
Year of production model: 2007 2007 2007
Bid Price Unit 2 units $18,165.40 NO BID $15,496.00 $16,772.00
Total $36,330.80 1-4 $30,992.00 $33,544.00
Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five) $350.00 $515.00 $590.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 1: $36,680.80 $31,507.00 $34,134.00
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
~_Applicable information available. X X X
~_Applicable information not available.
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $5,769.23 $5,555.56 $6,250.00
X 2 units = $11,538.46 $11,111.11 $12,500.00
City EPA MPG 26 27 24
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $48,219.26 $42,618.11 $46,634.00
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
2. Two (2) Only, Subcompact, 4-Door Station
Wagon
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Caliber R/T Ford Focus 4D
FWD PMDX49 Station Wgn P36
Year of production model: 2007 2007
Bid Price Unit 2 units $20,687.26 $16,641.04 NO BID
Total $41,374.52 $33,282.08
Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five) $350.00 $515.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 2: $41,724.52 $33,797.08
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):
~_Applicable information available. X X
~_Applicable information not available.
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $6,521.74 $5,555.56
X 2 units = $13,043.48 $11,111.11
City EPA MPG 23 27
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $54,768.00 $44,908.19
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
3. One (1) Only, Mid-Size, 4-Door Sedan

Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES

BID EVALUATION - Please check one (1):

~_Applicable information available.
__Applicable information not available.

60,000 Miles x $2.50 =
City EPA MPG

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Chrysler Sebring
4 Dr. JSCH41

2007
$22,082.15

$7,142.86
21

$29,225.01

Ford Fusion 4D
Sedan P07

2007
$23,673.16

$7,500.00
20

$31,173.16

Chevrolet Malibu
4 Dr. Sdn. LS
1ZS69

2007
$21,330.00

X

$6,818.18
22

$28,148.18
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
4. Five (5) Only, Sport Utility Vehicle, 4-Door,
4-Wheel Drive
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Durango Ford Explorer U73 Chevrolet
SXT 4 Dr. 4x4 4 Door 4x4 | Trailblazer 4WD LS
HB5M74
Year of production model: 2007 2007 2007
Bid Price Unit 5 units $25,967.28 $30,188.76 $29,800.00
Total $129,836.40 $150,943.80 $149,000.00
Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five) $350.00 $515.00 $590.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 4: $130,186.40 $151,458.80 $149,590.00
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE
APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLES
60,000 Miles x $2.50 = $10,714.29 $10,714.29 $10,000.00
X 5 units = $53,571.43 $53,571.43 $50,000.00
City EPA MPG 14 14 15
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $183,757.83 $205,030.23 $199,590.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
5. Three (3) Only, 11,400 GVWR Truck Cab
and Chassis with Flatbed Body, Service
Body, Open Canopy and Hydraulic Liftgate
Maufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-350 Reg Ford F350 F36
Cab & Chassis
Year of production model: 2007 2007
Bid Price Unit 3 units NO BID $51,059.51 $53,832.94 NO BID
Total 5-9 $153,178.53 $161,498.82 5-9
Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five) $885.40 $515.00
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 5: $154,063.93 $162,013.82
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

Four (4) Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door,
Crew Cab and Chassis with Fiberglass
Service Body and Pipe Rack
Maufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price Unit 4 units
Total

Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five)

Total Sum Bid for Item No. 6:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

Ford F-450 Crew
Cab & Chassis

2007
$63,921.00
$255,684.00
$885.40

$256,569.40

Ford F450 W46

2008
$61,429.10
$245,716.40
$515.00

$246,231.40
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
7. One (1) Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door,

Crew Cab and Chassis with Fiberglass
Service Body, Pipe Rack and Hydraulic
Liftgate

Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
One (1) Only, 15,00 Lb. GVWR 4-Door,
Crew Cab and Chassis with Fiberglass

Service Body and Canopy
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

Ford F-450 Crew
Cab & Chassis

2007
$70,571.88

Ford F-450 Crew
Cab & Chassis

2007
$71,101.04

Ford F450 W46

2008
$69,222.86

Ford F450 W46

2008
$71,768.78
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CUTTER CUTTER FORD HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
INC.
ITEM
NO.
9. Two (2) Only, 15,000 Lb. GVWR 4-Door,
Crew Cab and Chassis with Service/Dump
Body, Hoist
Maufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 Crew
Cab & Chassis
Year of production model: 2007
Bid Price Unit 2 units $66,333.37 NO BID
Total $132,666.74
Manuals: (One (1) Set of Five) $885.40
Total Sum Bid for Item No. 9: $133,552.14

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days




