FOR

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET AND FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

PROPOSAL NO. 14906
OPENED: AUGUST 15, 2006

For the furnishing and delivery of REMOTE GP ROADWAY PACIFIC SALES SAFETY SYSTEMS SECURITY
ELECTRONIC SIREN WARNING SYSTEM SOLUTIONS REPRESENTATIVE EQUIPMENT
to the Honolulu Police Department INC.
City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii
ITEM
Group I. SIREN MODULES AND SPEAKERS
1. Siren Modules, Whelen WE-610 HPD or equal
Bid Price: Unit 400 each $515.00 $745.46 No Bid $344.15
Total $206,000.00 $298,184.00 $0.00 $137,660.00
Brand Name and Number:
Whelen Whelen Whelen
#WS-610 HPD #WS-610 HPD #WS-610 HPD
2. Siren Speakers, Whelen SA-365V or equal,
complete with mounting bracket
Bid Price: Unit 150 each $264.00 $273.79 No Bid $175.10
Total $39,600.00 $41,068.50 $0.00 $26,265.00
Brand Name and Number:
Whelen Whelen Whelen
SA-365 V SA-365 V SA-365V
3. Siren Speakers, Whelen SA-340TS, or equal
complete with mounting bracket
Bid Price: Unit 100 each $237.00 $247.09 No Bid $156.98
Total $23,700.00 $24,709.00 $0.00 $15,698.00




Brand Name and Number:

Federal Dynamax
#MS-100-1

Federal Dynamax
#MS-100-1

Federal Signal
MS-100-1
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INC.
Brand Name and Number:
Whelen Whelen Whelen
SA-340 TS SA-340 TS SA-340 TS
Siren Speakers, Whelen SA314P, or equal
with choice of mounting bracket
Bid Price: Unit 50 each $222.00 $224.43 No Bid $147.31
Total $11,100.00 $11,221.50 $0.00 $7,365.50
Brand Name and Number:
Whalen Whalen Whalen
SA-314 P SA-314 P SA-314 P
Total Sum Bid Group | for Items 1,2,3, and 4 $280,400.00 $375,183.00 $0.00 $186,988.50
Group Il. SIREN SPEAKERS, NO SUBSTITUTES
Pursuant to Chapter 3-122, HAR
No alternate brands will be considered for award
in this group. Award will be by item.
Siren Speakers, Federal Dynamax MS100-1,
compact speaker with standard bail bracket
mounting kit, black
Bid Price: Unit 100 each $260.00 $299.00 $175.00 $155.35
"Total $26,000.00 $29,900.00 $17,500.00 $15,535.00

Federal Signal
Dynamax MS-100-1




