
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

PROPOSAL NO. 14900 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  JULY 31, 2006

For the furnishing of ASPHALTIC
CONCRETE AND EMULSIFIED ASPHALT GRACE
for the twelve-month period beginning PACIFIC
August 1, 2006 and ending July 31, 2007 to CORPORATION
the City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu,
Hawaii

GROUP I MAKAKILO 
PLANT LOCATION:

DRIVEWAY MIX: $89.50
RESURFACING MIX: $87.50
ASPHALT TREATED BASE: $80.00
SC-4 COLD MIX: $97.50
WEARING COURSE C&C MIX #3: $86.50

PLANT LOCATION: KAPAA 

DRIVEWAY MIX: $89.50
RESURFACING MIX: $87.50
ASPHALT TREATED BASE: $80.00
SC-4 COLD MIX: 97.5
WEARING COURSE C&C MIX #3: $85.50

PLANT LOCATION: HALAWA 

DRIVEWAY MIX: $89.85
RESURFACING MIX: $87.50
ASPHALT TREATED BASE: NO BID
SC-4 COLD MIX: $97.50
WEARING COURSE C&C MIX #3: NO BID

PLANT LOCATION:

DRIVEWAY MIX:
RESURFACING MIX:
ASPHALT TREATED BASE:
SC-4 COLD MIX:
WEARING COURSE C&C MIX #3:
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GROUP II
PLACE OF DELIVERY
At the Batching Plant -
Plant Location: MAKAKILO

Quick Setting Grade RS-1: NO BID
Slow Setting Grade SS-1: $5.20

Plant Location: KAPAA

Quick Setting Grade RS-1: NO BID
Slow Setting Grade SS-1: NO BID

Plant Location: HALAWA

Quick Setting Grade RS-1: NO BID
Slow Setting Grade SS-1: $5.95

Plant Location:

Quick Setting Grade RS-1:
Slow Setting Grade SS-1:

GROUP III
Place of Delivery
Kalihi Yard
Bid Price Unit 1,500 tons $97.50

Total $146,250.00
Manana Yard
Bid Price Unit 400 tons $97.50

Total $39,000.00
Wahiawa Yard
Bid Price Unit 150 tons $97.50

Total $14,625.00
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Heeia Yard
Bid Price Unit 350 tons $97.50

Total $34,125.00
Waianae Yard
Bid Price Unit 200 tons $97.50

Total $19,500.00

TOTAL SUM BID GROUP III: $253,500.00


