RFB-HPD-0700242
OPENED: JANUARY 16, 2008

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ITEM

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
POLICE EQUIPMENT, ACCESSORIES
AND FINGERPRINT SUPPLIES to the
Honolulu Police Department, City and
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii for
the twelve month period beginning March 1,
2008 and ending February 28, 2009

NO. GROUP |

1.

Holsters; for the right hand

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

300 each

Holster; for the left hand

Bid Price Unit
Total

Brand Name and Number:

100 each

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP I

GROUP I

Sam Browne Waist Belts; with nickel
chrome buckle
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:

300 each

Sam Browne Waist Belts; with polished
brass buckle
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:

50 each

L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
NO BID $126.82 $109.40
1-18 $38,046.00 $32,820.00
Safariland Model Safariland

#070-418-161

$126.82
$12,682.00
Safariland Model
#070-418-162

$50,728.00

$25.55

$7,665.00

Aker Model
B03-HPD-BP Belt
with Nickel Chrome
Buckle

$25.55
$1,277.50

Aker Model
B03-HPD-BP Belt
with Brass Buckle

#070-418-161

$109.40
$10,940.00
Safariland
#070-418-162

$43,760.00

$31.00
$9,300.00

Tex Shoemaker
201

$31.00
$1,550.00

Tex Shoemaker
201
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
5. Sally Brown Waist Belts; with nickel chrome
buckle
Bid Price Unit 100 each $34.00 $33.00
Total $3,400.00 $3,300.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model Tex Shoemaker

6. Sally Brown Waist Belts; with polished
brass buckle

Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP II:
GROUP 1l
A. Police Caps For Male Officers
Standard Type
7. All sizes
Bid Price Unit
Total
Brand Name and Number:
With One Row of Gold Braid
8. All sizes
Bid Price Unit

Total
Brand Name and Number:

50 each

500 each

20 each

B03-W-HPD-BP
Belt with Nickel
Chrome Buckle

$34.00
$1,700.00

Aker Model
B03-W-HPD-BP
Belt with Brass
Buckle
$14,042.50

NO BID
7-15

201LC-Fully Lined
as specified

$33.00

$1,650.00

Tex Shoemaker
201LC-Fully Lined
as specified

$15,800.00

NO BID
7-15
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
With Two Rows of Gold Braid
9. Allsizes
Bid Price Unit 20 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
Police Cap Bands
10. Chrome band
Bid Price Unit 300 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
11. Gold band
Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
12. Police Cap Covers
Bid Price Unit 500 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
B. Police Caps for Female Officers
Standard Type
13. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 100 each

Total
Brand Name and Number:
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
With One Row of Gold Braid
14. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
With Two Rows of Gold Braid
15. All sizes
Bid Price Unit 10 each
Total
Brand Name and Number:
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROURP lII:
GROUP IV
16. Baton
Bid Price Unit 300 each $63.49 $62.00
Total $19,047.00 $18,600.00
Brand Name and Number: Armament Systems/| ASP F26E #52613
Procedures Model
F26E (52613)
17. Case Holder
Bid Price Unit 500 each $25.59 $25.00
Total $12,795.00 $12,500.00

Brand Name and Number:

Armament Systems/
Procedures Model
2632

ASP 2632 #52632
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
18. Retaining Cap
Bid Price Unit 20 each $1.98 $9.00
Total $39.60 $180.00
Brand Name and Number: Armament Systems/ ASP #80725
Procedures Model
9006E
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IV $31,881.60 $31,280.00
GROUP V
19. Flashlight Kit
Bid Price Unit 500 each $76.22 $75.39 $85.00
Total $38,110.00 $37,695.00 $42,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight #76475 Streamlight | Streamlight #76475

Model #76475

20. Flashlight Battery

Bid Price Unit 500 each $11.30 $11.40 $12.50
Total $5,650.00 $5,700.00 $6,250.00
Brand Name and Number: Streamlight #75175 Streamlight | Streamlight #75175

Model #75175

21. Flashlight Bulb

Bid Price Unit 50 each $4.00 $4.20 $4.50

Total $200.00 $210.00 $225.00

Brand Name and Number: Streamlight #75914 Streamlight | Streamlight #75914
#75914

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP V: $43,960.00 $43,605.00 $48,975.00
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO. GROUP VI
22. Regular size handcuff pouches, nickel type
Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID $16.49 $17.00
Total 22 -43 $8,245.00 $8,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model 500-BP; [Tex Shoemaker 204
nickel Type
23. Regular size handcuff pouches, brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $16.49 $17.00
Total $1,649.00 $1,700.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model 500-BP; [Tex Shoemaker 204
Brass Type
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VI: $9,894.00 $10,200.00
GROUP VII
24. Nickel/chrome type shap
Bid Price Unit 500 each $19.00 $26.00
Total $9,500.00 $13,000.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model A510- Aker A510-BP-2
BP-2, Nickel/ Nickel/Chrome
Chrome
25. Brass type snap
Bid Price Unit 100 each $19.00 $26.00
Total $1,900.00 $2,600.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model A510- Aker A510-BP-2
BP-2, Brass Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VII: $11,400.00 $15,600.00
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO. GROUP VIII
26. Nickel type
Bid Price Unit 500 each $15.00 $21.00
Total $7,500.00 $10,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model | Aker A556X7-BP-
A556X7-BP-Nickel Nickel
27. Brass type
Bid Price Unit 100 each $15.00 $21.00
Total $1,500.00 $2,100.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model | Aker A556X7-BP-
AS56RT-BP-Brass Brass
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP VIil: $9,000.00 $12,600.00
GROUP IX
28. Pocket Mask with One-Way Valve
Bid Price Unit 100 each NO BID NO BID
Total 28 & 29 28 - 37
Brand Name and Number:
29. One-Way Valves
Bid Price Unit 100 each
Total

Brand Name and Number:

TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP IX:




RFB-HPD-0700242

Page 8
L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO. GROUP X
30. Magnetic Finger Print Powder
Bid Price Unit 20 each $21.30
Total $426.00
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie FingerPrint
Laboratories Model
BPMSB9
31. Magnetic Wand Applicator
Bid Price Unit 100 each $20.68
Total $2,068.00
Brand Name and Number: Armor Forensics
Model 1-0150
32. Fingerprint Powder
Bid Price Unit 200 each $11.55
Total $2,310.00
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie FingerPrint
Laboratories Model
BPP098
33. Fingerprint Brush
Bid Price Unit 500 each NO BID
Total
Brand Name and Number:
34. Fingerprint Lifting Tape
Bid Price Unit 500 each $3.50
Total $1,750.00

Brand Name and Number:

Sirchie FingerPrint
Lab. Model 144L




RFB-HPD-0700242

Page 9
L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
35. Fingerprint Ink
Bid Price Unit 50 each $3.93
Total $196.50
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie FingerPrint
Lab. Model 230T
36. Fingerprint Ink Roller
Bid Price Unit 20 each $10.04
Total $200.80
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie FingerPrint
Lab. Model
FPT262B
37. Fingerprint Reprint Labels
Bid Price Unit 20 boxes $13.39
Total $267.80
Brand Name and Number: Sirchie FingerPrint
Lab. Model
FPT108R
TOTAL SUM BID FOR GROUP X: $7,219.10
GROUP Xi
38. Gloves
Bid Price Unit 1,000 pairs $2.55 $2.52
Total $2,550.00 $2,520.00
Brand Name and Number: Hatch Hatch WG1000
Model WG1000
39. Measuring Wheels
Bid Price Unit 300 each $40.00 NO BID
Total $12,000.00

Brand Name and Number:

CST Berger/
Rolatape Model
MM12
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L.N. CURTIS SECURITY THUNDER BUG
& EQUIPMENT INC. dba
SONS CORP. MAGNUM
FIREARMS
ITEM
NO.
40. Handcuffs
Bid Price Unit 100 each $20.35 $20.00
Total $2,035.00 $2,000.00
Brand Name and Number: Peerless Peerless M700
Model 700
41. Magazines
Bid Price Unit 100 each $26.72 NO BID
Total $2,672.00
Brand Name and Number: Smith & Wesson
Model #193500000
15 rounds
42. Pouch for Guardian 1 oz. Fog SCT0O0C
Pepper Spray
Bid Price Unit 500 each $17.00 $23.00
Total $8,500.00 $11,500.00
Brand Name and Number: Aker Model Aker
A575A-BP-V
43. Fingerprint Kit Box with Custom Decal
Bid Price Unit 300 each $18.40 $16.35
Total $5,520.00 $4,905.00
Brand Name and Number: Pelican Model 1060 Pelican 1060

#1060-205-110-02

Micro case, solid
black, Custom Decal
#106-360-001

non-returnable.

NOTE: Price above is based on 300 piece
order taken in one shipment, £ 10%.
Custom Orders are non-cancelable and




