

**ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL**

FOR

**DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING**

RFB-DPR-0700213

OPENED: ~~DECEMBER 21, 2007~~ DECEMBER 26, 2007

| <p>For the furnishing and delivery of Various Motor Vehicles to the Department of Parks and Recreation, City and County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii</p>  | <p>CUTTER FORD, INC.</p>  | <p>HONOLULU FORD INC.</p>  | <p>HT&amp;T HAWAII LLC dba HT&amp;T TRUCK CENTER</p> |  |  |  |  |
|--|---|--|--|--|--|--|--|
| <p>ITEM NO.<br/>1. One (1) only, 8,600 Lbs. GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis with 8 Ft. Pickup Body, Tool Box and Electric Hydraulic Tailgate<br/>Manufacturer's make and model no.:</p> <p>Year of production model:<br/>Bid Price<br/>Manuals (one set):</p> <p>Total Sum Bid for Item 1:</p> <p>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days</p> | <p>Ford F20</p> <p>2008<br/>\$25,851.53<br/>\$408.38</p> <p>\$26,259.91</p> | <p>Ford F250 F20</p> <p>2008<br/>\$27,633.67<br/>\$365.75</p> <p>\$27,999.42</p> | <p>NO BID<br/>1 - 4</p>                              |  |  |  |  |
| <p>2. One (1) only, 8,600 Lbs GVWR Truck Cab and Chassis with Tool Box and Hydraulic Lift Gate<br/>Manufacturer's make and model no.:</p> <p>Year of production model:<br/>Bid Price<br/>Manuals (one set):</p> <p>Total Sum Bid for Item 2:</p> <p>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days</p>  | <p>Ford F20</p> <p>2008<br/>\$26,814.82<br/>\$408.38</p> <p>\$27,223.20</p> | <p>Ford F250 F20</p> <p>2008<br/>\$28,107.05<br/>\$365.75</p> <p>\$28,472.80</p> |  |  |  |  |  |

| ITEM NO.  | CUTTER FORD, INC.  | HONOLULU FORD INC.   | HT&T HAWAII LLC dba HT&T TRUCK CENTER |  |  |  |  |
|---|--|--|---------------------------------------|--|--|--|--|
| 3. One (1) only, 9,000 GVW Truck Cab and Chassis with 8 Ft. Pickup Bed and Hydraulic Tailgate<br>Manufacturer's make and model no.:<br><br>Year of production model:<br>Bid Price<br>Manuals (one set):<br><br>Total Sum Bid for Item 3:<br><br>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days         | Ford W20<br><br>2008<br>\$30,749.13<br>\$408.38<br><br>\$31,157.51 | Ford F250 Crew Cab W20<br><br>2008<br>\$31,389.40<br>\$365.75<br><br>\$31,755.15 |                                       |  |  |  |  |
| 4. One (1) only, 12,500 GVWR, DRW Truck with Stake Bed Body, Tilt Bed and Electric Hydraulic Tailgate<br>Manufacturer's make and model no.:<br><br>Year of production model:<br>Bid Price<br>Manuals (one set):<br><br>Total Sum Bid for Item 4:<br><br>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days | Ford F36<br><br>2008<br>\$41,811.93<br>\$408.38<br><br>\$42,220.31 | Ford F350 F36<br><br>2008<br>\$45,474.38<br>\$365.75<br><br>\$45,840.13          |                                       |  |  |  |  |

| ITEM NO.   | CUTTER FORD, INC.  | HONOLULU FORD INC. | HT&T HAWAII LLC dba HT&T TRUCK CENTER                               |  |  |  |  |
|--|--|--------------------|---|--|--|--|--|
| 5. One (1) only, 19,500 GVW Flatbed Truck Cab and Chassis, with Toolbox and Hydraulic Liftgate<br>Manufacturer's make and model no.:<br><br>Year of production model:<br>Bid Price<br>Manuals (one set):<br><br>Total Sum Bid for Item 5:<br><br>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days | Ford F56<br><br>2008<br>\$48,036.27<br>\$424.08<br><br>\$48,460.35 | NO BID<br>5 & 6    | GMC C5500<br><br>2008<br>\$68,433.61<br>\$763.14<br><br>\$69,196.75 |  |  |  |  |
| 6. One (1) only, Subcompact Pickup Truck<br>Manufacturer's make and model no.:<br><br>Year of production model:<br>Bid Price<br>Manuals (one set):<br><br>Total Sum Bid for Item 6:<br><br>Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days   | Ford R10<br><br>2008<br>\$16,478.98<br>\$340.31<br><br>\$16,819.29 | NO BID             | NO BID  |  |  |  |  |
| BID EVALUATION - Please check one:<br><input checked="" type="checkbox"/> Applicable information available<br><input type="checkbox"/> Applicable information not available  | X  |                    |   |  |  |  |  |

|   | CUTTER<br>FORD, INC.   | HONOLULU<br>FORD INC. | HT&T HAWAII<br>LLC dba HT&T<br>TRUCK CENTER |  |  |  |  |
|---|--|-----------------------|---|--|--|--|--|
| <p>BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED</p> <p><u>60,000</u> Miles X \$3.00 =<br/> <u>          </u> City MPA MPG</p> <p>Total Evaluated Bid Price:</p> | <p>\$12,000.00</p> <p>15</p> <p>\$12,000.00</p> <p>\$28,819.29</p> |                       |   |  |  |  |  |