
ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL
FOR

RFB-DFM-0700210 DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING
OPENED:  DECEMBER 21, 2007

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS CUMMINS WEST CUTTER HT&T HAWAII PACIFIC POWER
HEAVY VEHICLES to the Department of INC. dba FORD, INC. LLC dba HT&T PRODUCTS dba
Facility Maintenance, City and County of INTERNATIONAL TRUCK CENTER PACIFIC TRUCK
Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii TRUCKS OF CENTER

ITEM HAWAII
NO.
1. Six (6) each, 15,000 Lbs. GVWR Truck Cab

and Chassis with Steel Service Body, Body
Mounted Crane and Bed Mounted Welder/
Generator; 2WD; DRW
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F-450 Cab & 

Chassis 

Year of production model: 2008 
Bid Price Unit 6 units NO BID $65,622.00 NO BID NO BID

Total $393,732.00
Manuals, One (1) set: $300.00

Total Sum Bid: $394,032.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days

2. Five (5) each, 74,000 GVW Truck Cab and
Chassis with 13.5 Cubic Yard Capacity
Steel Dump Body
Manufacturer's make and model no.: International 5900i Peterbilt Sterling LT9500 

SBA Model 365 SBFA 

Year of production model: 2008 2008 2008 or 2009 
Bid Price Unit 5 units $156,150.70 NO BID $157,987.28 $158,983.00

Total $780,753.50 2 & 3 $789,936.40 $794,915.00
Manuals, One (1) set: $1,000.00 $672.15 INCLUDED 

Total Sum Bid: $781,753.50 $790,608.55 $794,915.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days
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CUMMINS WEST CUTTER HT&T HAWAII PACIFIC POWER
INC. dba FORD, INC. LLC dba HT&T PRODUCTS dba

INTERNATIONAL TRUCK CENTER PACIFIC TRUCK
TRUCKS OF CENTER

ITEM HAWAII
NO.
3. Three (3) each, 32,000 GVW Truck Cab

and Chassis with 4 Cubic Yard Capacity
Aluminum Dump Body and 3.5 Ton Tele-
scopic Hydraulic Crane
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Peterbilt Freightliner M2106 

Model 335 

Year of production model: 2008 2008 or 2009 
Bid Price Unit 3 units NO BID $122,562.25 $160,204.00

Total $367,686.75 $480,612.00
Manuals, One (1) set: $672.15 INCLUDED 

Total Sum Bid: $368,358.90 $480,612.00

Delivery in Calendar Days: 210 Days


