
BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700207
PROPOSAL FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES 

  TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES,  REFUSE DIVISION
CITY AND COUNTY OF HONOLULU

OPENED 12/18/07
BY ALVIN WASHIASHI

ITEM 1
CUTTER FORD, INC HONOLULU FORD INC RAINBOW CHEVROLET CUTTER DODGE, CHYRSLER

PLYMOUTH, JEEP OF PEARL CITY, INC
DESCRIPTION 2008 FORD F250 2008 FORD F250 NO BID

2008 DODGE RAM 2500
UNIT PRICE $38,365.00 $35,830.07 $38,024.07
NO. OF UNITS 4 4 4
TOTAL SUM BID $153,460.00 $143,320.28  NO BID $152,096.28

ITEM 2
DESCRIPTION 2008 FORD F150 2008 CHEVY SILVARADO NO BID

UNIT PRICE $24,168.00 $25,063.59 $26,630.00
NO. OF UNITS 2 2 2
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM 2 $48,336.00 $50,127.18 $53,260.00 $0.00

TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE
NO. OF UNITS 2 2 2
MILES 60,000 60,000 60,000
CITY EPA 14 13 14
MPG $2.25 $2.25 $2.25
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE $19,285.71 $20,769.23 $19,285.71 NO BID

TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE  ITEM 2 $67,621.71 $70,896.41 $72,545.71 NO BID
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