RFB-DFM-0700204
OPENED: DECEMBER 14, 2007

DEPARTMENT OF BUDGET & FISCAL SERVICES - DIVISION OF PURCHASING

ABSTRACT OF PROPOSAL

FOR

ITEM
NO.

For the furnishing and delivery of VARIOUS
PICK-UP TRUCKS TO THE DEPARTMENT]
OF FACILITY MAINTENANCE, City and
County of Honolulu, Honolulu, Hawaii

Two (2) only, 9,200 Lbs. GVWR Truck,
Extended Cab and Chassis with 80" Pickup
Body, 1500 Ib capacity liftgate, 2WD SRW
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price Unit 2 units
Total

Manuals (one set):

Total sum bid for Item 1:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

One (1) only, 8,800 Lbs. GVWR Truck, 4-
Door, 6-Man Crew Cab and Chassis with
80" Pickup Body and crossbed Toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:
Bid Price
Manuals (one set):

Total sum bid for Item 2:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE FORD INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
Ford F250 4X2 Ford F250 SC
Super Cab (X20) X20
2008 2008
NO BID $36,582.34 $35,938.83 NO BID
$73,164.68 $71,877.66
$785.34 $350.00
$73,950.02 $72,227.66

Dodge Ram Quad
Cab 2500 4X2
Pickup (DH2L41)
2008

$30,356.01
$450.00

$30,806.01

Ford F250 4X2
Crew Cab (W20)

2008
$30,227.95
$785.34

$31,013.29

Ford F250 Crew
Cab W20

2008
$30,547.20
$350.00

$30,897.20

Chevrolet Silverado
CC20743

Crew Cab

2008

$30,918.00
$593.75

$31,511.75
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE FORD INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
ITEM
NO.
3. One (1) Only, 6,100 GVWR Truck Cab and
Chassis with 78" pickup body, 4WD,
hydraulic liftgate and crossbed toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Ford F150 4X4 RC Ford F150 4WD |Chevrolet Silverado
(F14) F14 CK10703 4X4
Year of production model: 2008 2008 2008
Bid Price NO BID $27,792.97 $28,801.63 $34,856.00
Manuals (one set): $785.34 $350.00 $593.75
Total sum bid for Item 3: $28,578.31 $29,151.63 $35,449.75
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
BID EVALUATION - Please check one:
~_Applicable information available X X X
~_Applicable information not available
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATHE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED
60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $13,846.15 $13,846.15 $12,857.14
City EPA MPG 13 13 14
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $42,424.46 $42,997.78 $48,306.89
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE FORD INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
ITEM
NO.
4. Three (3) each, 6,100 GVWR Truck Cab

and Chassis with 78" pickup body and
crossbed toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price Unit 3 units
Total

Manuals (one set):

Total sum bid for Item 4:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

BID EVALUATION - Please check one:
__Applicable information available
~_Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE

MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED

60,000 Miles X $3.00 =
City EPA MPG
X 3=

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Dodge Ram 1500
Reg Cab 4X2
(DR1L61)

2008

$25,507.84
$76,523.52
$450.00

$76,973.52

$13,846.15
13
$41,538.45

$118,511.97

Ford F150 4X4 RC
(F14)

2008
$25,776.22
$77,328.66

$785.34

$78,114.00

$13,846.15
13
$41,538.45

$119,652.45

Ford F150 F12

2008
$21,473.05
$64,419.15

$350.00

$64,769.15

$13,846.15
13
$41,538.45

$106,307.60

Chevrolet Silverado
CC10703 4X2

2008
$23,880.00
$71,640.00

$593.75

$72,233.75
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE FORD INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
ITEM
NO.
5. Five (5) each, 4,900 GVWR Truck with
Extended Cab and Chassis, 6 ft. pickup
body, and crossbed toolbox
Manufacturer's make and model no.: Dodge Dakota Ext| Ford Ranger 4X2
Cab 4X2 (ND1L33)| Super Cab (R14)
Year of production model: 2008 2008
Bid Price Unit 5 units $23,007.32 $20,953.19
Total $115,036.60 $104,765.95 NO BID NO BID
Manuals (one set): $450.00 $785.34
Total sum bid for Item 5: $115,486.60 $105,551.29
Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days
BID EVALUATION - Please check one:
~_Applicable information available X X
~_Applicable information not available
BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE
MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATHE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED
60,000 Miles X $3.00 = $12,000.00 $12,857.14
City EPA MPG 15 14
X5= $60,000.00 $64,285.70
Total Evaluated Bid Price: $175,486.60 $169,836.99
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CUTTER CUTTER HONOLULU RAINBOW
DODGE FORD INC. FORD INC. CHEVROLET
ITEM
NO.
6. Two (2) each, 6,100 GVWR Truck Cab and

Chassis with 78" pickup body, crossbed
toolbox, 4WD
Manufacturer's make and model no.:

Year of production model:

Bid Price Unit 2 units
Total

Manuals (one set):

Total sum bid for Item 6:

Delivery in Calendar Days: 180 Days

BID EVALUATION - Please check one:
__Applicable information available
~_Applicable information not available

BIDDER TO INSERT INFORMATION AND
COMPUTE EPA TOTAL GASOLINE

MILEAGE COST FOR THE APPROXIMATE
LIFE OF THE VEHICLE BEING OFFERED

60,000 Miles X $3.00 =
City EPA MPG
X2 =

Total Evaluated Bid Price:

Dodge Ram 1500

Reg Cab 4X4
(DR6L61)
2008
$28,313.08
$56,626.16
$450.00

$57,076.16

$13,846.15
13
$27,692.30

$84,768.46

Ford F150 4X4 RC
(F14)

2008
$26,347.95
$52,695.90

$785.34

$53,481.24

$13,846.15
13
$27,692.30

$81,173.54

Ford F150 F14
4WD

2008
$25,457.63
$50,915.26

$350.00

$51,265.26

$13,846.15
13
$27,692.30

$78,957.56

Chevrolet Silverado
CK10703 4X4

2008
$31,715.00
$63,430.00

$593.75

$64,023.75

$12,857.14
14
$25,714.28

$89,738.03




