
BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700164 
PROPOSAL FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF TWO (2) EACH 9,500 LBS. GVWR CARGO VANS AND ONE (1) EACH COMPACT CARGO TYPE 

  VAN WITH FULL WINDOWS TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES,  DIVISION OF TREATMENT AND DISPOSAL AND
DIVISION OF ENVIRONMENTAL QUALITY LABORATORY BRANCH, CITY AND COUNTY

OPENED 12/7/07
BY ALVIN WASHIASHI

ITEM 1

CUTTER DODGE CUTTER FORD, INC.* RAIBOW CHEVROLET HONOLULU FORD, INC
DESCRIPTION                2008                           

FORD E350 CARGO VAN
2008                       CHEVY 

EXPRESS VAN
 2008 FORD ECONOLINE 

CARGO VAN E34
UNIT PRICE NO BID $28,169.62 $27,917.00 $25,893.01
NO. OF UNITS 2 2 2
TOTAL SUM BID NO BID $56,339.24 $55,834.00 $51,786.02

ITEM 2
DESCRIPTION 2008 DODGE GRAND 

CARAVAN SE
2008 FORD E150 CARGO 

VAN (E14)*
2008 CHEVY UPLANDER 
CU12216

NO BID

UNIT PRICE $28,178.00 $22,183.24 $22,720.00
NO. OF UNITS 1 1 $1.00
TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM 2 $28,178.00 $22,183.24 $22,720.00 NO BID

MILES 60,000 60,000 60,000
CITY EPA 17 No listing 16
MPG $2.25 $2.25 $2.25
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE $7,941.18 $0.00 $8,437.50 NO BID

TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE  ITEM 2 $36,119.18 $22,183.24 $31,157.50 NO BID

* Offer for Item 2 was not accepted since it failed to meet the specifications listed in the Bid Proposal
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