DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE
QTy
TOTAL SUM BID

1B-CAB OVER _.>O_umm m>ox
<<_.ﬂI DIRECTIONAL m>m

WORK/AREA FLOODLIGHTS |

TOTAL SUM BID FOR ITEM 1

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE
Qry
TOTAL SUM BID

TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST
MILES
CITY EPAMPG
GASOLINE PRICE PER GAL
oTY
TOTAL GASOLINE MILEAGE COST

TOTAL EVALUATED BID PRICE

DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE
QTY
TOTAL SUM BID

_umOvOmb,_. FOR THE FURNISHING AN
COLLECTION 8Y!

BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700103 *

ITEM 1
CUTTER CUTTER
DODGE ‘ FORD, INC
NO BID 2008 FORD F450 CREW
CAB & CHASSIS
NO BID $67,219.37
2
o ) $134,438.74
] $8,189.42
3,187.48
NO BID  $145,815.64
ITEM 2
CUTTER CUTTER
) DODGE - FORD, INC
DODGE DURANGO SXT 4X2  FORD EXPLORER
2008 2008
) | $24,642.92 $24,249.20
) 2 2
~ $49,285.84 $48,498.40
60,000 60,000
14 14
$2.25 $2.25
] ‘ 2 2
$19,285.71 $19,285.71
$68,571.55 $67,784.11
ITEM 3
CUTTER CUTTER
DODGE FORD, INC
DODGE RAM 3500 REG CAB FORD F350 2008
ST 4X2 2008
$46,628.25 $50,001.00
2 2
$93,256.50 $100,002.00

*Bids are currently being evaluated to determine if bid requirements have been met.

D DELIVERY OF VARIOUS VEHICLES TO Umv>m._._<_mz._. OF E
STEM .<_>_2._‘mz>20m DIVISION, CITY & OOCZ._.< OF IOZO_.C_.c

HONOLULU
FORD, INC.
FORD F450 W46
2008
$67,326.17
2
$134,652.34

$7,461.30
$2,257.20
$144,370.84
HONOLULU
_uomo INC.

FORD EXPLORER
12008

$24,830.63

2

$49,661.26

60,000

14
$2.25

2

$19,285.71

$68,946.97

HONOLULU
FORD, INC.
NO BID

NO BID

NVIRONMENTAL SERVICES

JACKSON
AUTO GROUP*
NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

JACKSON
AUTO GROUP*
ISUZU ASCENDER
2008
$26,486.27
$52,972.54

60,000
16

$2.25

2
$16,875.00

$69,847.54
JACKSON

AUTO GROUP*
NO BID

NO BID




BID ABSTRACT FOR RFB-0700104 *

PROPOSAL FOR THE FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF 60,600 LB. GVWR TRUCK CAB CHASSIS W/13.5 CU. TD. DUMP BODY
TO DEPARTMENT OF ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, OO_nrmO._._n_uz SYSTEM _<_>_Z._.mz>ziom DIVISION, CITY & OOCWZ._.< OF HONOLULU
! y
PACIFIC TRUCK HT&T
CENTER TRUCK CENTER
STERLING LTG9500 PETERBILT MODEL. 365

DESCRIPTION
UNIT PRICE $155,370.00 $140,244.95
TOTAL SUMBID $155,370.00 $140,244.95

*Bids are currently being evaluated to determine if bid requirements have been met.




